BID TABULATION

= Department award recommendation only

Dump Truck, Tractor & Trailer
Grant County Northend Truck Equipment Kenworth Sales Co. Freedom Freightliner Central Machinery Sales, Inc. Mid Mountain Machinery Mid Mountain Machinery Mid Mountain Machinery Rowand Machinery
Dept. of Public Works 14919 40th Ave. NE E. 6420 Broadway Ave. W. 10310 Westbow Blvd. 1201 E Yonazawa Blvd 7916 W Sunset Hwy 7916 W Sunset Hwy 7916 W Sunset Hwy 1907 E James St.
Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Marysville, WA 98271 Spokane, WA 99220 Spokane, WA 99224 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Spokane, WA 99224 Spokane, WA 99224 Spokane, WA 99224 Spokane, WA 99301
Iltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Furnish and deliver:
450 hp Truck Chassis 1 No Bid $0.00 $104,900.00 $104,900.00 $120,775.00 $120,775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12-14 cy Dump Body 1 $32,848.00 $32,848.00 $35,436.00 $35,436.00 $42,720.00 $42,720.00
12' Two-Way Snow Plow 1 $15,707.00 $15,707.00 $15,937.00 $15,937.00 $18,150.00 $18,150.00
10 cy Body Sander 1 $19,020.00 $19.020.00 $15,608.00 $15,608.00 $20,475.00 $20,475.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $67,575.00 Subtotal $171,881.00 Subtotal $202,120.00
Tax 7.90% $5,338.43 i Tax 7.90% $13,578.60 i Tax 7.90% $15.967.48
Total $72.913.43 Total $185.459.60 Total $218.087.48
Truck  No Bid Truck 2011 Kenworth T800 Truck 2011 Western Star 4900FA
Dump 2011 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump 2011 Swensen Dump Body 15' 6" Dump 2011 Crysteel SLTS
Plow 2011 Henke EXP 12 Plow 2011 Flink P12PA3258001 Plow 2011 Henke EXP12
Sander 2011 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander 2011 Swensen EV100 15-82-56 Sander 2011 Henderson FSH14
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: July 15, 20117 Delivery: 180 days ARO
Exceptions/Additions to specs Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -Paccar MX455 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $2,200.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed 12.9L, 6 cyl, 1650 ft/lb at 1100 rpm for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: -46" moldboard nose height +2.5 year engine warranty +Add. cost for eng. warranty ext. listed
-no service outlet info provided -no auto ejector for dust/snow listed +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator
Sander: No exceptions listed -aluminum core radiator? +Donaldson inside/outside air intake
Optional Stainless Sander: +$9,438.00 11-5/8x3-7/8x3/8 inch frame rails +160 amp alternator
Discount offer if all three items are -RBM not provided? +Fuller transmission with lube pump
purchased: ($1,900.00) -Frame ext: RBM 2,572k in-Ibs per rail +external transmission oil filter
-speed restricted tires at 55 mph +Add. cost for trans. warranty ext. listed:
-hub piloted wheels 10-3/4x3-1/2x3/8 inch double channel
-no bluetooth hands-free cell system frame rail, RBM 3,220k in-lbs
-5t fire extinguisher Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-lbs per rail
Dump Body: +7 gauge sidewall/headwa +7/16 inch 120ksi frame ext. reinforce.
-air-operated valves? +aluminum front wheels
-Mailhot #SC 130-6-3 hoist +speed rating front tires at 65 mph
-many spec items not confirmed +speed rating rear tires at 75 mph
-no service outlet info provided +Fuel filter/water sep. w/heated bow!
Plow: -no service outlet info provided -36" clear rearward area
Sander: one deflector fixed +rear cab window safety glass
-many spec items not confirmed -no corner cab windows
Optional Stainless Sander: No Bid -no bluetooth hands-free cell system
-no service outlet info provided +cloth passenger bench
-Delivery for dump, plow and sander -5# fire extinguisher
not listed Add $100 for optional CD manuals
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
+AR400 steel floor
-Crysteel T63131 hoist
Plow: -46" moldboard nose height
Sander: +11.6 c.y. struck capacity
-sliding shroud deflector system
Truck Chassis Bid only: Truck Chassis Bid only:
$104,900.00 $104,900.00 v/ $120,775.00 $120,775.00
Tax 7.90% $8.287.10 :: Tax 7.90% $9.541.23
Total $113.187.10 Total $130,316.23
Equipment Bids only: Equipment Bids only: Equipment Bids only:
v Dump $32,848.00 $32,848.00; Dump $35,436.00 $35,436.00 ;i Dump $42,720.00 $42,720.00
v Plow $15,707.00 $15,707.00: ; Plow $15,937.00 $15,937.00 :: Plow $18,150.00 $18,150.00
v Sander $19,020.00 $19.020.00; : Sander $15,608.00 $15,608.00 ' Sander $20,475.00 $20,475.00
Subtotal $67,575.00 Subtotal $66,981.00 Subtotal $81,345.00
Discount -$1.900.00 ; Tax 7.90% $5.291.50 i Tax 7.90% $6.426.26
Subtotal $65,675.00 Total $72.272.50 Total $87.771.26
Tax 7.90% $5.188.33
Total $70,863.33 Optional Stainless Sander: +$8,560.00
Furnish and deliver:
525 hp 5th Wheel Truck Tractor 1 No Bid $121,913.00 $121,913.00 i v $133,949.00 $133,949.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.O0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #3180 $7.000.00): ¢/ Trade-in #3180 $5.000.00
Subtotal $114,913.00 Subtotal $128,949.00
Tax 7.90% $9.078.13 i Tax 7.90% $10.186.97
Total $123.991.13 Total $139.135.97
2011 Kenworth T800 2011 Western Star 4900FA
Delivery: July 15, 2011 Delivery: 180 days ARO
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: +20,000 Ib front axle Truck: +Offered DD 15 for $3,700.00
-axle spacing modifications noted +Add. cost for eng. warranty ext. listed
+2.5 year engine warranty +1750 cu in brass/copper radiator
+no add. cost for eng. warranty ext. +160 amp alternator
-aluminum core radiator +16.5x6 inch front cam brakes
-hub piloted wheels +16.5x8.62 inch rear cam brakes
-speed restricted tires at 55 mph +Add. cost for trans. warranty ext. listed:
10-3/4x3-1/2x3/8 in steel frame rail +aluminum front wheels
RBM 2,132k in-lbs +speed rating front tires at 65 mph
+16.5x6 inch front cam brakes +speed rating rear tires at 75 mph
-no bluetooth hands-free cell system +rear cab window safety glass
-5t fire extinguisher 10-3/4x3-1/2x3/8 inch double channel
-only one PTO provided frame rail, RBM 3,220k in-lbs
-wet kit information not provided -no bluetooth hands-free cell system
-warranty info not provided -5# fire extinguisher
Furnish and deliver 100,000 Ib.
hydraulic detachable gooseneck 1 No Bid No Bid $74,000.00 $74,000.00 i:v/ $57,800.00 $57,800.00 $61,600.00 $61,600.00 $65,705.00 $65,705.00 $65,150.00 $65,150.00 $72,927.00 $72,927.00
trailer F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $5.846.00 i Tax 7.90% $4.566.20 | Tax 7.90% $4.866.40 | : Tax 7.90% $5.190.70 | : Tax 7.90% $5.146.85 | i Tax 7.90% $5.761.23
Total $79,846.00 Total $62,366.20 Total $66,466.40 Total $70,895.70 Total $70,296.85 Total $78,688.23
2011 Cozad 50 ton 3-axle 2011 Eager Beaver 50GSL-3 2011 Big Tow B-50DTG 2011 Interstate 102SDGN 2011 Trail-Eze DG27H3 2011 Trail King TK110HDG
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 12 weeks ARO Delivery: 110 days ARO Delivery: 12 weeks ARO Delivery: 5 months ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs Exceptions/Additions to specs Exceptions/Additions to specs Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs
None listed +119,000 gvwr None listed -13' 6" gooseneck +25,000 Ib axles +131,000 gvwr
+25,000 Ib axles -56' overall length -16"to 36" adj. king pin
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