Herbicide Materials 2018
Grant County Total Awarded Amount
Dept. of Public Works $357,885.22

Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 9, 2018
X Department Award Recommendation

Crop Production Services
5811 West Farm Market Rd
Boise, ID 83714

Helena Chemical Company
4802 N Florida St.
Spokane, WA 99217

Wilbur-Ellis Company
9519 Vernal Ave. SE
Moses Lake, WA 98837

State Bid
Wilbur Ellis
12001 E. Empire Avenue

Spokane Valley, WA 99206
Contract 04611

State Bid
Crop Production Services
4175 Salem Industrial Drive

Salem, OR 97037
Contract 04611

Expires 02/07/18 Expires 02/07/18
Iltem # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 8 All Clear DS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Liters Delivered in 1.0 Liter Containers per liter per liter per liter per liter per liter

2 25 Aqua Neat $15.47 $ 38.68 $15.50 $38.75 $14.25 $35.63 $14.04 $35.10 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

8 2.5 AquaSweep $39.00 $97.50 * $38.85 $97.13 X $ 38.00 $95.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

4 92.5 Axxe $0.00 No Bid $53.80 $4,976.50 X $42.10 $ 3,894.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

5 3725 Brimstone $0.00 No Bid $21.36 $ 7,956.60 X $21.29 $7,930.53 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

6 97.5 Bronc Max/water conditioning agent $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $12.00 $1,170.00 $11.43 $1,114.43 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

7 175.0 Bronc Triple (water conditioner + non ionic surfactant $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No bid X $21.00 $ 3,675.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

8 50 Brush-Rhap $0.00 No Bid X $52.95 $ 2,647.50 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

9 5.0 Chlorsulfuron $184.00 $920.00 * $177.60 $888.00 X $170.88 $854.40 $0.00 $0.00
Pounds Delivered in 5.0 pound Container per pound per pound per pound per pound per pound

10 37.5 Crosshair $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid X $ 35.60 $1,335.00 $38.38 $1,439.25 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

11 1,694 Dryphosate 75SG $3.21 $5,437.74 $0.00 No Bid X $2.69 $ 4,556.86 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Pounds Delivered in 11.0 Pound Containers per pound per pound per pound per pound per pound

12 3,440.0 Escort XP $2.10 $7,224.00 1/2 $1.97 $ 3,388.40 1/2 $1.97 $ 3,388.40 $0.00 $0.00 $2.72 $9,356.80
Ounces Delivered in 16.0 Ounce Containers per ounce per ounce per ounce per ounce per ounce
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Esplanade 200 SC

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Foam Buster

Delivered in 1.0 Quart Containers

Frequency

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Garlon 4

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Glyphosate 4 Ib. with Surfactant

Delivered in 265 Gallon Totes

Glyphosate 4 Ib. with Surfactant

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Grounded-W

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Hi-Light Blue Vegetation Mangement Spray Indicator
Delivered in 1.0 Quart Containers

Hi-Light Red Vegetation Mangement Spray Indicator
Delivered in 1.0 Quart Containers

Krovar

Delivered in 25 Pound Bags

Landmark XP
Delivered in 4 Pound Bag

Laramie 25DF
Delivered in 16 Ounce Containers

LI 700

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Liberate

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Lifeline

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

$1,121.40

per gallon

$0.00

per quart

$ 700.00

per gallon

$44.50

per gallon

$10.21

per gallon

$10.70
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$17.00

per quart

$ 24.00

per quart

$6.73
per pound

$99.20
per pound

$6.21

per ounce

$18.00
per gallon

$20.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$5,607.00

No Bid

$ 1,750.00

$111.25

$ 18,939.55

$1,738.75

No Bid

$ 68.00

$96.00

$39,034.00

$396.80

$78,991.20

$ 45.00

$50.00

No Bid

$1,121.40

per gallon

$9.14

per quart

$ 726.00

per gallon

$42.00

per gallon

$12.82

per gallon

$13.69
per gallon

$14.68
per gallon

$ 15.00
per quart

$0.00
per quart

$6.10
per pound

$128.00

per pound

$13.32

per ounce

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$100.00
per gallon

$5,607.00

$ 36.56

$1,815.00

$105.00

$ 23,781.10

$2,224.63

$293.60

$60.00

No Bid

$ 35,380.00

$512.00

$ 169,430.40

No Bid

No Bid

$ 500.00

$1,121.40

per gallon

$0.00

per quart

$722.00

per gallon

$43.75

per gallon

$10.75

per gallon

$10.20

per gallon

$19.88

per gallon

$18.27
per quart

$23.35
per quart

$6.55
per pound

$98.40
per pound

$5.89

per ounce

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$54.76

per gallon

$5,607.00

No Bid

$2,166.00

$109.38

$19,941.25

$1,657.50

$397.60

$73.08

$93.40

$37,990.00

$393.60

$ 74,920.80

No Bid

No Bid

$273.80

1/2 $1,099.48

per gallon

$0.00

per quart

$792.15

per gallon

* $43.53

per gallon

per gallon

$0.00

per gallon

$0.00

per gallon

X $12.87

per quart

$0.00
per quart

$0.00
per pound

$105.12

per pound

$0.00

per ounce

$0.00
per gallon

X $16.09

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$2,748.70

$0.00

$1,980.38

$108.83

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$51.48

$0.00

$0.00

$420.48

$0.00

$0.00

$40.23

$0.00

1/2 $1,099.48

per gallon

$0.00

per quart

$807.77

per gallon

* $44.40

per gallon

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

per quart

$0.00
per quart

$0.00
per pound

$99.04
per pound

$0.00
per ounce

$18.13
per gallon

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$2,748.70

$0.00

$2,019.43

$111.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$ 396.16

$0.00

$45.33

$0.00

$0.00
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Lock Down

Delivered in 12.0 Pound Containers

Milestone

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

MSO

Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers

Overdrive

Delivered in 7.5 Pound Containers

Panoramic 2SL

Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers

Pendulum 3.3 EC

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Pendulum AquaCap

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Perspective

Delivered in 20.0 Ounce Containers

Piper
Delivered in 3.75 Pound Container

Polaris

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Portfolio

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Prescott Herbicide

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Prodiamine 65 WDG
Delivered in 5.0 Pound Containers

Renegade EA
Delivered in 270.0 Gallon Totes

Renegade EA
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

1/4

$ 63.00

per pound

$277.00

per gallon

$11.00

per gallon

$0.00

per pound

$103.50

per gallon

$27.00
per gallon

$35.80
per gallon

$5.81

per ounce

$111.00

per pound

$52.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$10.00
per pound

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$1,512.00

$6,232.50

$ 55.00

No Bid

$ 10,350.00

$67.50

$2,148.00

$464.80

$416.25

$130.00

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

1/4

$61.05

per pound

$ 277.00

per gallon

$11.00

per gallon

$37.00

per pound

$97.60

per gallon

$32.00
per gallon

$49.40
per gallon

$5.81

per ounce

$93.00
per pound

$ 45.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$38.30
per pound

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$1,465.20

$6,232.50

$55.00

$277.50

$9,760.00

$80.00

$2,964.00

$ 464.80

$348.75

$112.50

No Bid

No Bid

$830.00

No Bid

No Bid

1/4

1/2

$58.77

per pound

$277.00

per gallon

$14.50

per gallon

$40.25

per pound

$97.80

per gallon

$26.67

per gallon

$35.71

per gallon

$5.81

per ounce

$ 85.00
per pound

$ 46.50
per gallon

$ 440.32

per gallon

$81.18

per gallon

$8.00
per pound

$22.00

per gallon

$22.00

per gallon

$1,410.48

$6,232.50

$72.50

$301.88

$9,780.00

$ 66.68

$2,142.60

$ 464.80

$318.75

$116.25

$ 13,209.60

$405.90

$ 800.00

$41,580.00

$1,045.00

1/4

1/2

1/2

$0.00

per pound

$277.00

per gallon

$7.90

per gallon

$0.00

per pound

$0.00

per gallon

$0.00

per gallon

$56.46

per gallon

$5.478

per ounce

$0.00
per pound

$53.34
per gallon

$ 440.32

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per pound

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00

$6,232.50

$ 39.50

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$3,387.60

$219.12

$0.00

$133.35

$ 13,209.60

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

1/2

$0.00

per pound

$ 278.66

per gallon

$10.79

per gallon

$0.00

per pound

$0.00

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$ 56.65
per gallon

$5.478

per ounce

$0.00
per pound

per gallon

per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per pound

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00
per gallon

$0.00

$ 25,079.40

$53.95

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$ 3,399.00

$219.12

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
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48

840.0

Gallons

3.0

Pounds

5.0

Gallons

605.00

Gallons

155

Gallons

5.0
Gallons

Rifle

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Streamline

Delivered in 3.0 Pound Container

Tordon 22K

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

TrumpCard

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Vista XRT

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Weather Gard Complete
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

1/2

$34.70 $ 29,148.00

per gallon
$103.76 $311.28

per pound
$42.50 $106.25

per gallon
$0.00 No Bid

per gallon
$125.50 $19,452.50

per gallon
$18.00 $90.00

per gallon
Bid Total ~ $232,029.55

Recommended

Award Total: $27,163.30

. . *
Exceptions or Information:

Item 32 Bid As Plateau
Item 40 Bid as Resolute

* %k ok K ok K F * ¥

$ 33.50 $ 28,140.00

per gallon
$0.00 No Bid

per pound
$ 45.00 $225.00

per gallon
$47.00 $ 28,435.00

per gallon
$121.00 $ 18,755.00

per gallon
$0.00 No Bid

per gallon
Bid Total $ 357,883.41

Recommended

Award Total: $114,808.56

Exceptions or Information: *
Item 3 Corrected rounding error
Item 9 Bid as Telar

Item 16 Bid as Garlon 4 Ultra
Item 18 Corrected rounding error
Item 24 Bid as Matrix

Item 32 Bid As Plateau

Item 35 Math error corrected
Item 40 Bid as Resolute 65 WDG
Item 43 Bid as Dicamba Agristar

1/2

$36.58 $30,727.20

per gallon
$103.76 $311.28

per pound
$42.50 $106.25

per gallon
$0.00 No Bid

per gallon
$119.84 $18,575.20

per gallon
$0.00 No Bid

per gallon
Bid Total $ 298,225.33

Recommended

Award Total: $188,961.49

Exceptions or Information: *
Item 15 Delivered as

3 - 1 gallon containers

Item 35 Corrected rounding error
Item 43 Delivered as

Dicamba DMA Salt

$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
$97.80 $ 293.40

per pound
$42.71 $213.55

per gallon
$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
$122.62 $19,006.10

per gallon
$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
Bid Total $7,478.16

Recommended

Award Total: $23,984.05

Exceptions or Information: *
Item 16 Bid as Garlon 4 Ultra
Item 30 Delivered as

Super Spread MSO

$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
$97.80 $293.40

per pound
$45.73 $ 228.65

per gallon
$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
$0.00

per gallon
$0.00 $0.00

per gallon
Bid Total $ 14,235.93

Recommended

Award Total: $2,967.82

) . *
Exceptions or Information:

Item 16 Bid as Garlon 4 Ultra




