BID TABULATION

Asphalt Materials - 2018
Grant County
Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, March 27, 2018
X Department Recommendation
Including Freight Evaluation

Item # Quantity

1A 2,900 Min.
3,300 Max.

tons

1B 550 Min.
750 Max.

tons

Hauler As
Req'd

645.12

Description

Furnish HFE 150 liquid asphalt
at185°F

Furnish HFE 90 liquid asphalt
at 185°

Company name:
Dispatch contact:
Dispatch phone:

Average tanker/trailer size for each load:

Central Manufacturing, Inc.

P.0.Box 939
Moses Lake, WA 98837

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%
Total

Total

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%

Total
Total

Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage

FOB: Ephrata +20 miles
FOB.. .Moses Lake +20 miles
FOB: George +20 miles
FOB: ..Royal City +20 miles
FOB: ....Quincy +20 miles
FOB: ....Hartline +20miles
FOB: Mattawa +20miles
FOB: .........Wilson Creek +20miles

Demurrage cost/hr. (charged after 90 min.)

Product  Plant/address
HFE 150

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Exceptions/Information:

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/hour

Granite Construction Company

80 Pond Road
Yakima, WA 98901

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%
Total

Total

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%

Total
Total

Product
HFE150
HFE 90

Exceptions/Information:

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/hour

Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc
16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

$/Ton Amount

$337.00 $977,300.00
$1,112,100.00

*Tax 7.90% $77,206.70
$87,855.90

Total $1,054,506.70
$1,199,955.90

$/Ton Amount

$337.00 $185,350.00
$252,750.00

*Tax 7.90% $14,642.65
$19,967.25

Total $199,992.65
$272,717.25

Johnnie B Transport
Daniel L
208-773-0563
33 tons

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
$1,353.00 /load
2 hours free, $100 hr. thereafter

Product  Plant/address

HFE 150  Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc

HFE 90 16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

Exceptions/Information:

1. HFE 150, 3,300 plus tons available
2. HFE 90, 750 plus tons available
3. *Self Administer Sale Tax 7.90%

X

Tax

Tax

Product

HFE 150
HFE 90

Western States Asphalt, Inc.
4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

$/Ton Amount
$335.00 $971,500.00
$1,105,500.00

8.00% $77,720.00
$88,440.00

Total $1,049,220.00
Total $1,193,940.00
$/Ton Amount
$335.00 $184,250.00
$251,250.00

8.00% $14,740.00
$20,100.00

Total $198,990.00
Total $271,350.00

Western States Asphalt
Stan B
509-545-9864
32 tons

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

$737.28 /load
$645.12 /load
$628.37 /load
$532.48 /load
$829.44 /load
$988.64 /load
$633.46 /load
$704.48 /load
None Stated /hour

Plant/address

Western States Asphalt
3152 Selph Landing
Pasco, WA 99301

Exceptions/Information:

1. HFE 150, Full quantity available
2. HFE 90, Full quantity available



Item #

2A

2B

Department Recommendation, Prime P
Department Recommendation, Alternate

Quantity Description
5,000 Min. Furnish HMA Class
7,000 Max. 1/2" PG 64-28
tons
Tax
5,000 Min. Furnish HMA Class
7,000 Max. 3/8" PG 64-28
Tax

Central Manufacturing, Inc.

P.O. Box 939

Moses Lake, WA 98837

$/Ton

$46.00

7.90%

Total

Total

$46.95

7.90%

Total
Total

Plant Address
2097 Hiawatha Rd.

Amount

$230,000.00
$322,000.00

$18,170.00
$25,438.00

$248,170.00
$347,438.00

$234,750.00
$328,650.00

$18,545.25
$25,963.35

$253,295.25
$354,613.35

Moses Lake, WA 98837

Exceptions/Information:
Available Quantity: Unlimited

Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

30tons

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Tax

Tax

Granite Construction Company
80 Pond Road
Yakima, WA 98901

$/Ton

$49.00

7.90%

Total

Total

$49.00

7.90%

Total
Total

Amount

$245,000.00
$343,000.00

$19,355.00
$27,097.00

$264,355.00
$370,097.00

$245,000.00
$343,000.00

$19,355.00
$27,097.00

$264,355.00
$370,097.00

Plant Address
5278 Hwy 17 N

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Moses Lake, WA 98837

Exceptions/Information

Available Quantity, 5,000 - 7,000 tons
Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

100 tons

Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc
16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%
Total
Total

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%

Total
Total

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Plant Address

Exceptions/Information

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Available Quantity,

Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

Western States Asphalt, Inc.
4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

$/Ton Amount

$0.00 $0.00

NO BID $0.00

Tax 7.90% $0.00
$0.00

Total $0.00

Total $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

NO BID $0.00

Tax 7.90% $0.00
$0.00

Total $0.00

Total $0.00

Plant Address

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.



