
Herbicide Materials 2017

Grant County Crop Production Services Helena Chemical Company Wilbur-Ellis Company State Bid  (Wilbur-Ellis)

Dept. of Public Works 5811 Farmmarket Rd 4802 N Florida St. 9519 Vernal Ave. SE Department of Enterprise Services

Bid Opening:  1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 17, 2017 Boise, ID 83714 Spokane, WA 99217 Moses Lake, WA 98837 1500 Jefferson Street #6097

X Olympia, WA 98501

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount

Rate/Acre 

Min/Max Unit Price Amount

Rate/Acre 

Min/Max Unit Price Amount Rate/Acre Min/Max Unit Price Amount

1A 310 Brimstone $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid X $ 20.54 $ 6,367.40 1 pt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon 2 pts per gallon

OR OR OR OR OR

1B 310 Hel-Fire $ 0.00 No Bid $ 21.29 $ 6,599.90 2 pt $ 26.33 $ 8,162.30 1 pt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 8 pt per gallon 2 pts per gallon

2 267.5 Bronc Max / water conditioning agent $ 0.00 No Bid * $ 12.56 $ 3,359.80 1 pt X $ 11.43 $ 3,057.53 1 qt/100 gallons $ 16.98 $ 4,542.15

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon 4 pt per gallon 4 qts/100 gallons per gallon

3 175 Bronc Triple / water conditiong agent $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid X $ 21.00 $ 3,675.00 1 qt/100 gallons $ 0.00

Gallons + nonionic surfactant per gallon per gallon per gallon 4 qts/100 gallons per gallon

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon  Containers

4A 4800 Bromicil 40/40 $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid $ 6.63 $ 31,824.00 10 lbs $ 0.00

Pounds Delivered in 25.0 Pound Packages per pound per pound per pound 12 lbs per pound

OR OR OR OR OR

4B 4800 Krovar $ 6.60 $ 31,680.00 6 lbs X $ 6.58 $ 31,584.00 6 lb $ 6.63 $ 31,824.00 10 lbs $ 0.00

Pounds Delivered in 25.0 Pound Packages per pound 12 lbs per pound 16 lb per pound 12 lbs per pound

5 32.5 Crosshair $ 0.00 * $ 36.00 $ 1,170.00 Rate Varies $ 38.38 $ 1,247.35 4 oz $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon No Bid per gallon per volume of per gallon 4 oz per gallon

water per acre

6 395 Cruise Control/Dicamba X $ 36.20 $ 14,299.00 .5 oz $ 41.14 $ 16,250.30 8 oz $ 39.58 $ 15,634.10 10 oz $ 55.74 $ 22,017.30

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 4 lbs per gallon 2 qts per gallon 24 oz per gallon

7A 72.5 Fluoxpyr $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

OR OR OR OR OR

7B 72.5 Vista XRT $ 155.40 $ 11,266.50 6 oz *X $ 117.25 $ 8,500.63 6 oz $ 122.62 $ 8,889.95 8 oz $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 23 oz per gallon 23 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon

8 2,120 Glyphosate 4 lb. with Surfactant $ 9.80 $ 20,776.00 16 oz $ 9.50 $ 20,140.00 16 oz X $ 8.84 $ 18,740.80 1 pt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 265 Gallon Totes per gallon 48 oz per gallon 48 oz per gallon 4 pts per gallon

9 92.5 Glyphosate 4 lb. with Surfactant $ 10.50 $ 971.25 16 oz * $ 9.61 $ 888.93 16 oz X $ 9.37 $ 866.73 1 pt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 48 oz per gallon 48 oz per gallon 4 pts per gallon

Department Award Recommendation

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED



10A 12,192 Laramie 25 $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No bid X $ 7.04 $ 85,831.68 2 oz $ 0.00

Ounces Delivered in 16 Ounce Containers per ounce per ounce per ounce 4 oz per ounce

OR OR OR OR OR

10B 12,192 Matrix $ 12.90 $ 157,276.80 2 oz $ 12.44 $ 151,668.48 4 oz $ 15.00 $ 182,880.00 2 oz $ 0.00

Ounces Delivered in 16 Ounce Containers per ounce 4 oz per ounce 4 oz per ounce 4 oz per ounce

11 27.5 Milestone X 1/3rd $ 277.00 $ 7,617.50 3 oz X 1/3rd $ 277.00 $ 7,617.50 3 oz X 1/3rd $ 277.00 $ 7,617.50 5 oz $ 278.66 $ 7,663.15

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 7 oz per gallon 7 oz per gallon 7 oz per gallon

12A 60 Portfolio 4F $ 684.00 $ 41,040.00 8 oz $ 471.34 $ 28,280.40 8 oz X $ 445.00 $ 26,700.00 10 oz $ 490.90 $ 29,454.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz per gallon

OR OR OR OR OR

12B 60 Roll By $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No bid $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

13 1,080 Renegade EA $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No Bid X $ 21.50 $ 23,220.00 1 qt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 270 Gallon Totes per gallon per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon

14 5 Renegade EA $ 0.00 No Bid $ 0.00 No bid X $ 21.50 $ 107.50 1 qt $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon

15 57.5 Scythe $ 67.00 $ 3,852.50 1% Solution $ 45.05 $ 2,590.38 Varies per rate X $ 44.45 $ 2,555.88 6 oz $ 48.25 $ 2,774.38

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 10% Solution per gallon of water used per gallon 32 oz per gallon

16 585 Trump Card $ 0.00 No Bid X $ 49.16 $ 28,758.60 1 pt $ 50.97 $ 29,817.45 2 pts $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 4 pt per gallon 3 pts per gallon

17 37.50 Vision $ 0.00 No Bid X $ 75.78 $ 2,841.75 8 oz $ 77.39 $ 2,902.13 8 oz $ 0.00

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon 32 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon

Bid Total $ 288,779.55 Bid Total $ 310,250.66 Bid Total $ 491,921.28

Recommended Recommended Recommended 

Award Total: $16,812.78 Award Total: $ 74,198.75 Award Total: $ 174,883.63
·

*2 Substitution, Quest

*5 Substitution, Justified, deemed non-equivalent

*7B Corrected rounding error

*9 Corrected rounding error

Exceptions or Information:  *Exceptions or Information:  *

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

Exceptions or Information:  * Exceptions or Information:  *


