
BID TABULATION
Miscellaneous Equipment 1 - 2017
Grant County Cobalt Truck Equipment I.T.E.C., Inc. Modern Machinery Northwest Mfg. & Dist., Inc.

Dept. of Public Works 4620 East Trent Ave. 1602 Rudkin Rd. 4428 E. Trent 2050 Main Street

Bid Opening:  1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 24, 2017 Spokane, WA 99212 Yakima, WA 98901 Spokane, WA 99212 Billings, MT 59105

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

17-01 1 4 1/4 Cubic Yard Asphalt Patcher No Bid No Bid No Bid $100,075.00 $100,075.00
F.O.B.   Ephrata ,WA Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $8,006.00

TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00  TOTAL $108,081.00

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: 90 day ARO
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:

17-02 3 Roller/Packer Motor Grader No Bid No Bid $29,906.00 $89,718.00 No Bid
Attachment Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $7,177.44 Tax 8.00% $0.00
F.O.B   Ephrata, WA TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $96,895.44 TOTAL $0.00

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: 10-12 weeks ARO Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: 12 months Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Optional Pick-up Tow Hitch additional
$1,500 per unit

17-03 1 Platform Truck Body $ 8,550 $8,550.00 $8,056.14 $8,056.14 No Bid No Bid
F.O.B.   Ephrata, WA Tax 8.00% $684.00 Tax 8.20% $660.60 Tax 8.00% Tax 8.00%

TOTAL $9,234.00  TOTAL $8,716.74 TOTAL TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Substitute Buyers 1703510 for 
Knapheide TBU4818A,  Storage Box

90 day ARO
5 years

6-8 weeks ARO
6 year limited

12 months



Pac West Machinery Rowand Machinery Company Titan Truck

4030 East Trent Ave. 1907 East James North 605 Fancher Road

Spokane, WA 99202 Pasco, WA 99301 Spokane, WA 99212

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

17-01 1 4 1/4 Cubic Yard Asphalt Patcher $ 58,359 $58,358.78 No Bid No Bid $0.00
F.O.B.   Ephrata ,WA Tax 8.00% $4,668.70 Tax 8.00% Tax 8.00% Tax 8.00% $0.00

TOTAL $63,027.48 TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL $0.00

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Electric Heat Only, No remote heat option
No asphalt compaction device or storage
No LED lighting package
No tool storage rack
No tack oil waste flush tank

17-02 3
    

Attachment No Bid $ 27,934 $83,802.00 No Bid $0.00
F.O.B   Ephrata, WA Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00% $6,704.16 Tax 8.00% $0.00 Tax 8.00%

TOTAL $0.00  TOTAL $90,506.16 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Optional Pick-up Tow Hitch additional 
$1,400 per unit

17-03 1 Platform Truck Body No bid No bid $ 7,122 $7,122.00
F.O.B.   Ephrata, WA Tax 8.00% Tax 8.00% Tax 8.00% $569.76 Tax 9%

TOTAL TOTAL  TOTAL $7,691.76 TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Page 8 of proposal not included

60  day ARO
12 months

12-14 weeks ARO
12 months

60 days ARO
12 months

10 weeks ARO
1 year


	A

