BID TABULATION

Asphalt Materials - 2017
Grant County
Dept. of Public Works
Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, February 21, 2017
X Department Recommendation
Including Freight Evaluation

P.0.Box 939
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Item # Quantity Description $/Ton
1A 5,000 Min. Furnish HFE 150 liquid asphalt $0.00
5,600 Max. at185°F NO BID
tons
Tax 7.90%
Total
Total
$/Ton
1B 400 Min. Furnish HFE 90 liquid asphalt $0.00
575 Max. at 185° NO BID
tons
Tax 7.90%
Total
Total
Hauler As Company name:

Req'd Dispatch contact:
Dispatch phone:
Average tanker/trailer size for each load:
Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage

FOB: Ephrata +20 miles
FOB.. .Moses Lake +20 miles
FOB: George +20 miles
FOB: ..Royal City +20 miles
FOB: ....Quincy +20 miles
FOB: ....Hartline +20miles
FOB: Mattawa +20miles

FOB: .........Wilson Creek +20miles
Demurrage cost/hr. (charged after 90 min.)

Product
HFE 150
HFE 90

Plant/address

Central Washington Asphalt

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Exceptions/Information:

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/hour

Granite Construction Company

80 Pond Road
Yakima, WA 98901

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%
Total

Total

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%

Total
Total

Product
HFE150
HFE 90

Exceptions/Information:

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/load
/hour

X Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc
16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

$/Ton Amount

$304.00  $1,520,000.00
$1,702,400.00

*Tax 7.90% $120,080.00
$134,489.60

Total  $1,640,080.00
$1,836,889.60

$/Ton Amount

$304.00 $121,600.00
$174,800.00

*Tax 7.90% $9,606.40
$13,809.20

Total $131,206.40
$188,609.20

Johnnie B Transport
Daniel L
208-773-0563
33 tons

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
$1,089.00 /load
3 hours free, $100 hr. thereafter

Product  Plant/address

HFE 150  Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc

HFE 90 16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

Exceptions/Information:

1. HFE 150, 5,600 plus tons available
2. HFE 90, 575 plus tons available
3. *Self Administer Sale Tax 7.90%

Western States Asphalt, Inc.

4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

$/Ton Amount

$337.00  $1,685,000.00
$1,887,200.00

Tax 8.00% $134,800.00
$150,976.00

Total $1,819,800.00

Total $2,038,176.00

$/Ton Amount

$337.00 $134,800.00
$193,775.00

Tax 8.00% $10,784.00
$15,502.00

Total $145,584.00

Total $209,277.00

Northwest Tank Lines

Bill Wyman
509-444-3555

Product

HFE 150

HFE 90 3152 Selph Landing
Pasco, WA 99301

Plant/address

Exceptions/Information:

30+ tons

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

$816.40 /load
$633.46 /load
$839.56 /load
$618.00 /load
$862.42 /load
$738.30 /load
$633.46 /load
$732.60 /load
None Stated /hour

Western States Asphalt

1. HFE 150, Full quantity available
2. HFE 90, Full quantity available



Item #

2A

2B

Department Recommendation, Prime A
Department Recommendation, Alternate

Quantity

6,000 Min.
8,000 Max.
tons

6,000 Min.
8,000 Max.

Description

Furnish HMA Class

1/2" PG 64-28

Tax
Furnish HMA Class
3/8" PG 64-28

Tax

Central Washington Asphalt, Inc.

P.0.Box 939
Moses Lake, WA 98837

$/Ton Amount
$47.85 $287,100.00
$382,800.00

7.90% $22,680.90
$30,241.20

Total $309,780.90
Total $413,041.20
$48.85 $293,100.00
$390,800.00

7.90% $23,154.90
$30,873.20

Total $316,254.90
Total $421,673.20

Plant Address
2097 Hiawatha Rd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Exceptions/Information:
Available Quantity: Unlimited

Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

50 tons

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

P

Tax

Tax

Granite Construction Company
80 Pond Road
Yakima, WA 98901

$/Ton

$46.00

7.90%

Total

Total

$47.00

7.90%

Total
Total

Amount

$276,000.00
$368,000.00

$21,804.00
$29,072.00

$297,804.00
$397,072.00

$282,000.00
$376,000.00

$22,278.00
$29,704.00

$304,278.00
$405,704.00

Plant Address
5278 Hwy 17 N

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Min.

Max.

Moses Lake, WA 98837

Exceptions/Information

Available Quantity, 8,000 tons
Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

100 tons

Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc
16425 W. Prairie Ave.
Hauser, ID 83854

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%
Total
Total

$0.00
NO BID

Tax 7.90%

Total
Total

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Plant Address

Exceptions/Information

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Available Quantity,

Minimum Delivery if plant not in operation

Tax

Tax

$/Ton

$0.00
NO BID

7.90%
Total
Total

$0.00
NO BID

7.90%

Total
Total

Western States Asphalt, Inc.
4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

Amount

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Plant Address

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.

Min.
Max.



