
Towable Rock Rake
Grant County Pape Machinery Brim Tractor Rathbone Sales Washington Tractor
Dept. of Public Works 3500 State Highway 97A 3860 E. Broadway Ave 731 F Street SE
Quote Closing  4:00 P.M., Thursday, February 9, 2016 Wenatchee, WA 98801 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Quincy, WA 98848

X = Department Award Recommendation

Item # Description Quantity Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount

1 Furnish & Deliver, Towable Rock Rake 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90%

X Sunbelt Rentals Rowand Machinery Evergreen Implement York Modern Corp.
13405 W Senset Hwy 1907 E James 1429 Pioneer Way P.O. Box 488
Airway Heights, WA 99001 Pasco, WA 99302 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Unadella, NY 13849

Item # Description Quantity Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount Unit Amount

1 Furnish & Deliver, Towable Rock Rake 1 $8,350.00 $ 8,350.00 NO BID NO BID $8,630.00 $ 8,630.00
Tax 7.90% $ 659.65 Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% $ 681.77

TOTAL $ 9,009.65 TOTAL $ 9,311.77

Quote Tabulation

2500 Cedardale Rd
Mount Vernon, WA 98274
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