Quote Tabulation

Hydro-Seeding Materials
Grant County
Department of Public Works

Quote Closing, November 11, 2016 at 5:00 P.M.

Department Recommendation v
Item Description
1 Road Side Seed Mix per Pound

2 16-16-16 Slow Release Fertilizer
Per 50 Ib. Bag

3 Straw Based Hydro-Mulch
Per 50 Ib. Bale

4 Wood Fiber Hydro-Mulch
Per 50 Ib. Bale

5 Tackifier for 8.0 total acres

Quantity

300

25

82

82

Unit Price

$3.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

Landmark Turf & Native Seed
4908 S Hayford Road
Spokane, WA 99224

Amount

$1,125.00

v

Agrivestment LTD.

2330 Port of Tacoma Road

Tacoma, WA 98417

Unit Price
$5.75

$21.00

$16.50

$18.00

$90.00

v

Sub-Total
Tax 8%

Total

Amount
$1,725.00

$525.00

$1,353.00

$1,476.00

$90.00

$90.00
$7.20

$97.20

v Wilbur Ellis Co.
9519 Vernal Ave SE

Moses Lake, WA 98837

Unit Price
$3.26 v

$17.25 ¥

$9.40 v

$14.23 v

$131.70

Sub-Total
Tax 8%

Total

Amount
$978.00

$431.25

$770.80

$1,166.86

$131.70

$3,346.91
$267.75

$3,614.66
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