
BID TABULATION
Miscellaneous Equipment 2 - 2016
Grant County Ace Tank and Fueling Equipment Central Machinery General Equipment Company Mascott Equipment Modern Machinery Co. Inc. Modern Machinery Co. Inc.

Dept. of Public Works 18340 Andover Park West 1201 E. Yonezawa 620 Alexander Drive SW 200 S 20th Street 4428 East Trent Ave. 4428 East Trent Ave.

Bid Opening:  1:30 P.M. Tuesday, March 8, 2016 Tukwila, WA 98188 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Owatonna, MN 55060 Pasco, WA 99301 Spokane, WA 99212 Spokane, WA 99212
X

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

16-01 2 Double Drum Compactor NO BID $ 108,500 $217,000.00 NO BID NO BID $124,807.00 $249,614.00 $128,936.00 $257,872.00
F.O.B.   Ephrata ,WA Tax Tax 8.0% $17,360.00 Tax Tax Tax 8.0% $19,969.12 Tax 8.0% $20,629.76

TOTAL TOTAL $234,360.00 TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL $269,583.12 TOTAL $278,501.76
Case  DV210D HF

Delivery: Delivery: August 2016 Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: 30 Days Delivery: 30 Days
Warranty: Warranty: 12 Months Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Operating Weight  22,730 lbs. Math error corrected Math error corrected
Drum Diameter  48" Operating Weight  22865 lbs. Operating Weight  22865 lbs.
Drum Width  66" Drum Width 66.1" Drum Width 66.1"
Shell Thickness (nominal) 0.9" Drum Diameter 47.2" Drum Diameter 47.2"
Axial Piston Pump Shell Thickness (nominal) 0.87" Shell Thickness (nominal) 0.87"
Max Travel Speed  6.8 mph. Max Travel Speed 7.5 mph. Max Travel Speed 7.5 mph.
Water System 222 gal. max 115 hp. (ISO) 115 hp. (ISO)
1 Spray Bar per drum Electrical System  12 volt Electrical System  12 volt
3 Stage Filtration No Amber Beacons Noted Inside turning radius  232"
Turning Radius 215" Inside turning radius  232.3" Hydraulic Oil Capacity  18.3 gal.
Hydraulic Oil Capacity 16 gal. Hydraulic Oil Capacity  18.3 gal. Side Clearance 4.5"
Vibration Frequency 67 Hz. @ 4,020 vpm. Side Clearance 2.4" Curb Clearance  31.5"
Vibration Frequency 42 Hz. @ 2,520 vpm. Curb Clearance  31.5" Vibration Frequency 67 Hz. @ 4,020 vpm.
Amplitude Settings, Nominal .009-.024 inch Vibration Frequency 50 Hz. @ 3,000 vpm. Vibration Frequency 45 Hz. @ 2,700 vpm.
Eccentric Force, Nominal  18,434-23,605 lbs. Vibration Frequency 42 Hz. @ 3,000 vpm. Amplitude Settings, Nominal .013-.029 inch
Seat Belt Alarm,  No Amplitude Settings, Nominal .019-.032 inch Eccentric Force, Nominal  28,880-33,075 lbs.
2 amplitude settings Eccentric Force, Nominal  22,275-27,000 lbs. 2 amplitude settings

2 amplitude settings

16-02 1 Moldboard Mount Asphalt Cutter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.O.B   Ephrata, WA Tax Tax Tax Tax Tax Tax

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:

16-03 1 Bulk Oil System
F.O.B.   Quincy, WA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tax NO BID Tax Tax Tax Tax Tax
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:

NC Machinery Company X Northwest Pump and Equip. X PacWest Machinery LLC PacWest Machinery LLC Rowand Machinery Co. Sonsray Machinery

5535 Baker Flats Drive 2800 NW 31st Ave. 4030 E. Trent Ave. 4030 E. Trent Ave. 1907 E. James 2702 West Valley Hwy. N.

East Wenatchee, WA 98802 Portland, OR 97210 Spokane, WA 99202 Spokane, WA 99202 Pasco, WA 99301 Auburn, WA 98001

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

16-01 2 Double Drum Compactor $ 97,972 $195,944.00 NO BID $ 108,295 $216,590.00 $115,075.00 $230,150.00 $114,874.46 $229,748.92 $119,591.17 $239,182.34
F.O.B.   Ephrata ,WA Tax 8.0% $15,675.52 Tax Tax 8.00% $17,327.20 Tax 8.0% $18,412.00 Tax 8.0% $18,379.91 Tax 8.0% $19,134.59

TOTAL $211,619.52 TOTAL TOTAL $233,917.20 TOTAL $248,562.00 TOTAL $248,128.83 TOTAL $258,316.93
Caterpillar  CB54B Volvo DD110B Volvo DD110B - 8 Amplitude HFA Atlas Copco  CC4200 BOMAG 161AD-5
Delivery: 130 days Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: 60-90 days Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: 24 month Warranty: 2 Years Warranty: Warranty: 1 year
Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
Math Error Corrected 2 amplitude settings Automatic eccentric with 8 amplitudes Operating Weight 22,500 lbs. Operating Weight  21,600 lbs.
Operating Weight  22,564 lbs. Drum Width  68" Drum width 66.1"
Drum Diameter  47" Drum Diameter  50" Drum Diameter 48"
Shell Thickness (nominal) 0.75" Max Travel Speed 7.5 mph 114 hp. Kubota
Max Travel Speed  7.5 mph 130 hp. @ 2,200 rpm Electrical System  12 volt
Electrical System  12 volt Water System 238 gal. max Water System 198 gal. max
Single Amber Beacon Articulation angle  32 degrees Inside turning radius 192.1"
Water System 221 gal. max Fuel Capacity 63 gal. Fuel Capacity 38.3 gal.
Turning Radius 14,1' - 169.2"? Hydraulic oil capacity  42 gal. Hydraulic oil capacity  21 gal.
Articulation angle  35 degrees Side clearance  3" Side Clearance  3.1"
Oscillation angle  6 degrees Curb clearance  34" Curb Clearance  9.8"
Fuel Capacity 55 gal. Vibration Frequency @ 4,010 vpm. Amplitude Settings, Nominal .010-.023 inch
Hydraulic oil capacity  18.3 gal. Vibration Frequency @ 2,870 vpm. Eccentric Force, Nominal  19,109-22,706 lbs.
Side Clearance 3.5" Amplitude Settings, Nominal .014-.031 inch 2 amplitude settings
Curb Clearance  37" Eccentric Force, Nominal  20,700-31,280 lbs.
Vibration Frequency 63.3 Hz. @ 3,800 vpm. 2 amplitude settings
Vibration Frequency 43 Hz. @ 2,580 vpm.
Amplitude Settings, Nominal .012-.032 inch
Eccentric Force, Nominal  19,500 lbs.
2 amplitude settings

16-02 1 Moldboard Mount Asphalt Cutter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.O.B   Ephrata, WA Tax Tax Tax Tax Tax Tax

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

Delivery: Delivery: 2 weeks Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: 12 month ARO Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:
Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:

16-03 1 Bulk Oil System
F.O.B.   Quincy, WA NO BID $4,305.00 $4,305.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tax Tax 7.9% $340.10 Tax Tax Tax Tax
TOTAL TOTAL $4,645.10 TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL

Various Mfg.
Delivery: Delivery: 2 weeks Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:
Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:

36" x 36" x 30.5" Tank
Pump 3:1 7.8 gal free flow
Working air pressure 20-150 psi.
Hose reel has sealed ball bearings

Department Award Recommendation

12 Months/1,000 hrs.

HAMM  HD+110i VV HAMM  HD+110i VV  HF

12 Months/1,000 hrs.

12 month / unlimited
90-120 day ARO 90-120 day ARO

12 months / 1500 hours
4-5 weeks for in stock units


	A

