BID TABULATION

Miscellaneous Equipment 1 - 2016
Grant County
Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 19, 2016
X Department Award Recommendation

LyCox Enterprises, Inc.
6508 South Frontage Rd

Billings, MT 59101

National Barricade & Sign
6602 East Main Ave.

Spokane Valley, WA 99212

Rowand Machinery Co.

1907 E. James
Pasco, WA 99301

Superior Steel Products, Inc
1604 Industrial Way

Caldwell, ID 83605

ltem # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
16-01 1 3,600 Gallon Skid Tank for Water NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $20,021.00 $20,021.00
F.O.B. Ephrata WA Tax 8.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $0.00 Tax 7.90% $1,581.66
TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00 *X TOTAL $21,602.66
Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:
Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
16-02 2 Roller Packer Motor Grader Attachment $24,487.50 $48,975.00 NO BID $0.00 $23,125.00 $46,250.00 NO BID $0.00
F.O.B Ephrata, WA Tax 7.90% $3,869.03 Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% $3,653.75 Tax 8.90%
TOTAL $52,844.03 TOTAL *X TOTAL $49,903.75 TOTAL
Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:
Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec: Exceptions/Additions to spec:
16-03 Telescping Square Tubing NO BID NO BID NO BID
625 2"x 10" 14 Guage $0.00 * $19.45 $12,156.25 $0.00 $0.00
625 2"x 12" 14 Guage $0.00 * $23.45 $14,656.25 $0.00 $0.00
1,250 2.25"x 3' 12 Guage $0.00 * $9.40 $11,750.00 $0.00 $0.00
F.O.B. Ephrata, WA Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $38,562.50 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $0.00
Tax 9% $0.00 Tax 8% $3,085.00 Tax 9% $0.00 Tax 9% $0.00
TOTAL $0.00 X TOTAL $41,647.50 TOTAL $0.00 TOTAL $0.00
Delivery: Delivery: Delivery: Delivery:
Warranty: Warranty: Warranty: Warranty:

Exceptions/Additions to spec:
*Substitution, WR90-3 Oscillator

Exceptions/Additions to spec:
*Substitution: POZ-LOC

Exceptions/Additions to spec:

The Proposal form was not properly executed

Exceptions/Additions to spec:
* Math Error




