Quote Tabulation

Hydro-Seeding Materials

Grant County

Department of Public Works

Quote Closing, Sept. 2, 2015 @ 5:00 P.M.

Department Recommendation v

Item Description

1 Road Side Seed Mix per Pound
2 Blow Sand Seed Mix per Pound

3 Open Pit Seed Mix per Pound

4 16-16-16 Slow Release Fertilizer
Per 50 |b. Bag

5 Straw Based Hydro-Mulch
Per 50 Ib. Bale

6 Wood Fiber Hydro-Mulch
Per 50 Ib. Bale

7 Tackifier for 19 total acres

Landmark Turf & Native Seed
4908 S Hayford Road

Spokane, WA 99224
Quantity Unit Price Amount
75 $3.50 $262.50
60 $3.00 $180.00
470 $4.25 $1,997.50
105 No Bid
230 No bid
230 No Bid
Varies No bid

v" Agrivestment LTD.

2330 Port of Tacoma Road
Tacoma, WA 98417

Unit Price Amount
$6.25 $468.75
$7.25 $435.00
$5.25 $2,467.50

$18.00 v*  $1,890.00

$12.95 $2,978.50
$15.00 $3,450.00
v $165.00

Rainier Seeds Inc.
1404 4th Street
Davenport, WA 99122

Unit Price Amount
$4.755 $356.63
$3.775 $226.50

$4.5201 $2,124.45
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Exceptions:

Item 1, Substitute Seed
Item 2, Substitute Seed
Item 3, Substitute Seed
Item 3, Math Error

v~ Wilbur Ellis Co.
12001 E Empire

S[Spokane Valley, WA 99206

Unit Price

$3.50 v
$3.00 v

$4.25 v

$19.94

$9.49 v

$14.25 v

$220.00

Amount

$262.50

$180.00

$1,997.50

$2,093.70

$2,182.70

$3,277.50

$220.00
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