
Herbicide Materials 2016

Grant County Alligare, LLC Crop Production Services Helena Chemical Company Wilbur-Ellis Company State Bid  (Wilbur-Ellis)

Dept. of Public Works 1407 North Concord Street 317 West Cashmere Rd 4802 N Florida St. 9519 Vernal Ave. SE Department of Enterprise Services

Bid Opening:  1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 12, 2016 Santa Maria, CA 93454 Boise, ID 83702 Spokane, WA 99217 Moses Lake, WA 98837 1500 Jefferson Street #6097

X Olympia, WA 98501

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount

Rate/Acre 

Min/Max Unit Price Amount Rate/Acre Min/Max Unit Price Amount

Rate/Acre 

Min/Max Unit Price Amount Rate/Acre Min/Max Unit Price Amount Rate/Acre Min/Max

1 37.5 Crosshair NO BID $ 43.00 $ 1,612.50 4 oz NO BID X $ 38.15 $ 1,430.63 4 oz $ 0.00 4 oz

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon 4 oz per gallon per gallon per gallon

2 82.5 Cruise Control NO BID $ 51.70 $ 4,265.25 2 oz *X $ 47.31 $ 3,903.08 8 oz $ 53.49 $ 4,412.93 8 oz $ 0.00 8 oz

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 4 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon 24oz per gallon 24oz

3 265 Cruise Control NO BID $ 50.00 $ 13,250.00 2 oz X $ 47.00 $ 12,455.00 8 oz $ 53.49 $ 14,174.85 8 oz $ 0.00 8 oz

Gallons Delivered in 265.0 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon 4 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon 24 oz per gallon 24 oz

4 1 Esplanade 200 sc NO BID $ 297.43 $ 297.43 3.5 oz $ 297.43 $ 297.43 3.5 oz $ 297.43 $ 297.43 3 oz X $ 292.58 $ 292.58 3 oz

Quart Delivered in 1 Quart Container per quart per quart 7 oz per quart 7 oz per quart 7 oz per quart 7 oz

5 2 Frequency NO BID $ 791.85 $ 1,583.70 4 oz X $ 714.30 $ 1,428.60 4 oz $ 780.44 $ 1,560.88 4 oz $ 780.44 $ 1,560.88 4 oz

Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 16 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon 16 oz

6 2455 Glyphosate 5.4 NO BID X $ 13.50 $ 33,142.50 1.5 pts * $ 13.68 $ 33,584.40 1 pt * $14.272769 $ 35,039.65 16 oz 16 oz

Gallons Delivered in Totes, Drums & 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 7 pts per gallon Substitution, Round 

Custom 

2 gal per gallon 51.2 oz per gallon 51.2 oz

7A 4806.0 Bromicil 40/40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7.63 $ 36,669.78 8 lbs $ 0.00 8 lbs

Pounds Delivered in 192 - 25lb & 1 - 6lb Containers per pound per pound per pound per pound 16 lbs per pound 16 lbs

OR OR OR OR OR OR

7B 4806.0 Krovar NO BID $ 8.60 $ 41,331.60 10 lbs *X $ 6.69 $ 32,152.14 6lb $ 9.02 $ 43,350.12 8 lbs $ 0.00 8 lbs

Pounds Delivered in 192 - 25lb & 1 - 6lb Containers per pound  per pound 12 lbs per pound [$32,112.00] 12 lb per pound 16 lbs per pound 16 lbs

8 5.0 Super Spread MSO NO BID $ 11.00 $ 55.00 1 pt * $ 10.38 $ 51.90 1 pt $ 8.69 $ 43.45 1 qt X $ 7.49 $ 37.45 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 gallon Container per gallon

per gallon 2 pt

per gallon Substitution, 

Premium MSO 
2 pts

per gallon 2qt per gallon 2qt

9 110.00 Milestone NO BID $ 277.00 $ 30,470.00 5 oz $ 277.00 $ 30,470.00 3 oz $ 277.00 $ 30,470.00 3 oz $ 311.01 $ 34,211.10 3 oz

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 33% per gallon 7 oz 33% per gallon 7 oz 33% per gallon 7 oz per gallon 7 oz

Award $ 277.00 $ 10,387.50 Award $ 277.00 $ 10,387.50 Award $ 277.00 $ 10,387.50

10 1.25 Opensight NO BID $ 87.50 $ 109.38 1.5 oz $ 87.50 $ 109.38 1 oz $ 87.50 $ 109.38 2.5 oz X $ 83.36 $ 104.20 2.5 oz

Pounds Delivered in 1.25 Pound  Container per   pound per   pound 3 oz per   pound 3.3 oz per   pound 3.3 oz per   pound 3.3 oz

11 180.0 Pendulum 3.3 NO BID X $ 29.00 $ 5,220.00 3.6 pts $ 31.25 $ 5,625.00 2.4 qts $ 32.83 $ 5,909.40 0.5 gal $ 0.00 0.5 gal

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 4.8 pts per gallon 4.8 qts per gallon 1 gal per gallon 1 gal

12 30.0 Pendulum Aquacap NO BID $ 47.00 $ 1,410.00 3.1 pts $ 47.33 $ 1,419.90 2.1 qts $ 47.00 $ 1,410.00 0.5 gal $ 55.36 $ 1,660.80 0.5 gal

Gallons Delivered in 15 Gallon Drums per gallon 50% per gallon 4.8 pts per gallon 4.2 qts 50% per gallon 1 gal per gallon 1 gal

Award $ 47.00 $ 705.00 Award $ 47.00 $ 705.00

13 30.0 Perspective NO BID $ 82.65 $ 2,479.50 3 oz $ 82.65 $ 2,479.50 3 oz $ 82.65 $ 2,479.50 4 oz X $ 78.00 $ 2,340.00 4 oz

Pounds Delivered in 1.0 or 5.0 Pound Containers per pound per pound 11 oz per pound 11 oz per pound 8 oz per pound 8 oz

14A 4.0 Plateau NO BID $ 111.00 $ 444.00 4 oz $ 110.30 $ 441.20 4 oz $ 114.00 $ 456.00 6 oz $ 0.00 6 oz

Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz

OR OR OR OR OR OR

14B 4.0 Panoramic NO BID No Bid NO BID X $ 109.93 $ 439.72 6 oz $ 0.00 6 oz

Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz

15 57.5 Portfolio 4F NO BID $ 560.18 $ 32,210.35 8 oz *X $ 490.00 $ 28,175.00 8 oz $ 503.49 $ 28,950.68 8 oz $ 503.49 $ 28,950.68 8 oz

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 12 oz per gallon 12 oz per gallon 10 oz per gallon 10 oz

16 540.0 Renegade EA NO BID $ 28.50 $ 15,390.00 30 oz NO BID X $ 21.00 $ 11,340.00 1 qt $ 0.00 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 270 Gallon Totes per gallon per gallon 40 oz per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

17 155.0 Renegade EA NO BID $ 29.00 $ 4,495.00 30 oz NO BID X $ 21.00 $ 3,255.00 1 qt $ 0.00 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 40 oz per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

18 3.0 Streamline NO BID $ 92.32 $ 276.96 4.75 oz $ 92.32 $ 276.96 4.75 oz $ 92.32 $ 276.96 5 oz X $ 87.13 $ 261.39 5 oz

Pounds Delivered in 3.0 Pound Container per pound per pound 11.5 oz per pound 11.5 oz per pound 11 oz per pound 11 oz

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

Department Award Recommendation

[$3,903.07]     

Substitution, 

Dicamba Agristar 

Substitution,            

Roll-By 4SC



19 8.0 Telar NO BID X $ 13.10 $ 104.80 0.25 oz $ 14.95 $ 119.60 1/4 oz * $ 14.15 $ 226.40

Ounces Delivered in 8.0 Ounce Container per ounce per ounce 3 oz per ounce NO BID 2.6 oz per ounce per ounce

20 2.50 Tordon 22K NO BID $ 54.00 $ 135.00 0.5 pt $ 49.00 $ 122.50 1 pt X $ 47.56 $ 118.90 1 qt $ 47.56 $ 118.90 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qt per gallon 2 qt

21A 157.5 Vista XRT NO BID $ 164.00 $ 25,830.00 6 oz X $ 119.00 $ 18,742.50 6 oz $ 121.65 $ 19,159.88 6 oz $ 141.76 $ 22,327.20 6 oz

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon 22 oz per gallon 23 oz per gallon 16 oz per gallon 16 oz

OR OR OR OR OR OR

21B 157.5 Fluoxpyr * $ 129.80 $ 20,443.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gallons Delivered I 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon 45.50% Active Ingredient per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon

22A 562.5 Hel-Fire NO BID NO BID X $ 21.69 $ 12,200.63 2 pts / 100 gal $ 28.81 $ 16,205.63 2 pts / 100 gal $ 0.00 2 pts / 100 gal

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal

OR OR OR OR OR OR

22B 562.5 Brimstone NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 23.43 $ 13,179.38 2 pts / 100 gal $ 0.00 2 pts / 100 gal

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal

OR OR OR OR OR OR

22C 3,905.0 LI 7 NO BID $ 12.49 $ 48,773.45 1 pt / 100 gal NO BID * $15.008309 $ 58,607.45 1 pt  / 100 gal 1 pt  / 100 gal

Gallons Delivered in 13 - 275.0 & 11 - 30.0 Gallon 

Containers

per gallon per gallon 4 pt / 100 gal per gallon per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal

OR OR OR OR OR OR

22D 3,905.0 Alligare 7 NO BID NO BID NO BID * $16.458169 $ 64,269.15 1 pt  / 100 gal 1 pt  / 100 gal

Gallons Delivered in 14 - 275.0 & 22 - 2.5 Gallon 

Containers

per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal per gallon 8 pts / 100 gal

23A 1,887.5 Brush-Rhap NO BID * $ 65.00 $ 122,687.50 1 pt X $ 52.00 $ 98,150.00 2/3 pt $ 78.72 $ 148,584.00 1 qt $ 0.00 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon [$112,687.50] 2 pts per gallon 4 pts per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

OR OR OR OR OR OR

23B 2,080.0 2,4-D amine NO BID $ 13.50 $ 28,080.00 1 pt $ 10.40 $ 21,632.00 2 pts * $9.947284 $ 20,690.35 1 qt 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 7 - 265.0 Gallon Totes, 7 - 30 Gallon 

Containers & 6 - 2.5 Gallon Containers

per gallon per gallon 4 pts per gallon 4 pts per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

1072.5 Cruise Control NO BID $50.00 $53,625.00 2 oz * 47.31 $50,739.98 8 oz 53.49 $57,368.03 8 oz $0.00 8 oz

Gallons Delivered in 4 - 265.0 Gallon Totes & 5 - 2.5 Gallon 

containers

per gallon per gallon 4 oz per gallon Substitution, 

Dicamba Agristar 

16 oz per gallon 24 oz per gallon 24 oz

3407.5 Renegade NO BID $28.50 $97,113.75 30 oz NO BID $21.00 $71,557.50 1 qt 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 12 - 270.0 Gallon Totes & 67 - 2.5 

Gallon Containers

per gallon per gallon 40 oz per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

23B Sub-Total $ 178,818.75 23B Sub-Total $149,615.88

OR OR OR OR OR OR

23C 1562.5 Broadrange 55 NO BID $ 34.50 $ 53,906.25 3.2 pts / 2gal H20 NO BID $ 29.50 $ 46,093.75 1 qt $ 0.00 1 qt

Gallons Delivered in 51 - 30 Gallon Drums & 13 - 2.5 

Gallon Containers

per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon 1.5 qts per gallon 1.5 qts

630.0 Cruise Control NO BID $ 50.00 $ 31,500.00 2 oz * $ 47.31 $ 29,805.30 8 oz $ 53.49 $ 33,698.70 8 oz $ 0.00 8 oz

Gallons per gallon per gallon 4 oz

per gallon

Substitution, 

Dicamba Agristar 
16 oz

per gallon 24 oz per gallon 24 oz

1,260.0 Renegade EA NO BID $ 28.50 $ 35,910.00 30 oz NO BID $ 21.00 $ 26,460.00 1 qt $ 0.00 1 qt

Gallons per gallon per gallon 40 oz per gallon per gallon 2 qts per gallon 2 qts

23C Sub-Total $121,316.25 23C Sub-Total $106,252.45

BID TOTAL $ 20,443.50 $ 685,708.92 $ 384,381.98 $ 798,295.44 $ 91,865.18

·

21B: 45.50% Active Ingredient 23A: Math Error Corrected 2: Substitution, Dicamba Agristar 6: Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 3 Container Sizes Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 3 Container Sizes

No Rate Per Acre Supplied Math Error Corrected 19: Price Reflects Product in Minimum Size Container Price Reflects Product in Minimum Size Container

6: Substitution, Round Custom 22C: Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 2 Container Sizes Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 2 Container Sizes

7B: Math Error Corrected 22D: Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 2 Container Sizes Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 2 Container Sizes

8: Substitution, Premium MSO 23B: Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 3 Container Sizes Dollar/Per Gallon is Average of 3 Container Sizes

15: Substitution, Roll By 4 SC for 2,4D amine for 2,4D amine

23B: Substitution, Dicamba Agristar 

23C: Substitution, Dicamba Agristar 

Recommended Recommended Recommended Recommended Recommended

Award Total: Award Total: $ 49,559.80 Award Total: $ 217,594.44 Award Total: $ 27,676.75 Award Total: $ 3,035.62

Sales Tax Included

Exceptions or Information:  * Exceptions or Information:  * Exceptions or Information:  *

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

ONLY ONE OF THE ALTERNATES WILL BE AWARDED

Exceptions or Information:  *Exceptions or Information:  *


