Herbicide Materials 2015

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works
Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 27, 2015

Helena Chemical Company
9519 Vernal Ave. S.E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

BID TABULATION

Crop Production Services
317 West Cashmere Rd

Boise, ID 83702

Alligare LLC
13 N. 8th St.
Opelika, AL 36801

Wilbur-Ellis Co.
P.O. Box 710
Wenatchee, WA 98807

Wilbur-Ellis Co.
P.O. Box 710

Wenatchee, WA 98807
Additional Alternates

Rate/Acre Rate/Acre Rate/Acre Rate/Acre
Item # Quantity  Description Unit Price Amount Min/Max Unit Price Amount Min/Max Unit Price Amount Min/Max Unit Price Amount Rate/Acre Min/Max Unit Price Amount Min/Max
1 25 Agri-dex X $17.00 $42.50 1qt No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $25.95 $64.88 1-4 pints
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon $0.00
Substitution (Competitor)
1052.18 Brush-Rhap (2,4-D at 24.52% &3,6-D at
2 . 18.28%) X $67.00 $130,796.06 1-2qts No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $46.00  $89,800.28 1.6-3.2 pints
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon Substitution (Vengeance Plus) per gallon
3 1 Dyne-Amic $38.37 $38.37 1 gt/ 100 gal H20 | X $32.45 $32.45 1-4 pts No Bid $0.00 $35.45 $35.45 1-2 pints $0.00
Gallon Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon Substitution (SyHac) per gallon
4 1 Edic 2sc X $73.76 $73.76 20z $78.00 $78.00 0.7-4 0z No Bid $0.00 $84.75 $84.75 0.7-4.0 0z $0.00
Quart Delivered in 1 Quart Container per quart per quart per quart per quart per quart
5 61 Edict 2sc X $285.13  $17,392.93 20z $293.00 $17,873.00 0.7-4 oz No Bid $0.00 $311.00 $18,971.00 0.7-4.0 0z $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon
6 20 Esplanade 200 sc 13 $1,038.64 $6,924.27 50z 1/3 $1,038.64 $6,924.27 3.5-70z No Bid $0.00 1/3 $1,038.64 $6,924.27 3.5-7.00z $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon Price good till 2/28/15 per gallon Price good till 2/28/15 per gallon per gallon Price good till 2/28/15 per gallon
7 1.0 Esplanade 200 sc $272.16 $272.16 50z $272.16 $272.16 3.5-7 0z No Bid $0.00 X $276.15 $276.15 3.5-7.00z $0.00
Quart Delivered in 1.0 Quart Container per quart Price good till 2/28/15 per quart per quart per quart Price good till 2/28/15 per quart
8 25 Esplanade EZ $49.00 $122.50 16 0z/1000 Sq Ft||X $40.00 $100.00 8-16 oz/ gal /H20 No Bid $0.00 $46.66 $116.65 16 oz per gallon $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon max year per gallon
5.4 gallon/acre
9 1.00 Frequency $ 745.00 $745.00 80z X $717.00 $717.00 4-16 oz No Bid $0.00 $767.97 $767.97 4-16 oz
Gallon Delivered in 1 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon
10 282.5 Grounded W X $17.40 $4,915.50 1-1.5qts $19.10 $5,395.75 1-4 pts No Bid $0.00 $25.89 $7,313.93 40z $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon Substitution (Crosshair) per gallon
lower rate per acre
11 25 Hardball X $32.82 $82.05 20-32 0z No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $28.15 $70.38 3.2 pint/2gal/H20 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon Lower cost per acre per gallon per gallon per gallon Substitution (Broadrange 5S) per gallon
12 750.0 Hel-fire X $24.73  $18,547.50 1pt No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $2347 $17,602.50 2-8 pts per 100 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Totess per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon gallon of solution per gallon
Substitution (Brimstone)
13 125.0 Hel-fire X $26.38 $3,297.50 1pt No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $23.75 $2,968.75  2-8 pts per 100 $0.00
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers per gallon per gallon per gallon per gallon gallon of solution per gallon
Substitution (Brimstone)
14 6.0 Krovar $9.21 $55.26 10-12 Ibs $9.45 $56.70 6-30 Ibs No Bid $0.00 X $7.85 $47.10 6-16 lbs $9.74 $58.44 6-16 lbs
Pounds Delivered in 6.0 pound containers per pound per pound per pound per pound Substitution (Alligare) per pound Substitution (Bayer)
15 4,800.0  Krovar $9.21  $44,208.00 10-12 Ibs $9.15  $43,920.00 6-30 Ibs No Bid $0.00 X $7.10 $34,080.00 6-16 lbs $9.36 $44,928.00 6-16 lbs
Pounds Delivered in 25 Pound Containers per pound per pound per pound per pound Substitution (Alligare) per pound Substitution (Bayer)
16 2,920.0  Matrix SG $12.87  $37,580.40 4-6 0z X $12.75  $37,230.00 1-1.50z No Bid $0.00 $13.63  $39,799.60 4 oz per $0.00
Ounces  Delivered in 20 Ounce Containers per ounce per ounce per ounce per ounce broadcast acre per ounce




17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

25
Gallons

2,784.0
Ounces

50.0
Gallons

1.25
Pounds

20.0
Gallons

10
Pounds

5.0
Gallons

2,385.0
Gallons

30.0
Gallons

5.0
Pounds

8.0
Ounces

25
Gallons

5.0
Gallons

5.0
Gallons

10.0
Gallons

157.5
Gallons

Bid Total

Milestone
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

MSM, Metsulfuron 60%
Delivered in 16 Ounce Containers

MSO, Methylated seed oil
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Opensight (AKA: aminopyralid)
Delivered in 1.25 Pound Containers

Pendulum (Pendimethalin 37.4%)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Perspective (Aminocyclophrachlor & Chlorsulfu
Delivered in 1.25 or 5 Pound Containers

Plateau (Imazapic 23.6%)
Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers

Round Custom (Glyphosate 53.8%)
Delivered in 265 Gallon Totes

Roundup Custom (Glyphosate 53.8%)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Containers

Streamline
Delivered in 1 Gallon Containers

Telar (Chlorsulfuron 75%)
Delivered in 8 Ounce Container

Tordon 22K (Picloram 24.4%)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Velossa (Hexazione 2.4 LBS 25%)
Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers

Velpar L (Hexazion 2.0 LBS 25%)
Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Containers

Vision (dicamba Acid 40%)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Vista XRT (Floroxypyr 45.52%)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

Department Award Reccommendation

ron

$309.00 $772.50 5-7 0z
per gallon
$2.43 $6,765.12 1-2 0z
per ounce
$10.50 $525.00 1qt
per gallon
$82.00 $102.50 2.5-3.3 0z
per pound
$27.37 $547.40 1 gallon
per gallon
$78.00 $780.00 8-11 oz
per pound
$114.30 $571.50 80z
per gallon
$16.10 $ 38,398.50 26-52 oz
per gallon
$16.56 $496.80 26-52 oz
per gallon
$87.13 $ 435.65 11l o0z
per pound
$17.50 $ 140.00 1-2 0z
per ounce
$43.14 $107.85 1qt
per gallon
$94.30 $471.50 4-5 pts
per gallon
$70.50 $352.50 6-7 pts
per gallon
$105.00 $ 1,050.00 8-10 oz
per gallon
$124.85 $19,663.88 6-10 oz
per gallon
$336,274.46

Excpetions: Early price terminations

Recommended

Award total: ~ $ 223,744.12
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0.4-1.4 pts

per gallon Substitution (Alligare Fluroxypr)
Full case orders only (160 gallons total for $19,ZOOj

$309.00 $772.50 4-7 oz
per gallon
$3.05 $8,491.20 0.1-1
per ounce No identifier for rate i.e. 0z, pts
$12.99 $649.50 1-2 pts
per gallon
$82.00 $102.50 1.5-30z
per pound
$34.70 $694.00 3.6-7.2 pts
per gallon
$77.46 $387.30 3-110z
per pound
$115.80 $579.00 4-12 oz
per gallon
$16.90 $ 40,306.50 0.7-3.5qts
per gallon
$17.25 $517.50 0.7-3.5qts
per gallon
$83.01 $415.05 1.75-11.50z
per pound
$14.67 $117.36 0.25-3 0z
per ounce
$ 45.80 $11450 1/2pt-4qts
per gallon
No Bid $0.00
per gallon
$79.70 $398.50 1-6 pts
per gallon
$60.95 $609.50 2-4 0z
per gallon Substitution (DIABLO)
$132.70 $20,900.25 6-22 oz
per gallon
$187,654.49

Execptions: Early price terminations
Substitutions

Recommended

Award total: ~ $ 46,635.43

$18,900.00
Exceptions: Substitution

Recommended

Award total: ~ $18,900.00

$309.00 $772.50 5-7 oz
per gallon
X $2.27 $6,319.68 0.33-4 0z
per ounce
$13.49 $674.50 1-4 pts
per gallon Substitution (Superspread MSO)
$82.00 $102.50 1-3.30z
per pound 3.3 0z maxl/year
$33.58 $671.60 3.6-4.8 pts
per gallon
1/2 $77.46 $387.30 3-110z
per pound
X $113.50 $567.50 2-12 0z
per gallon 12 oz max/year
$18.63 $44,432.55 1.5-7 pts
per gallon
$19.17 $575.10 1.5-7 pts
per gallon
$86.52 $432.60 4.75-11.5 oz
per pound Delivered in 3 Ib container
$12.81 $102.48 0.25-2.60 oz
per ounce Delivered in 20 oz container
$52.97 $132.43  12pt-2qts
per gallon
No Bid $0.00
per gallon
$70.97 $354.85 1-25gallons
per gallon Delivered in 2.5 gallon container
No Bid $0.00
per gallon
$127.75 $20,120.63 6-22 oz
per gallon
$294,569.86
Exceptions: Early price terminations
Substitutions
Recommended
Award total:  $ 48,602.00
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