Police Vehicles

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, March 11, 2014

Bud Clary Ford of Moses Lake
1140 South Pioneer Way
Moses Lake, WA 98837

BID TABULATION

Legacy Ford
1225 Autoplex Way
Pasco, WA 89301

State Bids
Various Companies

Various trade-in bidders

TRADE-INS:

PASSENGER CARS

#771 - '07 Dodge Charger
w/5.7L V8, auto trans.
#7003 - '08 Ford Crown Vic
w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
#7005 - '08 Ford Crown Vic
w/f4.6L V8, auto trans.
#7010 - '09 Dodge Charger
wi/5.7L V8, auto trans,
#7016 - '09 Ford Crown Vic
w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
#7018 - 10 Ford Crown Vic
w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
#7021 - '10 Ford Crown Vic
w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
#7023 - '10 Ford Crown Vic
w/4.6L V8, auto trans.

PICKUPS

#7006 - '08 Ford F250 4x2 crew cab, 8' box
w/6.4L V8 Diesel,auto trans., 10,000 ib. gvw

#7031 - 10 Ford Ranger 4x4 super cab, 6' box

w/4.0L V8, auto trans., 5,150 Ib. gvw

#ORV - '08 Ford F250 4x4 Crew Cab 6.5' box

w/6.7 V10, auto trans,. 9,600 gvw

Dept. Color
Sheriff White
Sheriff White
Sheriff White
Sheriff Titanium
Sheriff White
Sheriff White
Sheriff White
Sheriff White

Dept. Color
Sheriff White
Sheniff White
Sheriff White

01/03/14

Miieage  VIN
86,763  2B3KA43H3TH771431
91,612  2FAFP71V58X154926
93,146 2FAFP71V78X154930
95,984 2BLA43T69H597642
91,688  2FAHP71V99X137007
109,067 FABP7BV0AX131220
88,983 2FABP7BV7AX131215
105,867  2FABP7BV2AX131218

01/03/14

Mileage VIN

153,539 1FTSW21R78ED93669
86,173 1FTLR4FE9APA49770
111,132 1FTSW21Y68ED80905

Equip
_ltem # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Name No. Amount
Dwayne Lane's Chrysler Jeep Dodge:
1 5 Furnish and deliver No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $27,151.00 $135,755.00
lfull size 4-dr RWD police | Trade-in #7005 Trade-in #7005 Trade-in #7005 nfa Gerald Coulter 7005 $2,510.00]|
pursuit sedan Trade-in #7016 Trade-in #7016 Trade-in #7016 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #7018 Trade-in #7018 Trade-in #7018 n/a Gerald Coulter 7018 $2,751.00|
Trade-in #7021 Trade-in #7021 Trade-in #7021 n/a
Trade-in #7023 Trade-in #7023 Trade-in #7023 n/a Geraid Coulter 7023 $3,110.00
Total $0.00 Subtotal Subtotal $135,755.00
8.20% 9.50% $12,896.73
Total $0.00 Total $148,651.73
Trade-ins only: No
2014 Dodge Charger
Delivery: 120 days ARO
Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB
5 yr/60000 Power Tr
Exceptions: Several
Bud Clary Chavrolet
2 1 Furnish and deliver No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $32,666.00 $32,666.00
[ full size SUV 2WD High Speed | Trade-in #7010 Trade-in #7010 Trade-in #7010 n/a
Pursuit Police Vehicle Total $0.00 Subtotal Subtotal $32,666.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA 8.20% 8.20% 8.30% $2,711.28
Total $0.00 Total $36,377.28
Trade-ins only: No
2014 Chevrolet Tahoe 2WD Police
Delivery: 120 days ARO
Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB
5 yr/60000 Power Tr
Exceptions None
Columbia Ford
3 1 Furnish and deliver : $31,821.77 $31,821.77 | v $31,977.00 $31,977.00 $31,590.00 $31,590.00
| mid size AWD Utility SUV Polic Trade-in #7003 ($3,500.00){ i«  Trade-in #7003 ($3,101.00) Trade-in #7003 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $28,321.77 Subtotal $28,876.00 Subtotal $31,590.00
8.20% $2,322.39 8.60% $2,483.34 8.30% $2,621.97
Total 30,644.16 Total $31,359.34 Total $34,211.97
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No
2014 Ford Interceptor 2014 Ford Police Interceptor Utility 2014 Ford Interceptor AWD Utility
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 120 days ARO
Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB
5 yr/60000 Power Tr; 5 yrf60000 Power Tr 5 yr/60000 Power Tr
Exceptions; Failer to report Exceptions None Exceptions None
warranty service location
No temp gauge
Legacy Ford
4 1 Furnish and deliver $31,094.80 $31,094.80 | v $29,812.00 $29,812.00 $29,255.00 $29,255.00
|'/: ton 4WD crew cab 8' box | Trade-in #7031 ($10,800.00)} |« Trade-in #7031 ($13,601.00) Trade-in #7031 n/a
pickup w/auto trans Subtotal $20,294.80 Subtotal $16,211.00 Subtotal $29,255.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA 8.20% $1,664.17 8.60% $1,394.15 8.60% $2,515.93
Total $21,958.97 Total $17.605.15| Total $31,770.93
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No
2014 Ford F150 4WD Supercab 157" Xl 2014 Ford F150 Crew Cab 4x4 2014 Ford F150 AWD Crew Cab
8' box pickup 6.5' box pickup 8' box pickup
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 120 days ARO
Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB
5 yr/60000 Power T, 5 yr/60000 Power Tr 5 yr/60000 Power Tr
Exceptions: 6.5' box Exceptions. 6 5' box Exceptions None
Legacy Ford
5 2 Furnish and deliver $32,326.70 $64,653.40 | (v $30,568.00 $61,136.00 $30,156.00 $60,312.00
]3/4 ton 4WD crew cab 6.5' box i Trade-in #0771 ($5,000.00) v Trade-in #0771 ($7,601.00) Trade-in #0771 n/a
pickup w/auto. trans. Trade-in #7006 ($10,500.00) v Trade-in #7006 ($9.101.00) Trade-in #7006 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #ORV ($9.000.00) iv/ Trade-in #ORV ($7,101.00) Trade-in #0RV n/a
Subtotal $40,153.40 Subtotal $37,333.00 Subtotal $60,312.00
8.20% $3,292.58 8.60% $3,210.64 8.60% $5,186.83
Total 43,445.98 Total 40,543.64 Total $65,498.83
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No
2015 Ford F250 SRW Crewcab 156" XL 2015 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 2014 4WD Ford F250 XL Crew Cab
6.5' Box Pickup 6.5' Box Pickup 6.5' Box Pickup
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 14 weeks Delivery: 120 days ARO
Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB Warranty: 36 mo/36000 BtoB
5 yr/60000 Power Tr 5 yr/60000 Power Tr| 5 yr/60000 Power Tr
Exceptions: None Exceptions: None Exceptions. None
v = Department award recommendation




