BID TABULATION

Shop Equipment
Grant County Ephrata Auto Parts Ephrata Auto Parts Spokane House of Hose
Dept. of Public Works P.O. Box 756 P.O. Box 756 5520 E. Sprague AVe.
Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, February 12, 2013 Ephrata, WA 98823 Ephrata, WA 98823 Spokane, WA 99212
Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Alternate Bid
1 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid
Vertical/Horizontal Bandsaw
F.O.B. Grant County, WA
2 Furnish and deliver $3,746.32 $3,746.32 $5,337.68 $5,337.68 $4,475.73 $4,475.73
Power Crimp Hose Machine 7.90% $295.96 7.90% $421.68 7.90% $353.58
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $4,042.28 Total $5,759.36 Total $4,829.31
2013 Weatherhead T-402 2013 Weatherhead T-401-110 2013 Gates 707
Delivery: 1 week Delivery: 1 week Delivery: 3 weeks
Warranty: 1 year Warranty: 1 year Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: None listed Exceptions: None listed Exceptions: None listed
3 Furnish and deliver $242.84 $242.84 No Bid $479.75 $479.75
14" Metal Cutoff Saw . $0.00 7.90% $37.90
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $242.84 Total $517.65
2013 DeWalt D28715 2013 Milwaukee 6190-20
Delivery: 2 days Delivery: 3 weeks
Warranty: 1 yr/3 yr Itd Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: None listed Exceptions: None listed
4 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid
Chain Saw Sharpening System
F.O.B. Grant County, WA
5 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid
5' Needle Scaler
F.O.B. Grant County, WA
6 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sorting conveyor, 1.5 hp Rebid required Rebid required Rebid required
F.O.B. Grant County, WA
7 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid
Paint Hose with Retractor
F.O.B. Grant County, WA
8 Furnish and deliver $385.25 $385.25 No Bid No Bid
Fuel Injection Kit 7.90% $30.43
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $415.68
2013 NAPA Service Tool 3467
Delivery: 2 days
Warranty: 1 year
Exceptions: None listed

= Department award recommendation only
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