Miscellaneous Equipment

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, February 5, 2013

Bearcat Mfg., Inc
3650 Sabin Brown Rd.
Wickenburg,AZ 85390

Arrow Construction Supply, Inc.
9915 E. Trent Ave.
Spokane, WA 99206

BID TABULATION

Central Machinery Sales, Inc.
1201 E. Yonezawa Blvd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Mid Mountain Machinery
7916 W Sunset Hwy
Spokane, WA 99224

Cobalt Truck Equip., LLC
4620 E. Trent
Spoakne, WA 99212

Titan Truck Equipment
605 N. Fncher
Spoakne, WA 99212

Lltem # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 3 _Furnish and deliver . $38,240.00 $114,720.00 $46,100.00 $138,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
§250 gal. Asphalt Sealant Melter§ Trade-in #062 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #062 ($4,000.00)
& Applicator Trade-in #067 $1.500.00 Trade-in #067 ($4,000.00)
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $114,720.00 Subtotal $130,300.00
7.90% $9,062.88 7.90% $10,293.70
Total $123,782.88 Total $140,593.70
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: Yes
2013 Bearcat BK250D 2013 Crafco EZ1000 Series Il
Warranty: 1 year Warranty: 12 months
Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Melter: None Listed Melter: List not completed
2 1 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid v $69,151.00 $69,151.00 $74,900.00 $74,900.00 No Bid No Bid
8,000 Ib rough terrain Fork Lift 7.90% $5,462.93 7.90% $5,917.10
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $74,613.93 Total $80,817.10
2013 Case 588H 2013 Lift King LK8M42
Warranty: 12 months Warranty: 12 months/2000 hrs
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 12 weeks
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Fork lift: -No starting aid Fork lift: Cummins 4 cyl engine
+load control incl. limited slip differential
-16.9 x 24 front tires
-14 x 17.5 rear tires
-80 amp alternator
+900 CCA battery
-15000 Ib oper. weight
+4500 Ib lift cap.
Minor items
3 1 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Service Crane Body $19,090.00 $19,090.00; ;v $17,737.00 $17,737.00
Electric Crane $16,200.00 $16,200.00 $18,185.00 $18.185.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $16,200.00 Subtotal $17,737.00
7.90% $1.279.80 7.90% $1.401.22
Total $17,479.80 Total $19,138.22
2013 Knapheide 6132DLR-38J 2013 Knapheide 6132DLR-38J
Warranty: 6 year limited Warranty: 6 year limited
Delivery: 14 weeks Delivery: 8 weeks
2013 IMT 2020 Auto Crane 500SE4
Warranty: 6 year limited Warranty: 2 year
Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 10 weeks
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Body & Crane  None Listed Body & Crane Minor items
4 1 Furnish and deliver No Bid No Bid v $3,100.00 $3,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Small Tilt Trailer 7.90% $244.90
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $3,344.90
2013 Butler TS610D
Delivery: 45 days
Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Fork lift: None listed
v = Department award recommendation

TRADE-INS:

#062 - 2004 Bearcat BK250D Asphalt Sealant Melter Applicator

VIN No. 20903

License No. 70128C Hours as of 1/7/2013: 4,218 hrs

250 gallon capacity insulated sealant tank, 1.124 L 3 cylinder Isuzu diesel engine
with electric start (25+ hp), 325,000 BTU #2 Diesel fired burner., temperature control
(100-450 degrees F.), 1 inch x 20 ft. hose, heating trough, six-foot hose boom works
on either side of the unit, electric trailer brakes, single axle, 235/85R16.5 tires,

24 gallon fuel tank, 2 5/16 X 3 Inch ID pintle/trailer ball combination tongue,

120 volt — single phase electric heating element, block loading conveyor, 15' 2"

trailer length, 5,800 Ib operating weight.

#067 - 2004 Bearcat BK250D Asphalt Sealant Melter Applicator

VIN No. 21003

License No. 70129C Hours as of 1/7/2013: 4,039 hrs

250 gallon capacity insulated sealant tank, 1.124 L 3 cylinder Isuzu diesel engine
with electric start (25+ hp), 325,000 BTU #2 Diesel fired burner., temperature control
(100-450 degrees F.), 1 inch x 20 ft. hose, heating trough, six-foot hose boom works
on either side of the unit, electric trailer brakes, single axle, 235/85R16.5 tires,

24 gallon fuel tank, 2 5/16 X 3 Inch ID pintle/trailer ball combination tongue,

120 volt — single phase electric heating element, block loading conveyor, 15' 2"

trailer length, 5,800 Ib operating weight.
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