Herbicide Materials 2013

Grant County
Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 12, 2013

BID TABULATION

Helena Chemical Company
9519 Vernal Ave. S.E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Alligare LLC
13 N. 8th St.

Opelika, AL 36801

Rate/Acre Rate/Acre
Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Min/Max Unit Price Amount Min/Max.
1 2.5 Agri-dex $17.00 $42.50 1% solution No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
2 2.5 Aquaneat (5 Ib/gal aquatic glysophate) $19.00 $47.50 3% solution No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
3 1 Plateau $115.00 $115.00 8 oz/acre $120.84 $120.84 See label
Gallon Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon **minimum purchase 4x1 gal case
*Panoramic 25L
4 8 Telar $14.00 $112.00 1.5 oz/acre $13.25 $106.00 See label
Ounces Delivered in 8 Ounce Container per ounce per ounce **min purchase 12x20 oz case
*Chlorsulfuror 75
5 2.5 Milestone $299.73 $749.33 5 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
6 25 Tordon 22k (2 Ib/gal picloram) $42.70 $106.75 1 qt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
7 10 Dyne-Amic $38.00 $380.00 1 pt/100 gal No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Container per gallon of water
8 1760.5 MSM $2.37 $4,172.39 2 oz/acre $2.65 $4,665.33 See label
Ounces Delivered in 16 Ounce Container per ounce per ounce
9 100.0 Honcho Plus $14.15 $1,415.00 32 to 64 oz/acre: $15.50 $1,550.00 See label
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon per gallon
*Glysophate 4+
10 4,770.0 Honcho Plus $13.48 $64,299.60 32 to 64 oz/acre $14.75 $70,357.50 See label
Gallons Delivered in 265 Gallon Shuttle per gallon per gallon
*Glysophate 4+
11 5.0 Hardball $29.75 $148.75 24 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
12 210.0 Hardball $29.75 $6,247.50 24 ozlacre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container per gallon
13 250.0 Hardball $29.75 $7,437.50 24 ozlacre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle per gallon
14 350.0 Vista XRT $147.21 $51,523.50 6 oz/acre $128.89 $45,111.50 See label
Gallons Delivered in bulk per gallon per gallon
*Fluroxypyr
15 5.0 Brox 2ec $31.16 $155.80 2 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
16 690.0 Brox 2ec $30.63 $21,134.70 2 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container per gallon
17 205.0 Hel-fire $27.45 $5,627.25 1 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
18 1,750.0 Hel-fire $25.80 $45,150.00 1 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Totes per gallon
19 220.0 Vision $76.92 $16,922.40 10 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
20 4.0 Frequency $766.15 $3,064.60 4 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Container per gallon
21 25.0 Velossa $80.50 $2,012.50 5 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
22 150 Velossa $79.75 $11,962.50 5 pt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container per gallon
23 265.0 Grounded $16.00 $4,240.00 1 qt/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
24 35.0 Perspective $73.60 $2,576.00 8 oz/acre No Bid
Pounds Delivered in 5 Ib. Container per pound
25 500.0 Pendulum 3.3 $27.13 $13,565.00 1 gallacre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon
26 4.0 Esplanade 200sc $264.34 $1,057.36 5 oz/acre No Bid
Quarts Delivered in 1.0 Quart Container per gallon
27 10.0 Esplanade 200sc $981.83 $9,818.30 5 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per gallon*
Bid Total $274,083.72 $121,911.17
*ltem 27: Price increases to $1,018.28 after Bid irregularity: -See label is non-responsive

v = Department award recommendation

Mar. 1, 2013

Awarded total: $274,083.72

Bid irregularity:

Bidder is req'd to list app. rates
-Minimum case purchases req'd




	Page 1
	Page 2
	Page 3
	Page 4
	Page 5
	Page 6
	Page 7
	Page 8
	Page 9
	Page 10
	Page 11
	Page 12

