Dump Trucks

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 8, 2013

Northend Truck Equipment
14919 40th Ave. NE
Marysville, WA 98271

BID TABULATION

Western Peterbilt, Inc.
12976 N Frontage Rd E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Various bidders on trade-ins

ltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Amount
1 Furnish and deliver : Bid Alternate No. 1 Bid Alternate No. 2
Truck chassis 2 Truck No Bid $0.00 Truck $121,713.00 $243,426.00 Truck $125,550.00 $251,100.00 Truck $113,070.00 $226,140.00
Trade-in #1330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #1330 $7,000.00
Trade-in #2160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #2160 $14,600.00
Trade-in #3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3300 $11,000.00
Trade-in #3510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3510 $14,600.00
Trade-in #034 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 Ritchie Bros. Auct. #034 $4,500.00
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $243,426.00 Subtotal $210,100.00 Subtotal $176,140.00 *No bid securities provided with bids
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.20% $19.960.93 Tax 8.90% $18.698.90 Tax 8.90% $15.676.46
Total $0.00 Total $263,386.93 Total SPHRTEIED Total $191,816.46 Moses Lk Auto #1330 $6,056.00
Moses Lk Auto #2160 $4,056.00
Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Moses Lk Auto #3300 $4,556.00
consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: Moses Lk Auto #3510 $21,056.00
Yes____ No___ Yes____ No__X__ Yes__X__ No, _ Yes__X__ No___ Moses Lk Auto #034 $3,156.00
Base Engine: -Cummins ISX 12 Base Engine: Cummins ISX 15 Base Engine: -DD13
Optional Engine: n/a Optional Engine: No Bid Optional Engine: -DD13 ($415.00) Optional Engine: No Bid
Optional Transmission: n/a Optional Transmission: MXP $7000 Optional Transmission: MXP $3,250.00 Optional Transmission: MXP $5,990.00
Furnish, install and deliver: before 1-28-13 before 1-28-13
Chassis equipment:
12-14 cy dump body 2 v Dump $38,460.00 $76,920.00 Dump No Bid $0.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00
12' two-way snow plow 2 v Plow $19,526.00 $39,052.00 Plow No Bid $0.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00
10 cy body sander 2 v Sander $25,362.00 $50,724.00 Sander No Bid $0.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00
Subtotal $166,696.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $153,928.00 Subtotal $153,928.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $13,168.98 Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $13.699.59 Tax 8.90% $13,699.59
Total $179,864.98 Total $0.00 Total $167,627.59 Total $167,627.59
v *($2430) x 2 discount offered for all items *No discounts offered *No discounts offered
Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions:
Truck  No Bid Truck 2014 Peterbilt 367 Truck 2014 Western Star 4900SF Truck 2014 Western Star 4700SF
Eng warranty: Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/Unlimited mi
Trans warranty: Trans warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi
Cabl/chassis warranty: Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k mi Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k
Delivery: Delivery: 10 weeks Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Dump 2013 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump No Bid Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 5 yr limited Unit warranty: 5 yr limited
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Plow 2013 Henke EXP 12 Plow No Bid Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke)
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Sander 2013 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander No Bid Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14 Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options:
Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases:
Chassis No Bid Chassis thru 2014 model year Chassis October 2013 Chassis October 2013
Dump Body 10/01/13 Dump Body No Bid Dump Body June 7, 2013 Dump Body June 7, 2013
Snow Plow 10/01/13 Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow June 7,2013 Snow Plow June 7,2013
Body Sander 10/01/13 Body Sander No Bid Body Sander June 7, 2013 Body Sander June 7, 2013
Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested
on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014
Chassis No Bid Chassis $0.00 Chassis 53,350 for 2015 mode Chassis $3,350 for 2015 model
Dump Body 1.50% Dump Body No Bid Dump Body $1,648 Dump Body $1,648
Snow Plow 1.50% Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow $588 Snow Plow $588
Body Sander 1.50% Body Sander No Bid Body Sander $842 Body Sander $842
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -/ISX-12 450 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed Add $1,150 for 5 yr engine warranty for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: No exceptions listed Add $7,000 for MXP trans v Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty
Sander: No exceptions listed -2700 CCA batteries v Add $875 for 5 yr AT3 warranty +1500 cu in aluminum radiator
Add $7411 for stainless body +18.7 cfm compressor +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator +160 amp alternator
Add $1,400 for 5 yr trans. warranty +Donaldson inside/outside air intake Add $5990 for MXP Trans
10-3/4" x 7/8" frame +160 amp alternator Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty
+27 gal. DEF tank v Add $3250 for MXP Trans 11-7/8"x 4" single frame
+mirrors motorized L & R v Add $420 for ext. trans oil filter w/pump: Frame rail, RBM 3,204k in-lbs
Few minor items 10 weeks Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty Frame ext: RBM 3,204k in-Ibs double rail
v Add $1000 for 5 yr MXP trans. warranty +aluminum front wheels
Bid Error: All new equipment bidders Frame rail, RBM 3,229k in-lbs -13 gallon DEF tank
are required to bid on trade-in equipment Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-Ibs per rail -36" clear chassis sander access
This bid proposal failed to comply with +aluminum front wheels -no corner cab windows
that requirement. -36" clear chassis sander access -5# fire extinguisher
-no corner cab windows Add $225 for ext. sun visor
-5# fire extinguisher Add $100 for optional CD manuals
v Add $225 for ext. sun visor Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
v Add $100 for optional CD manuals inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge +AR400 steel floor
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall -Crysteel T63131 hoist
+AR400 steel floor -box channel members on 12" c/c
-Crysteel T63131 hoist Add $350 for condition sensors light
-box channel members on 12" c/c Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds.
Add $350 for condition sensors light Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure
Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds. Plow: -air/hydraulic controls
Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure -parts, shop, operator's manual as
Plow: -air/hydraulic controls provided by manufacturer
-parts, shop, operator's manual as Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12
provided by manufacturer Sander: -no trap door
Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12 -sander model not provided
Sander: -no trap door Add $980 for trap door
-sander model not provided Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $980 for trap door Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
v = Department award recommendation only

Trade-in Descriptions:

#1330 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Henke two-way 12' snow plow & Monroe 15' body sander

VIN No. 1FDYU90XXMVA25887  License No.15871C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 254

This chassis is equipped with a Monroe 15' sander body, and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#2160 - 1997 Ford LN8000 w/4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher

VIN No. 1FDYR82E1VVA03981 License No0.37848C

Cummins 8.3L 6 cyl. diesel engine (210 hp), Fuller 10 speed RT7608LL transmission, 12,000 Ib.
front axle, 23,000 Ib. single rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
35,000 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 81,¢

This chassis is equipped with a 4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher and Spreader.

#3300 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Heil 10 cy dump body

VIN No. 1TFDYU90X8MVA25886 License No.15877C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 c¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 293

This chassis is equipped with a Heil 10-12 cy dump body.

#3510 - 1998 Peterbilt 357 w/Crysteel 12 cy dump body, Henke EXP two-way 11' snow plow

VIN No. INPALB9X-3-WD446791 License No.43786C

Cat 3406-E 6 cyl. diesel engine (355 hp), Fuller RTLO-14713A 13 speed transmission, 20,000
Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 ¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
54,600 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 236

This chassis is equipped with a Crysteel 12 cy dump body, a Monroe 15' sander body,
and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#034 - 1985 International Harvester Cargostar 1950B-DT466 w/Line Striper

VIN No. 2MTNGUXR3FCB10318 License No. 15824C

International Harvester DT466 diesel engine, 466 CID (210 hp), T448 10 speed transmission,
cabover, one 70 gal. fuel tank, 164" wheelbase, 146" cab/axle, 32,000 gvw, Light Green, 11R22.5 tires
front and rear. Color: Lime Green

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 214

This chassis is equipped with a 3 nozzle Line Striper, an auxiliary John Deere 4239 DF 4
cylinder diesel engine, 325 gallon paint tanks, 2400 Ib glass bead tank, two Vicom cameras with cab
monitor.



Dump Trucks

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 8, 2013

Northend Truck Equipment
14919 40th Ave. NE
Marysville, WA 98271

BID TABULATION

Western Peterbilt, Inc.
12976 N Frontage Rd E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Various bidders on trade-ins

ltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Amount
1 Furnish and deliver : Bid Alternate No. 1 Bid Alternate No. 2
Truck chassis 2 Truck No Bid $0.00 Truck $121,713.00 $243,426.00 Truck $125,550.00 $251,100.00 Truck $113,070.00 $226,140.00
Trade-in #1330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #1330 $7,000.00
Trade-in #2160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #2160 $14,600.00
Trade-in #3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3300 $11,000.00
Trade-in #3510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3510 $14,600.00
Trade-in #034 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 Ritchie Bros. Auct. #034 $4,500.00
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $243,426.00 Subtotal $210,100.00 Subtotal $176,140.00 *No bid securities provided with bids
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.20% $19.960.93 Tax 8.90% $18.698.90 Tax 8.90% $15.676.46
Total $0.00 Total $263,386.93 Total SPHRTEIED Total $191,816.46 Moses Lk Auto #1330 $6,056.00
Moses Lk Auto #2160 $4,056.00
Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Moses Lk Auto #3300 $4,556.00
consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: Moses Lk Auto #3510 $21,056.00
Yes____ No___ Yes____ No__X__ Yes__X__ No, _ Yes__X__ No___ Moses Lk Auto #034 $3,156.00
Base Engine: -Cummins ISX 12 Base Engine: Cummins ISX 15 Base Engine: -DD13
Optional Engine: n/a Optional Engine: No Bid Optional Engine: -DD13 ($415.00) Optional Engine: No Bid
Optional Transmission: n/a Optional Transmission: MXP $7000 Optional Transmission: MXP $3,250.00 Optional Transmission: MXP $5,990.00
Furnish, install and deliver: before 1-28-13 before 1-28-13
Chassis equipment:
12-14 cy dump body 2 v Dump $38,460.00 $76,920.00 Dump No Bid $0.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00
12' two-way snow plow 2 v Plow $19,526.00 $39,052.00 Plow No Bid $0.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00
10 cy body sander 2 v Sander $25,362.00 $50,724.00 Sander No Bid $0.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00
Subtotal $166,696.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $153,928.00 Subtotal $153,928.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $13,168.98 Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $13.699.59 Tax 8.90% $13,699.59
Total $179,864.98 Total $0.00 Total $167,627.59 Total $167,627.59
v *($2430) x 2 discount offered for all items *No discounts offered *No discounts offered
Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions:
Truck  No Bid Truck 2014 Peterbilt 367 Truck 2014 Western Star 4900SF Truck 2014 Western Star 4700SF
Eng warranty: Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/Unlimited mi
Trans warranty: Trans warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi
Cabl/chassis warranty: Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k mi Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k
Delivery: Delivery: 10 weeks Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Dump 2013 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump No Bid Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 5 yr limited Unit warranty: 5 yr limited
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Plow 2013 Henke EXP 12 Plow No Bid Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke)
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Sander 2013 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander No Bid Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14 Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options:
Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases:
Chassis No Bid Chassis thru 2014 model year Chassis October 2013 Chassis October 2013
Dump Body 10/01/13 Dump Body No Bid Dump Body June 7, 2013 Dump Body June 7, 2013
Snow Plow 10/01/13 Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow June 7,2013 Snow Plow June 7,2013
Body Sander 10/01/13 Body Sander No Bid Body Sander June 7, 2013 Body Sander June 7, 2013
Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested
on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014
Chassis No Bid Chassis $0.00 Chassis 53,350 for 2015 mode Chassis $3,350 for 2015 model
Dump Body 1.50% Dump Body No Bid Dump Body $1,648 Dump Body $1,648
Snow Plow 1.50% Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow $588 Snow Plow $588
Body Sander 1.50% Body Sander No Bid Body Sander $842 Body Sander $842
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -/ISX-12 450 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed Add $1,150 for 5 yr engine warranty for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: No exceptions listed Add $7,000 for MXP trans v Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty
Sander: No exceptions listed -2700 CCA batteries v Add $875 for 5 yr AT3 warranty +1500 cu in aluminum radiator
Add $7411 for stainless body +18.7 cfm compressor +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator +160 amp alternator
Add $1,400 for 5 yr trans. warranty +Donaldson inside/outside air intake Add $5990 for MXP Trans
10-3/4" x 7/8" frame +160 amp alternator Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty
+27 gal. DEF tank v Add $3250 for MXP Trans 11-7/8"x 4" single frame
+mirrors motorized L & R v Add $420 for ext. trans oil filter w/pump: Frame rail, RBM 3,204k in-lbs
Few minor items 10 weeks Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty Frame ext: RBM 3,204k in-Ibs double rail
v Add $1000 for 5 yr MXP trans. warranty +aluminum front wheels
Bid Error: All new equipment bidders Frame rail, RBM 3,229k in-lbs -13 gallon DEF tank
are required to bid on trade-in equipment Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-Ibs per rail -36" clear chassis sander access
This bid proposal failed to comply with +aluminum front wheels -no corner cab windows
that requirement. -36" clear chassis sander access -5# fire extinguisher
-no corner cab windows Add $225 for ext. sun visor
-5# fire extinguisher Add $100 for optional CD manuals
v Add $225 for ext. sun visor Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
v Add $100 for optional CD manuals inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge +AR400 steel floor
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall -Crysteel T63131 hoist
+AR400 steel floor -box channel members on 12" c/c
-Crysteel T63131 hoist Add $350 for condition sensors light
-box channel members on 12" c/c Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds.
Add $350 for condition sensors light Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure
Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds. Plow: -air/hydraulic controls
Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure -parts, shop, operator's manual as
Plow: -air/hydraulic controls provided by manufacturer
-parts, shop, operator's manual as Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12
provided by manufacturer Sander: -no trap door
Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12 -sander model not provided
Sander: -no trap door Add $980 for trap door
-sander model not provided Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $980 for trap door Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
v = Department award recommendation only

Trade-in Descriptions:

#1330 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Henke two-way 12' snow plow & Monroe 15' body sander

VIN No. 1FDYU90XXMVA25887  License No.15871C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 254

This chassis is equipped with a Monroe 15' sander body, and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#2160 - 1997 Ford LN8000 w/4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher

VIN No. 1FDYR82E1VVA03981 License No0.37848C

Cummins 8.3L 6 cyl. diesel engine (210 hp), Fuller 10 speed RT7608LL transmission, 12,000 Ib.
front axle, 23,000 Ib. single rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
35,000 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 81,¢

This chassis is equipped with a 4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher and Spreader.

#3300 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Heil 10 cy dump body

VIN No. 1TFDYU90X8MVA25886 License No.15877C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 c¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 293

This chassis is equipped with a Heil 10-12 cy dump body.

#3510 - 1998 Peterbilt 357 w/Crysteel 12 cy dump body, Henke EXP two-way 11' snow plow

VIN No. INPALB9X-3-WD446791 License No.43786C

Cat 3406-E 6 cyl. diesel engine (355 hp), Fuller RTLO-14713A 13 speed transmission, 20,000
Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 ¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
54,600 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 236

This chassis is equipped with a Crysteel 12 cy dump body, a Monroe 15' sander body,
and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#034 - 1985 International Harvester Cargostar 1950B-DT466 w/Line Striper

VIN No. 2MTNGUXR3FCB10318 License No. 15824C

International Harvester DT466 diesel engine, 466 CID (210 hp), T448 10 speed transmission,
cabover, one 70 gal. fuel tank, 164" wheelbase, 146" cab/axle, 32,000 gvw, Light Green, 11R22.5 tires
front and rear. Color: Lime Green

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 214

This chassis is equipped with a 3 nozzle Line Striper, an auxiliary John Deere 4239 DF 4
cylinder diesel engine, 325 gallon paint tanks, 2400 Ib glass bead tank, two Vicom cameras with cab
monitor.



Dump Trucks

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 8, 2013

Northend Truck Equipment
14919 40th Ave. NE
Marysville, WA 98271

BID TABULATION

Western Peterbilt, Inc.
12976 N Frontage Rd E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Various bidders on trade-ins

ltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Amount
1 Furnish and deliver : Bid Alternate No. 1 Bid Alternate No. 2
Truck chassis 2 Truck No Bid $0.00 Truck $121,713.00 $243,426.00 Truck $125,550.00 $251,100.00 Truck $113,070.00 $226,140.00
Trade-in #1330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #1330 $7,000.00
Trade-in #2160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #2160 $14,600.00
Trade-in #3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3300 $11,000.00
Trade-in #3510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3510 $14,600.00
Trade-in #034 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 Ritchie Bros. Auct. #034 $4,500.00
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $243,426.00 Subtotal $210,100.00 Subtotal $176,140.00 *No bid securities provided with bids
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.20% $19.960.93 Tax 8.90% $18.698.90 Tax 8.90% $15.676.46
Total $0.00 Total $263,386.93 Total SPHRTEIED Total $191,816.46 Moses Lk Auto #1330 $6,056.00
Moses Lk Auto #2160 $4,056.00
Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Moses Lk Auto #3300 $4,556.00
consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: Moses Lk Auto #3510 $21,056.00
Yes____ No___ Yes____ No__X__ Yes__X__ No, _ Yes__X__ No___ Moses Lk Auto #034 $3,156.00
Base Engine: -Cummins ISX 12 Base Engine: Cummins ISX 15 Base Engine: -DD13
Optional Engine: n/a Optional Engine: No Bid Optional Engine: -DD13 ($415.00) Optional Engine: No Bid
Optional Transmission: n/a Optional Transmission: MXP $7000 Optional Transmission: MXP $3,250.00 Optional Transmission: MXP $5,990.00
Furnish, install and deliver: before 1-28-13 before 1-28-13
Chassis equipment:
12-14 cy dump body 2 v Dump $38,460.00 $76,920.00 Dump No Bid $0.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00
12' two-way snow plow 2 v Plow $19,526.00 $39,052.00 Plow No Bid $0.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00
10 cy body sander 2 v Sander $25,362.00 $50,724.00 Sander No Bid $0.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00
Subtotal $166,696.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $153,928.00 Subtotal $153,928.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $13,168.98 Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $13.699.59 Tax 8.90% $13,699.59
Total $179,864.98 Total $0.00 Total $167,627.59 Total $167,627.59
v *($2430) x 2 discount offered for all items *No discounts offered *No discounts offered
Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions:
Truck  No Bid Truck 2014 Peterbilt 367 Truck 2014 Western Star 4900SF Truck 2014 Western Star 4700SF
Eng warranty: Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/Unlimited mi
Trans warranty: Trans warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi
Cabl/chassis warranty: Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k mi Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k
Delivery: Delivery: 10 weeks Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Dump 2013 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump No Bid Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 5 yr limited Unit warranty: 5 yr limited
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Plow 2013 Henke EXP 12 Plow No Bid Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke)
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Sander 2013 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander No Bid Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14 Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options:
Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases:
Chassis No Bid Chassis thru 2014 model year Chassis October 2013 Chassis October 2013
Dump Body 10/01/13 Dump Body No Bid Dump Body June 7, 2013 Dump Body June 7, 2013
Snow Plow 10/01/13 Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow June 7,2013 Snow Plow June 7,2013
Body Sander 10/01/13 Body Sander No Bid Body Sander June 7, 2013 Body Sander June 7, 2013
Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested
on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014
Chassis No Bid Chassis $0.00 Chassis 53,350 for 2015 mode Chassis $3,350 for 2015 model
Dump Body 1.50% Dump Body No Bid Dump Body $1,648 Dump Body $1,648
Snow Plow 1.50% Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow $588 Snow Plow $588
Body Sander 1.50% Body Sander No Bid Body Sander $842 Body Sander $842
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -/ISX-12 450 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed Add $1,150 for 5 yr engine warranty for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: No exceptions listed Add $7,000 for MXP trans v Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty
Sander: No exceptions listed -2700 CCA batteries v Add $875 for 5 yr AT3 warranty +1500 cu in aluminum radiator
Add $7411 for stainless body +18.7 cfm compressor +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator +160 amp alternator
Add $1,400 for 5 yr trans. warranty +Donaldson inside/outside air intake Add $5990 for MXP Trans
10-3/4" x 7/8" frame +160 amp alternator Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty
+27 gal. DEF tank v Add $3250 for MXP Trans 11-7/8"x 4" single frame
+mirrors motorized L & R v Add $420 for ext. trans oil filter w/pump: Frame rail, RBM 3,204k in-lbs
Few minor items 10 weeks Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty Frame ext: RBM 3,204k in-Ibs double rail
v Add $1000 for 5 yr MXP trans. warranty +aluminum front wheels
Bid Error: All new equipment bidders Frame rail, RBM 3,229k in-lbs -13 gallon DEF tank
are required to bid on trade-in equipment Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-Ibs per rail -36" clear chassis sander access
This bid proposal failed to comply with +aluminum front wheels -no corner cab windows
that requirement. -36" clear chassis sander access -5# fire extinguisher
-no corner cab windows Add $225 for ext. sun visor
-5# fire extinguisher Add $100 for optional CD manuals
v Add $225 for ext. sun visor Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
v Add $100 for optional CD manuals inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge +AR400 steel floor
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall -Crysteel T63131 hoist
+AR400 steel floor -box channel members on 12" c/c
-Crysteel T63131 hoist Add $350 for condition sensors light
-box channel members on 12" c/c Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds.
Add $350 for condition sensors light Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure
Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds. Plow: -air/hydraulic controls
Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure -parts, shop, operator's manual as
Plow: -air/hydraulic controls provided by manufacturer
-parts, shop, operator's manual as Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12
provided by manufacturer Sander: -no trap door
Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12 -sander model not provided
Sander: -no trap door Add $980 for trap door
-sander model not provided Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $980 for trap door Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
v = Department award recommendation only

Trade-in Descriptions:

#1330 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Henke two-way 12' snow plow & Monroe 15' body sander

VIN No. 1FDYU90XXMVA25887  License No.15871C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 254

This chassis is equipped with a Monroe 15' sander body, and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#2160 - 1997 Ford LN8000 w/4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher

VIN No. 1FDYR82E1VVA03981 License No0.37848C

Cummins 8.3L 6 cyl. diesel engine (210 hp), Fuller 10 speed RT7608LL transmission, 12,000 Ib.
front axle, 23,000 Ib. single rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
35,000 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 81,¢

This chassis is equipped with a 4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher and Spreader.

#3300 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Heil 10 cy dump body

VIN No. 1TFDYU90X8MVA25886 License No.15877C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 c¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 293

This chassis is equipped with a Heil 10-12 cy dump body.

#3510 - 1998 Peterbilt 357 w/Crysteel 12 cy dump body, Henke EXP two-way 11' snow plow

VIN No. INPALB9X-3-WD446791 License No.43786C

Cat 3406-E 6 cyl. diesel engine (355 hp), Fuller RTLO-14713A 13 speed transmission, 20,000
Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 ¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
54,600 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 236

This chassis is equipped with a Crysteel 12 cy dump body, a Monroe 15' sander body,
and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#034 - 1985 International Harvester Cargostar 1950B-DT466 w/Line Striper

VIN No. 2MTNGUXR3FCB10318 License No. 15824C

International Harvester DT466 diesel engine, 466 CID (210 hp), T448 10 speed transmission,
cabover, one 70 gal. fuel tank, 164" wheelbase, 146" cab/axle, 32,000 gvw, Light Green, 11R22.5 tires
front and rear. Color: Lime Green

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 214

This chassis is equipped with a 3 nozzle Line Striper, an auxiliary John Deere 4239 DF 4
cylinder diesel engine, 325 gallon paint tanks, 2400 Ib glass bead tank, two Vicom cameras with cab
monitor.



Dump Trucks

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 8, 2013

Northend Truck Equipment
14919 40th Ave. NE
Marysville, WA 98271

BID TABULATION

Western Peterbilt, Inc.
12976 N Frontage Rd E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Various bidders on trade-ins

ltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Amount
1 Furnish and deliver : Bid Alternate No. 1 Bid Alternate No. 2
Truck chassis 2 Truck No Bid $0.00 Truck $121,713.00 $243,426.00 Truck $125,550.00 $251,100.00 Truck $113,070.00 $226,140.00
Trade-in #1330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #1330 $7,000.00
Trade-in #2160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #2160 $14,600.00
Trade-in #3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3300 $11,000.00
Trade-in #3510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3510 $14,600.00
Trade-in #034 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 Ritchie Bros. Auct. #034 $4,500.00
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $243,426.00 Subtotal $210,100.00 Subtotal $176,140.00 *No bid securities provided with bids
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.20% $19.960.93 Tax 8.90% $18.698.90 Tax 8.90% $15.676.46
Total $0.00 Total $263,386.93 Total SPHRTEIED Total $191,816.46 Moses Lk Auto #1330 $6,056.00
Moses Lk Auto #2160 $4,056.00
Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Moses Lk Auto #3300 $4,556.00
consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: Moses Lk Auto #3510 $21,056.00
Yes____ No___ Yes____ No__X__ Yes__X__ No, _ Yes__X__ No___ Moses Lk Auto #034 $3,156.00
Base Engine: -Cummins ISX 12 Base Engine: Cummins ISX 15 Base Engine: -DD13
Optional Engine: n/a Optional Engine: No Bid Optional Engine: -DD13 ($415.00) Optional Engine: No Bid
Optional Transmission: n/a Optional Transmission: MXP $7000 Optional Transmission: MXP $3,250.00 Optional Transmission: MXP $5,990.00
Furnish, install and deliver: before 1-28-13 before 1-28-13
Chassis equipment:
12-14 cy dump body 2 v Dump $38,460.00 $76,920.00 Dump No Bid $0.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00
12' two-way snow plow 2 v Plow $19,526.00 $39,052.00 Plow No Bid $0.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00
10 cy body sander 2 v Sander $25,362.00 $50,724.00 Sander No Bid $0.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00
Subtotal $166,696.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $153,928.00 Subtotal $153,928.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $13,168.98 Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $13.699.59 Tax 8.90% $13,699.59
Total $179,864.98 Total $0.00 Total $167,627.59 Total $167,627.59
v *($2430) x 2 discount offered for all items *No discounts offered *No discounts offered
Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions:
Truck  No Bid Truck 2014 Peterbilt 367 Truck 2014 Western Star 4900SF Truck 2014 Western Star 4700SF
Eng warranty: Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/Unlimited mi
Trans warranty: Trans warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi
Cabl/chassis warranty: Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k mi Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k
Delivery: Delivery: 10 weeks Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Dump 2013 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump No Bid Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 5 yr limited Unit warranty: 5 yr limited
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Plow 2013 Henke EXP 12 Plow No Bid Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke)
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Sander 2013 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander No Bid Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14 Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options:
Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases:
Chassis No Bid Chassis thru 2014 model year Chassis October 2013 Chassis October 2013
Dump Body 10/01/13 Dump Body No Bid Dump Body June 7, 2013 Dump Body June 7, 2013
Snow Plow 10/01/13 Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow June 7,2013 Snow Plow June 7,2013
Body Sander 10/01/13 Body Sander No Bid Body Sander June 7, 2013 Body Sander June 7, 2013
Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested
on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014
Chassis No Bid Chassis $0.00 Chassis 53,350 for 2015 mode Chassis $3,350 for 2015 model
Dump Body 1.50% Dump Body No Bid Dump Body $1,648 Dump Body $1,648
Snow Plow 1.50% Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow $588 Snow Plow $588
Body Sander 1.50% Body Sander No Bid Body Sander $842 Body Sander $842
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -/ISX-12 450 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed Add $1,150 for 5 yr engine warranty for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: No exceptions listed Add $7,000 for MXP trans v Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty
Sander: No exceptions listed -2700 CCA batteries v Add $875 for 5 yr AT3 warranty +1500 cu in aluminum radiator
Add $7411 for stainless body +18.7 cfm compressor +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator +160 amp alternator
Add $1,400 for 5 yr trans. warranty +Donaldson inside/outside air intake Add $5990 for MXP Trans
10-3/4" x 7/8" frame +160 amp alternator Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty
+27 gal. DEF tank v Add $3250 for MXP Trans 11-7/8"x 4" single frame
+mirrors motorized L & R v Add $420 for ext. trans oil filter w/pump: Frame rail, RBM 3,204k in-lbs
Few minor items 10 weeks Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty Frame ext: RBM 3,204k in-Ibs double rail
v Add $1000 for 5 yr MXP trans. warranty +aluminum front wheels
Bid Error: All new equipment bidders Frame rail, RBM 3,229k in-lbs -13 gallon DEF tank
are required to bid on trade-in equipment Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-Ibs per rail -36" clear chassis sander access
This bid proposal failed to comply with +aluminum front wheels -no corner cab windows
that requirement. -36" clear chassis sander access -5# fire extinguisher
-no corner cab windows Add $225 for ext. sun visor
-5# fire extinguisher Add $100 for optional CD manuals
v Add $225 for ext. sun visor Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
v Add $100 for optional CD manuals inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge +AR400 steel floor
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall -Crysteel T63131 hoist
+AR400 steel floor -box channel members on 12" c/c
-Crysteel T63131 hoist Add $350 for condition sensors light
-box channel members on 12" c/c Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds.
Add $350 for condition sensors light Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure
Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds. Plow: -air/hydraulic controls
Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure -parts, shop, operator's manual as
Plow: -air/hydraulic controls provided by manufacturer
-parts, shop, operator's manual as Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12
provided by manufacturer Sander: -no trap door
Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12 -sander model not provided
Sander: -no trap door Add $980 for trap door
-sander model not provided Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $980 for trap door Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
v = Department award recommendation only

Trade-in Descriptions:

#1330 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Henke two-way 12' snow plow & Monroe 15' body sander

VIN No. 1FDYU90XXMVA25887  License No.15871C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 254

This chassis is equipped with a Monroe 15' sander body, and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#2160 - 1997 Ford LN8000 w/4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher

VIN No. 1FDYR82E1VVA03981 License No0.37848C

Cummins 8.3L 6 cyl. diesel engine (210 hp), Fuller 10 speed RT7608LL transmission, 12,000 Ib.
front axle, 23,000 Ib. single rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
35,000 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 81,¢

This chassis is equipped with a 4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher and Spreader.

#3300 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Heil 10 cy dump body

VIN No. 1TFDYU90X8MVA25886 License No.15877C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 c¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 293

This chassis is equipped with a Heil 10-12 cy dump body.

#3510 - 1998 Peterbilt 357 w/Crysteel 12 cy dump body, Henke EXP two-way 11' snow plow

VIN No. INPALB9X-3-WD446791 License No.43786C

Cat 3406-E 6 cyl. diesel engine (355 hp), Fuller RTLO-14713A 13 speed transmission, 20,000
Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 ¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
54,600 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 236

This chassis is equipped with a Crysteel 12 cy dump body, a Monroe 15' sander body,
and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#034 - 1985 International Harvester Cargostar 1950B-DT466 w/Line Striper

VIN No. 2MTNGUXR3FCB10318 License No. 15824C

International Harvester DT466 diesel engine, 466 CID (210 hp), T448 10 speed transmission,
cabover, one 70 gal. fuel tank, 164" wheelbase, 146" cab/axle, 32,000 gvw, Light Green, 11R22.5 tires
front and rear. Color: Lime Green

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 214

This chassis is equipped with a 3 nozzle Line Striper, an auxiliary John Deere 4239 DF 4
cylinder diesel engine, 325 gallon paint tanks, 2400 Ib glass bead tank, two Vicom cameras with cab
monitor.



Dump Trucks

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, January 8, 2013

Northend Truck Equipment
14919 40th Ave. NE
Marysville, WA 98271

BID TABULATION

Western Peterbilt, Inc.
12976 N Frontage Rd E.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Freedom Freightliner
W. 10310 Westbow Blvd.
Spokane, WA 99224

Various bidders on trade-ins

ltem # Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Amount
1 Furnish and deliver : Bid Alternate No. 1 Bid Alternate No. 2
Truck chassis 2 Truck No Bid $0.00 Truck $121,713.00 $243,426.00 Truck $125,550.00 $251,100.00 Truck $113,070.00 $226,140.00
Trade-in #1330 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) ($6,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #1330 $7,000.00
Trade-in #2160 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) ($5,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #2160 $14,600.00
Trade-in #3300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) ($10,500.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3300 $11,000.00
Trade-in #3510 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) ($24,000.00) Ritchie Bros. Auct. #3510 $14,600.00
Trade-in #034 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 ($4,000.00) $4.000.00 Ritchie Bros. Auct. #034 $4,500.00
Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $243,426.00 Subtotal $210,100.00 Subtotal $176,140.00 *No bid securities provided with bids
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.20% $19.960.93 Tax 8.90% $18.698.90 Tax 8.90% $15.676.46
Total $0.00 Total $263,386.93 Total SPHRTEIED Total $191,816.46 Moses Lk Auto #1330 $6,056.00
Moses Lk Auto #2160 $4,056.00
Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Note:  Bidder agrees to let the County Moses Lk Auto #3300 $4,556.00
consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: consider trade-in offers separately: Moses Lk Auto #3510 $21,056.00
Yes____ No___ Yes____ No__X__ Yes__X__ No, _ Yes__X__ No___ Moses Lk Auto #034 $3,156.00
Base Engine: -Cummins ISX 12 Base Engine: Cummins ISX 15 Base Engine: -DD13
Optional Engine: n/a Optional Engine: No Bid Optional Engine: -DD13 ($415.00) Optional Engine: No Bid
Optional Transmission: n/a Optional Transmission: MXP $7000 Optional Transmission: MXP $3,250.00 Optional Transmission: MXP $5,990.00
Furnish, install and deliver: before 1-28-13 before 1-28-13
Chassis equipment:
12-14 cy dump body 2 v Dump $38,460.00 $76,920.00 Dump No Bid $0.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00 Dump $41,210.00 $82,420.00
12' two-way snow plow 2 v Plow $19,526.00 $39,052.00 Plow No Bid $0.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00 Plow $14,693.00 $29,386.00
10 cy body sander 2 v Sander $25,362.00 $50,724.00 Sander No Bid $0.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00 Sander $21,061.00 $42,122.00
Subtotal $166,696.00 Subtotal $0.00 Subtotal $153,928.00 Subtotal $153,928.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Tax 7.90% $13,168.98 Tax 7.90% $0.00 Tax 8.90% $13.699.59 Tax 8.90% $13,699.59
Total $179,864.98 Total $0.00 Total $167,627.59 Total $167,627.59
v *($2430) x 2 discount offered for all items *No discounts offered *No discounts offered
Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions: Bid descriptions:
Truck  No Bid Truck 2014 Peterbilt 367 Truck 2014 Western Star 4900SF Truck 2014 Western Star 4700SF
Eng warranty: Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Eng warranty: 2 yr/Unlimited mi
Trans warranty: Trans warranty: 2 yr/250k mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi Trans warranty: 3 yr/Unlimited mi
Cabl/chassis warranty: Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k mi Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k Cabl/chassis warranty: 1 yr/100k & 2 yr/100k
Delivery: Delivery: 10 weeks Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Dump 2013 NTE 14-15.5 ST Dump No Bid Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS Dump 2013 Crysteel SLTS
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 5 yr limited Unit warranty: 5 yr limited
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Plow 2013 Henke EXP 12 Plow No Bid Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke Plow 2013 Henderson (add $3274 for Henke)
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Sander 2013 Monroe MSV-180-84-56 Sander No Bid Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14 Sander 2013 Henderson FSH14
Unit warranty: 1yr parts & service Unit warranty: Unit warranty: 1yr Unit warranty: 1yr
Delivery: 120 days Delivery: Delivery: 12 weeks Delivery: 12 weeks
Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options: Extended Purchase Options:
Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases: Final order date for 2013 model purchases:
Chassis No Bid Chassis thru 2014 model year Chassis October 2013 Chassis October 2013
Dump Body 10/01/13 Dump Body No Bid Dump Body June 7, 2013 Dump Body June 7, 2013
Snow Plow 10/01/13 Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow June 7,2013 Snow Plow June 7,2013
Body Sander 10/01/13 Body Sander No Bid Body Sander June 7, 2013 Body Sander June 7, 2013
Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested Additional amounts for purchases requested
on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014 on or before February 15, 2014
Chassis No Bid Chassis $0.00 Chassis 53,350 for 2015 mode Chassis $3,350 for 2015 model
Dump Body 1.50% Dump Body No Bid Dump Body $1,648 Dump Body $1,648
Snow Plow 1.50% Snow Plow No Bid Snow Plow $588 Snow Plow $588
Body Sander 1.50% Body Sander No Bid Body Sander $842 Body Sander $842
Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs: Exceptions/Additions to specs:
Truck: No bid Truck: -/ISX-12 450 diesel engine Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit Truck: +Offered $415.00 credit
Dump Body: No exceptions listed Add $1,150 for 5 yr engine warranty for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins for DD13 engine in lieu of Cummins
Plow: No exceptions listed Add $7,000 for MXP trans v Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty Add $2000 for 5 yr engine warranty
Sander: No exceptions listed -2700 CCA batteries v Add $875 for 5 yr AT3 warranty +1500 cu in aluminum radiator
Add $7411 for stainless body +18.7 cfm compressor +1570 cu in brass/copper radiator +160 amp alternator
Add $1,400 for 5 yr trans. warranty +Donaldson inside/outside air intake Add $5990 for MXP Trans
10-3/4" x 7/8" frame +160 amp alternator Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty
+27 gal. DEF tank v Add $3250 for MXP Trans 11-7/8"x 4" single frame
+mirrors motorized L & R v Add $420 for ext. trans oil filter w/pump: Frame rail, RBM 3,204k in-lbs
Few minor items 10 weeks Add $640 for 5 yr trans. warranty Frame ext: RBM 3,204k in-Ibs double rail
v Add $1000 for 5 yr MXP trans. warranty +aluminum front wheels
Bid Error: All new equipment bidders Frame rail, RBM 3,229k in-lbs -13 gallon DEF tank
are required to bid on trade-in equipment Frame ext: RBM 3,020k in-Ibs per rail -36" clear chassis sander access
This bid proposal failed to comply with +aluminum front wheels -no corner cab windows
that requirement. -36" clear chassis sander access -5# fire extinguisher
-no corner cab windows Add $225 for ext. sun visor
-5# fire extinguisher Add $100 for optional CD manuals
v Add $225 for ext. sun visor Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge
v Add $100 for optional CD manuals inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall
Dump Body: "+double wall 7 gauge +AR400 steel floor
inner wall, 12 gauge outer wall -Crysteel T63131 hoist
+AR400 steel floor -box channel members on 12" c/c
-Crysteel T63131 hoist Add $350 for condition sensors light
-box channel members on 12" c/c Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds.
Add $350 for condition sensors light Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure
Add $350 for pressure sensing hyds. Plow: -air/hydraulic controls
Add $1100 for sealed valve enclosure -parts, shop, operator's manual as
Plow: -air/hydraulic controls provided by manufacturer
-parts, shop, operator's manual as Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12
provided by manufacturer Sander: -no trap door
Add $3274 for Henke EXP 12 -sander model not provided
Sander: -no trap door Add $980 for trap door
-sander model not provided Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $980 for trap door Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
Add $6111 for 201 stainless body
Add $8705 for 304 Stainless body
v = Department award recommendation only

Trade-in Descriptions:

#1330 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Henke two-way 12' snow plow & Monroe 15' body sander

VIN No. 1FDYU90XXMVA25887  License No.15871C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 254

This chassis is equipped with a Monroe 15' sander body, and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#2160 - 1997 Ford LN8000 w/4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher

VIN No. 1FDYR82E1VVA03981 License No0.37848C

Cummins 8.3L 6 cyl. diesel engine (210 hp), Fuller 10 speed RT7608LL transmission, 12,000 Ib.
front axle, 23,000 Ib. single rear axle, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 cfm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
35,000 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 81,¢

This chassis is equipped with a 4 cy Thermolay Asphalt Patcher and Spreader.

#3300 - 1991 Ford LT9000 w/Heil 10 cy dump body

VIN No. 1TFDYU90X8MVA25886 License No.15877C

Cat 3406-B 6 cyl. diesel engine (330 hp), Fuller 13 speed Road Ranger RTO14613A
transmission, 20,000 Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at
2000 rpm, 3 bank control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks
mounted left and right sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 c¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix
AD-9 heated air dryer, 54,400 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 293

This chassis is equipped with a Heil 10-12 cy dump body.

#3510 - 1998 Peterbilt 357 w/Crysteel 12 cy dump body, Henke EXP two-way 11' snow plow

VIN No. INPALB9X-3-WD446791 License No.43786C

Cat 3406-E 6 cyl. diesel engine (355 hp), Fuller RTLO-14713A 13 speed transmission, 20,000
Ib. front axle, 23,000 Ib. rear axles, trans. mounted PTO and pump @ 35 gpm at 2000 rpm, 3 bank
control valve set, 40 gal. hydraulic oil reservoir, two 50 gal. step type fuel tanks mounted left and right
sides, 162" wheelbase, 96" cab/axle, 13.2 ¢fm Bendix compressor and Bendix AD-9 heated air dryer,
54,600 gvw, Color: Red

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 236

This chassis is equipped with a Crysteel 12 cy dump body, a Monroe 15' sander body,
and a Henke two-way 12 ft snow plow.

#034 - 1985 International Harvester Cargostar 1950B-DT466 w/Line Striper

VIN No. 2MTNGUXR3FCB10318 License No. 15824C

International Harvester DT466 diesel engine, 466 CID (210 hp), T448 10 speed transmission,
cabover, one 70 gal. fuel tank, 164" wheelbase, 146" cab/axle, 32,000 gvw, Light Green, 11R22.5 tires
front and rear. Color: Lime Green

Mileage as of 12/18/12: 214

This chassis is equipped with a 3 nozzle Line Striper, an auxiliary John Deere 4239 DF 4
cylinder diesel engine, 325 gallon paint tanks, 2400 Ib glass bead tank, two Vicom cameras with cab
monitor.
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