BID TABULATION

Autos and Pickups
Grant County Bud Clary Chevrolet Legacy Ford Barry Chrysler Dodge Jeep State Bids Various trade-in bidders
Dept. of Public Works 12056 N. Frontage Rd. 1225 Autoplex Way 548 So. Basin Various Companies
Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 29, 2013 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Pasco, WA 99301 Ephrata, WA 98823
Equip
Item # Quantity. Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Name No. Amount
Columbia Ford
1 4 Furnish and deliver 4 $24,550.00 $98,200.00 $24,842.00 $99,368.00 $24,121.00 $96,484.00 $24,241.00 $96,964.00 Randy Martin 632 $1,450.00
Small SUV 4x4 w/auto. trans. 4 Trade-in #632 (81,802.00) Trade-in #632 ($500.00) Trade-in #632 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #632 n/a Lana Shuler 632 $750.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #650 $2,202.00 Trade-in #650 $1,000.00 Trade-in #650 $1,500.00 Trade-in #650 nla
v Trade-in #659 ($3,102.00) Trade-in #659 ($1,850.00) Trade-in #659 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #659 n/a ¢ Sally McLanahan 650 $3,733.33
v Trade-in #662 ($2,902.00) Trade-in #662 ($1,850.00) Trade-in #662 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #662 n/a Randy Martin 650 $1,850.00
Subtotal $90,394.00 Subtotal $95,168.00 Subtotal $91,984.00 Subtotal $96,964.00 Lana Shuler 650 $750.00
8.20% $7,412.31 8.60% $8,184.45 8.20% $7.,542.69 8.20% $7,951.05
Total $97,806.31 Total $103,352.45 Total $99,526.69 Total $104,915.05 Wade Hilliard 659 $2,330.00
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nla
2013 Ford Escape 2013 Ford Escape 4WD 2013 Dodge Journey AWD SXT 2013 Ford Escape
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: None Exceptions Exceptions.
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Northsound Auto Group
2 4 Furnish and deliver v $27,801.00 $111,204.00 $34,045.00 $136,180.00 No Bid $26,404.00 $105,616.00 v Gerald Coulter 735 $3,250.00
4 door RWD full size police sedan Trade-in #735 $1,502.00 Trade-in #735 $2,000.00 Trade-in #735 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA 4 Trade-in #7009 ($2,002.00) Trade-in #7009 (85,000.00) Trade-in #7009 n/a
4 Trade-in #7013 ($2,302.00) Trade-in #7013 (85,100.00) Trade-in #7013 n/a
4 Trade-in #7015 ($1,802.00) Trade-in #7015 ($4,900.00) Trade-in #7015 nla
Subtotal $105,098.00 Subtotal $121,180.00 Subtotal $105,616.00
8.20% $8,618.04 8.60% $10,421.48 8.50% $8,977.36
Total $113,716.04 Total $131,601.48 Total $114,593.36
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nia
2013 Dodge Charger 2013 Ford Police AWD Sedan 2013 Dodge Police Charger
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 3.5 V6 engine Exceptions
6 sp auto
AWD
Legacy Ford
3 1 Furnish and deliver No Bid v $27,973.00 $27,973.00 $31,428.00 $31,428.00 $27,548.00 $27,548.00 Wade Hilliard 783 $1,726.00
Mid size SUV 4x4 v Trade-in #783 ($2,250.00) Trade-in #783 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #783 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $25,723.00 Subtotal $29,928.00 Subtotal $27,548.00
8.60% $2,212.18 8.20% $2,454.10 8.60% $2,369.13
Total $27,935.18 Total $32,382.10 Total $29,917.13
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nia
2013 Ford Explorer 4x4 2013 Dodge Durango 2013 Ford Explorer
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions. Exceptions
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Columbia Ford
4 2 Furnish and deliver $30,155.00 $60,310.00 | v $30,606.00 $61,212.00 No Bid $30,750.00 $61,500.00 v Jenaye Adams 769 $3,505.00
Mid size SUV police 4x4 Trade-in #769 $2,002.00 Trade-in #769 $3,000.00 Trade-in #769 nla Gerald Coulter 769 $1,850.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #7001 ($2,202.00) iv Trade-in #7001 ($3,200.00) Trade-in #7001 n/a Rosaria Hernandez 769 $1,000.00
Subtotal $58,108.00 Subtotal $58,012.00 Subtotal $61,500.00
8.20% $4,764.86 8.60% $4,989.03 8.20% $5,043.00
Total $62,872.86 Total $63,001.03 Total $66,543.00
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: n/a
2013 Ford Explorer 2013 Ford Police AWD Utility Intercept¢ 2013 Ford Police AWD Utility Intercepto
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: Interior Upgrade Exceptions: None Exceptions
package not availabl
Bud Clary Auto
5 3 Furnish and deliver 4 $28,809.00 $86,427.00 No Bid No Bid $29,020.00 $87,060.00 v Josh Savage 738 $4,000.00
Full size SUV police 4x2 Trade-in #738 $1,502.00 Trade-in #738 nla Gerald Coulter 738 $3,450.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA v Trade-in #7004 ($1,502.00) Trade-in #7004 n/a
v Trade-in #7028 ($2,702.00) Trade-in #7028 n/a Rosaria Hernandez 7028 $2,300.00
Subtotal $82,223.00 Subtotal $87,060.00
8.20% $6,742.29 8.20% $7,138.92
Total $88,965.29 Total $94,198.92
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nla
2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions.
Bud Clary Auto
6 2 Furnish and deliver v $31,692.00 $63,384.00 No Bid No Bid $31,423.00 $62,846.00
Full size SUV police 4x4 4 Trade-in #761 ($1,102.00) Trade-in #761 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA 4 Trade-in #784 ($2,002.00) Trade-in #784 n/a
4 Trade-in #7011 ($2,502.00) Trade-in #7011 n/a
Subtotal $57,778.00 Subtotal $62,846.00
8.20% $4,737.80 8.20% $5,153.37
Total $62,515.80 Total $67,999.37
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: nia
2013 Chevrolet Tahoe 2013 Chevrolet Tahoe
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: Manuals WEB base: Exceptions
Bud Clary Auto
7 3 Furnish and deliver v $24,549.00 $73,647.00 $26,017.00 $78,051.00 $23,408.00 $70,224.00 $25,807.00 $77,421.00 ¢ Tom Heilman 638 $7,400.00
1/2 ton 4x4 ext. cab pickup Trade-in #638 $4,002.00 Trade-in #638 $7,000.00 Trade-in #638 $3,500.00 Trade-in #638 nla
w/6.5' box, auto trans v Trade-in #015 ($6,002.00) Trade-in #015 ($6,500.00) Trade-in #015 ($5,000.00) Trade-in #015 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA v Trade-in #501 ($4,502.00) Trade-in #501 ($5,000.00) Trade-in #501 ($5,500.00) Trade-in #501 n/a
Subtotal $63,143.00 Subtotal $66,551.00 Subtotal $59,724.00 Subtotal $77,421.00
8.20% $5,177.73 8.60% $5,723.39 8.20% $4,897.37 8.20% $6,348.52
Total $68,320.73 Total $72,274.39 Total $64,621.37 Total $83,769.52
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nla
2013 Dodge Ram 1500 2013 Ford F150 Ext Cab 4x4 2013 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad 2013 Dodge Ram 1500
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: No CD manuals Exceptions: None Exceptions Exceptions.
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Columbia Ford
8 2 Furnish and deliver v $23,966.00 $47,932.00 $24,663.00 $49,326.00 $25,681.00 $51,362.00 $24,082.00 $48,164.00 Keith Curran 1033 $4,200.00
3/4 ton 4x4 reg. cab pickup 4 Trade-in #1033 ($4,802.00) Trade-in #1033 ($4,500.00) Trade-in #1033 ($4,500.00) Trade-in #1033 n/a
w/8' box, auto trans 4 Trade-in #3050 ($2,002.00) Trade-in #3050 ($1,750.00) Trade-in #3050 ($3,500.00) Trade-in #3050 n/a
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $41,128.00 Subtotal $43,076.00 Subtotal $43,362.00 Subtotal $48,164.00
8.20% $3,372.50 8.60% $3,704.54 8.20% $3,555.68 8.20% $3,949.45
Total $44,500.50 Total $46,780.54 Total $46,917.68 Total $52,113.45
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nia
2013 Ford F250 2013 Ford F250 Reg. Cab 8'Box 2013 Dodge Ram 2500 Reg. Cab 2013 Ford F250
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 12days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: None Exceptions Exceptions
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Columbia Ford
9 2 Furnish and deliver v $32,446.00 $64,892.00 $33,587.00 $67,174.00 $27,940.00 $55,880.00 $28,155.00 $56,310.00
3/4 ton 4x4 crew cab pickup v Trade-in #657 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #657 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #657 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #657 n/a Felimon Torres 657 Irregular
w/6.5' box, auto trans Subtotal $61,892.00 Subtotal $65,174.00 Subtotal $53,380.00 Subtotal $56,310.00 (No forms, no bid security for $1000 bid)
F.0.B. Grant County, WA 8.20% $5,075.14 8.60% $5,604.96 8.20% $4,377.16 8.20% $4,617.42
Total $66,967.14 Total $70,778.96 Total $57,757.16 Total $60,927.42
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nla
2013 Chevrolet 2500 2013 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 2013 Dodge Ram 2500 Crew Cab 2013 Ford F250
Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: Manuals WEB base: Exceptions: None Exceptions. Exceptions
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Alternate Item 9
9a 2 $32,769.00 $65,538.00
Trade-in #657 ($2,500.00)
Subtotal $63,038.00
8.20% $5,169.12
Total $68,207.12
Trade-ins only: No
2013 Dodge Ram 2500 Crew Cab
Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
Columbia Ford
10 1 Furnish and deliver v $37,175.00 $37,175.00 $38,921.00 $38,921.00 $45,878.00 $45,878.00 $38,662.00 $38,662.00
1 ton 4x4 crew cab & chassis Trade-in #3120 $2,302.00 Trade-in #3120 $1,500.00 Trade-in #3120 $3,000.00 Trade-in #3120 nla v Aaron Mickelsen 3120 $3,800.00
w/gas engine, auto. trans., Subtotal $37,175.00 Subtotal $38,921.00 Subtotal $45,878.00 Subtotal $38,662.00 Carol Dawson 3120 $2,173.00
84" CA, 18,000 gvw 8.20% $3,048.35 8.60% $3,347.21 8.20% $3,762.00 8.20% $3,170.28
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $40,223.35 Total $42,268.21 Total $49,640.00 Total $41,832.28
Trade-ins only: Yes Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: nla
2013 Ford F550 2013 Ford F550 Crew Cab 4x4 Chassi 2013 Dodge Ram 3500 Crew Cab 2013 Ford F550
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptio None Exceptions. Exceptions
PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED
v JJ Bevier F&M2 $1,010.00
Sam Dart F&M2 $700.00
Bud Clary F&M2 $502.00
v Keith Curran F&M1 $1,200.00
Bud Clary F&M1 $802.00
v =D award d only
TRADE-INS: PASSENGER CARS Dept. Color Mileage VIN PASSENGER CARS Dept. Color Mileage VIN
01/03/13 01/03/13
#632 -'01 Ford Taurus w/3.0L V6, auto. trans #7013 - '09 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
Youth Services W hite 102,191 i 1TFAFP52U61G208286 Sheriff White 98,750 22FAHP71V09X137008
#650 -'01 Ford Taurus w/3.0L V6, auto. trans #7015 - '09 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
Youth Services W hite 81,939 " 1FAFP52U81G208287 Sheriff White 113,409 22FAHP71V59X137005
#659 - '04 Ford Taurus w/3.0L V6, auto. trans #7028 - 10 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans.
Youth Services W hite 93,594 ' 1FAFP53295A108950 Sheriff White 83,996 22FABP7BV9AX131216
#662 -'04 Ford Taurus w/3.0L V6, auto. trans.
Youth Services W hite 99,196 i 1TFAFP53245A108953 SUVs Dept. Color Mileage VIN
#735 -'06 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. 01/03/13
Sheriff Tungsten 94,212 i 2FAFP71W96X160203 F&M2 -'98 Jeep Cherokee 4x4, 4-door, w/4.0L 16, auto trans., 4,900 Ib. gvw
#738 -'06 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. Facilities & Maint. Blue 175,133 1J4FJ28S5WL249906
Sheriff Tungsten 93,828 2FAFP71W56X160201
#761 -'06 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans PICKUPS Dept. Color Mileage VIN
Sheriff W hite 119,156 i 2FAFP71W86X162766 01/03/13
#769 -'05 Chev. Impala w/3.1L V6, auto. trans. F&M1 -'96 Ford F250 4x2, reg. cab, 8'box, w/5.8L V8, auto trans., 8,600 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 85,498 i 2G1WS551269424533 Red 155,958 1FTHF25H8TLB57516
#783 -'04 Ford Taurus w/3.0L V6, auto trans #015 -'06 Ford F150 4x4 ext. cab, 6.5' box w/4.6L V8, auto trans., 6950 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 83,455 ' 1TFAFP53255A113949 Engineers Red 113,329 1FTRX14W56KC90367
#784 -'05 Chev. Impala w/3.1L V6, auto. trans. #501 -'07 Ford F150 4x4 ext. cab, 6.5' box w/5.4L V8, auto trans., 7200 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 99,864 ! 2G1WF52K459348832 Bridge Red 145,962 1FTPX14VX7FB07294
#7001 -'07 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. #638 - '04 Ford F150 4x4 ext. cab, w/4.6L V8, auto trans., 6250 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 114,725 i 2FAFP71V98X154928 WSU Extension White 96,879 2FTRX18W64CA70313
#7004 -'08 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. #657 -'03 Ford F250 4x4 ext. cab, 8' box w/5.4L V8, auto trans., 8,800 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 106,231 ) 2FAFP71V08X154929 Sheriff White 150,010 1FTNX21L63EC91388
#7009 - '09 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. #1033 - '06 Ford F250 4x2 crew cab, 8' box w/6.8L V10, auto trans., 9,400 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 109,732 {2FAHP71V39X137004 Dist 1 Red 95,511 1FTSX20Y46ED65296
#7011 -'09 Ford Crown Vic w/4.6L V8, auto trans. #3050 - '02 Ford F150 4x2 reg. cab, 8' box w/4.6L V8, auto trans., 6400 Ib. gvw
Sheriff W hite 89,587 {2FAHP71V29X137009 Dist 3 Red 98,491 1FTRF17W22KC62129

#3120 - '00 Ford F350 4x2 reg. cab, Knapheide service box w/5.4L V8, auto trans., 11,200 Ib. gvw
Dist 3 Red 102,883

1FDWF36LOYED95187
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