Miscellaneous Equipment
Grant County
Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, February 7, 2012

Northwest Mfg. & Dist., Inc
2050 Main Street
Billings, MT 59105

BID TABULATION

Mid Mountain Machinery
7916 W Sunset Hwy
Spokane, WA 99224

Northend Truck Equip., Inc
14919 40th Ave NE
Marysville, WA 98271

Clyde/West, Inc.
E 3107 Trent Ave.
Spokane, WA 99202

Central Machinery Sales
1201 E Yonazawa Blvd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Item # Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 1 Furnish and deliver 9 wheel No Bid 4 $62,900.00 $62,900.00 No Bid $66,211.80 $66,211.80 No bid submitted
pneumatic roller 7.90% $4.969.10 7.90% $5.230.73
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $67,869.10 Total $71,442.53
2012 Bomag BW11RH 2012 Volvo PT125
Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: June 15, 2012
Warranty: 12 months Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: None Exceptions: No oscillation
Minor items
2 1 Furnish and deliver 6 cy asphalt 4 $89,000.00 $89,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
patcher 7.90% $7.031.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $96,031.00
2012 Thermo-Lay UD625-120
Delivery: MAy 15. 2012
Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: None
3 6  Furnish and deliver 10" mid-mount No Bid v $17,130.00 $102,780.00 $19,455.00 $116,730.00 No Bid No Bid
truck wing plow 7.90% $8,119.62 7.90% $9,221.67
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $110,899.62 Total $125,951.67
2012 Henke HDPW 10 2012 Henke HDPW 10-H
Delivery: 90 days Delivery: 120 days
Warranty: 12 months Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: None Exceptions: None
4 2 Furnish and deliver rock rake No Bid 4 $6,279.00 $12,558.00 No Bid No Bid $8,254.00 $16,508.00
F.O.B. Grant County, WA 7.90% $992.08 7.90% $1.304.13
Total $13,550.08 Total $17,812.13
2012 York HT 2012 York HT
Delivery: 60 days Delivery: 60 days
Warranty: 12 months Warranty: 12 months
Exceptions: 44 teeth Exceptions: 44 teeth
Minor items Minor items
4 = Department award recommendation only
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