Liquid Asphalt - 2012

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 28, 2012

Western States Asphalt, Inc.
4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

Albina Asphalt
801 Main St.
Vancouver, WA 98660

Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc.

P.O. Box 50538

Idaho Falls, ID 83405

Loltem #  Quantity Description $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount
1 3,000 Min. Furnish MC 800 liquid asphalt No Bid No Bid $850.00 $2,550,000.00 Min.
3,600 Max. at240°F $3,060,000.00 Max.
tons Tax 7.90%
$201,450.00 Min.
$241,740.00 Max.
Total  $2,751,450.00 Min.
Total  $3,301,740.00 Max.
2 As Anti-strip additive at %2% v $20.00 No Bid $22.00
Requested
3 4,400 Min. Furnish HFE 150 liquid asphalt $520.00  $2,288,000.00 Min. $525.00  $2,310,000.00 Min. No Bid
5,300 Max. at185°F $2,756,000.00 Max. $2,782,500.00 Max.
tons Tax 8.70% Tax 7.90%
$199,056.00 Min. $182,490.00 Min.
$239,772.00 Max. $219,817.50 Max.
v Total  $2,487,056.00 Min. Total  $2,492,490.00 Min.
v Total  $2,995,772.00 Max. Total  $3,002,317.50 Max.
Hauler A As Company name: Northwest Tank Lines. Inc. - Pasco Albina Asphalt Johnny B. Transport
Req'd Dispatch contact: Bill Wyman Travid Smith Daniel Luhwick
Dispatch phone: 509-994-3555 888-308-5581 208-773-0563
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 30 tons 32 tons $33.00
Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage
FOB: Ephrata +10 miles $937.50 /load $2,970.00 /load $924.00 /load*
FOB Moses Lake +10 miles $856.50 /load $2,970.00 /load $792.00 /load*
FOB: . ....George +10 miles $956.40 /load $2,970.00 /load $957.00 /load*
FOB: . Royal City +10 miles $977.10 /load $2,970.00 /load $957.00 /load*
Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $80.00 /hour $100.00 /hour $80.00 /hour
*Price offered per ton, shown per load
Hauler B As Company name: No Bid Hot Oil Transport No Bid
Req'd Dispatch contact: Randy Graham
Dispatch phone: 360-303-1140
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 32 tons
Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage
FOB: Ephrata +10 miles $2,970.00 /load
FOB Moses Lake +10 miles $2,970.00 /load
FOB ....George +10 miles $2,970.00 /load
FOB: . oyal City +10 miles $2,970.00 /load
Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $100.00 /hour
Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? No
Product  Plant/address Product Plant/address
HFE150  Spokane Valley Plant - 509-921-0081 HFE150  Albina Plant Product Plant/address
E. 16710 Euclid Ave., Spokane, WA 99202 400 NW Paul Jasa Way, Madras, OR 97741 : i MC800  Post Falls Plant
16425 W Prairie Ave, Hauser, ID 83854
Exceptions/Information: Exceptions/Information: Exceptions/Information:
1. HFE150 volumes not limited None listed 1. Unloading charge $80/hr after 3 hours
2. Price bid includes 0.7% Washington 2. Overnight holdover $350 per night
Hazardous Substance Tax. 3. $250 restocking charge
3. Minimum Insurance limits listed for yard 4. Offer valid for 30 days and confirmed
access by Grant County hauler. for season
4. Fuel surchage schedule attached 5. Fuel sucharge schedule attached
6. $100 charge for job site pump off
per occurrence
v = Department recommendation
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