BID TABULATION

Herbicide Materials 2012
Grant County Helena Chemical Company Crop Production Services
Dept. of Public Works 9519 Vernal Ave. S.E. 18319 E. 11th Ave.
Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, February 14, 2012 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Greenacres, WA 99016
Rate/Acre
Lltem# Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount i
1 195.0 Honcho Plus (EPA #524-454) $9.80 $1,911.00 1st rd- 48 oz/ac: $9.89 $1,928.55 2 pints
Gallons Glysophate 41% or 4 Ib/gal of active ingredient 2nd rd- 64 oz/ac Mad Dog Plus 8 pints
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
2 2,385.0 Honcho Plus (EPA #524-454) $9.43 $22,490.55 1st rd- 48 oz/ac $9.49 $22,633.65 2 pints
Gallons Glysophate 41% or 4 Ib/gal of active ingredient 2nd rd- 64 oz/ag Mad Dog Plus 8 pints
Delivered in 265 Gallon Shuttle
3 375 Hel-fire (patent #6,831,038) $27.45 $1,029.38 3 pints/100 g $19.85 $744.38 1gt/100g
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container Gunsmoke 2 qt/100 g
*Water hardness problem
4 2,000.0 Hel-fire (patent #6,831,038) $25.80 $51,600.00 3 pints/100 g $19.43 $38,860.00 1gt/100 g
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle Gunsmoke 2qt/100 g
*Water hardness problem
5 600.0 Strike Zone DG (patent#5,550,224) $7.00 $4,200.00 60z/100g No Bid
Packs Delivered in 6 Oz. Packs
6 225 Hardball, (EPA #5905-549), $28.50 $641.25 1st rd- 20 oz/ac No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 2nd rd- 27 oz/ag
7 120.0 Hardball, (EPA #5905-549), $28.50 $3,420.00 1st rd- 20 oz/ac No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container 2nd rd- 27 oz/ac
8 2,000.0 Hardball, (EPA #5905-549), $28.50 $57,000.00 1st rd- 20 oz/ac No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle 2nd rd- 27 oz/ac
9 805.0 Vision (EPA #42750-98) $73.00 $58,765.00 10 oz/acre No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
10 524.0 Vista XRT (EPA #62719-586) $147.41 $77,242.84 1strd- 6 oz/ac $148.17 $77,641.08 6 oz/acre
Gallons Delivered in bulk 2nd rd- 7 oz/ac 22 oz/acre
11 19.0 Plateau (EPA #241-365) $125.26 $2,379.94 8 oz/acre v $122.45 $2,326.55 2 oz/acre
Gallons Delivered in 1 Gallon Container 12 oz/acre
12 20.0 Pendulum 3.3 (EPA #241-341) $26.00 $520.00 1 gallon/acre $28.62 $572.40 3.6 pints/acre
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 7.2 pints/acre
13 160.0 Grounded (Patent # 5,906,961) $16.00 $2,560.00 1 quart/acre $31.00 $4,960.00 1 pint/acre
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container Attach 2 pints/acre
14 50.0 Accelerator Spray Adjuvant (Amonium Sulfate) $3.45 $172.50 4 gal/100g $5.00 $250.00 4 qt/100g
Gallons Delivered in 5 Gallon Container Ultra Pro 8 qt/100 g
15 80.0 Telar XP (EPA #352-654) $13.60 $1,088.00 1.3 oz/acre $14.25 $1,140.00 1/4 oz/acre
Ounces Delivered in 8 Oz. Container 2.6 oz/acre
16 5.0 Milestone VM (EPA #62719-537) $299.73 $1,498.65 7 oz/acre v $299.73 $1,498.65 3 oz/acre
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 7 oz/acre
17 30.0 Dyne-amic (CA Reg. N0.5905-50071-AA) $37.25 $1,117.50 1 qt/100g v $13.50 $405.00 1 pint/100 g/ac
Gallons (mso+silcone surfactant with aquatic label) Liberate 8 pint/100 g/ac
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
18 40.0 Perspective (EPA #352-846) $73.60 $2,944.00 5 oz/acre (4 $73.60 $2,944.00 3 oz/acre
Pounds Delivered in 5 Pound Container 11 oz/acre
19 125 EsplAnade 200sc (EPA #432-1516) $981.83 $12,272.88 5 oz/acre v $981.83 $12,272.88 30z
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 9oz
20 20.0 Velossa (EPA #5905-579) $81.00 $1,620.00 5 pints/acre $67.49 $1,349.80 1 glacre
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container Velpar L 4 glacre
*not equal
21 180.0 Velossa (EPA #5905-579) $80.00 $14,400.00 5 pints/acre $67.49 $12,148.20 1 glacre
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container Velpar L 4 glacre
*not equal
TOTAL: $318,873.48 TOTAL: $181,675.13
Award total: 298.660.52 v Award total: 19.447.08
v = department recommendation
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