BID TABULATION

Autos and Pickups
Grant County Legacy Ford Legacy Ford Barry Chrysler Dodge Jeep Bud Clary Chevrolet State Bids Various trade-in bidders
Dept. of Public Works 1225 Autoplex Way 1225 Autoplex Way 548 So. Basin 12056 N. Frontage Rd. Various Companies
Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, January 31, 2012 Pasco, WA 99301 Pasco, WA 99301 Ephrata, WA 98823 Moses Lake, WA 98837
Equip
Quantity D Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Name No. Amount
Bid A Bid B Karmart Automotive Group
Furnish and deliver full size 4-dr No Bid No Bid No Bid v $26,264.00 $157,584.00 $25,245.00 $151,470.00 Gerald Coulter #7177 $2,625.00
RWD police sedan v Trade-in #704 ($4,000.00) Trade-in #704 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA v Trade-in #705 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #705 n/a
v Trade-in #756 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #756 n/a
v Trade-in #767 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #767 n/a
v Trade-in #777 ($3,500.00) Trade-in #777 n/a
4 Trade-in #7014 ($4,500.00) Trade-in #7014 n/a
Subtotal $136,584.00 Subtotal $151,470.00
8.20% $11,199.89 8.20% $12,420.54
Total $147,783.89 Total $163,890.54
Trade-ins only: No 2012 Dodge Charger LX
2012 Dodge Charger Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 100 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Parts/service manuals No Temp gauge
Columbia Ford
Furnish and deliver small SUV 4x4 $24,268.00 $48,536.00 $25,261.00 $50,522.00 iiv $22,581.00 $45,162.00 $26,689.00 $53,378.00 $21,042.00 $42,084.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #612 ($9,000.00) Trade-in #612 ($9.,000.00) i iv" Trade-in #612 ($7,501.00) Trade-in #612 ($11,500.00) Trade-in #612 n/a
Trade-in #676 ($8,000.00) Trade-in #676 ($8,000.00):iv Trade-in #676 ($7,001.00) Trade-in #676 ($8,000.00) Trade-in #676 n/a
Subtotal $31,536.00 Subtotal $33,522.00 Subtotal $30,660.00 Subtotal $33,878.00 Subtotal $42,084.00
8.60% $2,712.10 8.60% $2,882.89 8.20% $2,514.12 8.20% $2,778.00 8.20% $3,450.89
Total $34,248.10 Total $36,404.89 Total $33,174.12 Total $36,656.00 Total $45,534.89
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Ford Escape SE 4x4
2012 Ford Escape SE 4x4 2012 Ford Escape SE 4x4 2012 Dodge Journey SXT 2012 Chevrolet Equinox Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 140 days ARO Delivery: 140 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: 1.6L |4 engine Exceptions: 2.0L 14 engine Exceptions: Part/service manual Exceptions: Parts/service manuals
not included web based
Bud Clary Auto Dealerships
Furnish and deliver full size SUV No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 $30,865.00 $30,865.00 $30,434.00 $30,434.00 Frank Martin #736 $3,000.00
police 4x4 4 Trade-in #736 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #736 n/a Gerald Coulter #736 $2,500.00
F.O0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $27,865.00 Subtotal $30,434.00
8.20% $2,284.93 8.20% $2,495.59
Total $30,149.93 Total $32,929.59
Trade-ins only: No 2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4x4
2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4x4 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions. a No Temp gauge
No Parts/service CD
Bud Clary Auto Dealerships
Furnish and deliver full size SUV No Bid No Bid No Bid 4 $31,890.00 $31,890.00 $31,913.00 $31,913.00 Gerald Coulter #737 $2,050.00
police 4x4 4 Trade-in #737 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #737 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $28,890.00 Subtotal $31,913.00
8.20% $2,368.98 8.20% $2,616.87
Total $31,258.98 Total $34,529.87
Trade-ins only: No 2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4x4
2012 Chevrolet Tahoe 4x4 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Parts/service manuals No Temp gauge
web based No Parts/ser CcD
Columbia Ford
Furnish and deliver full size 15 $30,740.00 $30,740.00 $30,387.00 $30,387.00 No Bid $29,570.00 $29,570.00 $26,496.00 $26,496.00
passenger van 4x2 Trade-in #774 ($4,000.00) Trade-in #774 ($4,000.00) Trade-in #774 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #774 nla
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $26,740.00 Subtotal $26,387.00 Subtotal $27,070.00 Subtotal $26,496.00
8.60% $2,299.64 8.60% $2,269.28 8.20% $2,219.74 8.20% $2,172.67
Total $29,039.64 Total $28,656.28 Total $29,289.74 Total $28,668.67
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Ford E350 Passenger Wagon 4
2012 Ford E350 XLT Pass. Wagon 4x2 2012 Ford E350 XLT Pass. Wagon 4x2; 2012 Chevrolet Express Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 84 days ARO Delivery: 84 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Minor Exceptions: Minor Exceptions: No trailer mirrors.
Parts/service manuals
Bud Clary Auto Dealerships ¥ Sam Engelhardt #007 $3,250.00
Furnish and deliver 1/2 ton 4x4 ext. $25,877.00 $103,508.00 No Bid $23,142.00 $92,568.00 v $24,474.00 $97,896.00 $24,237.00 $96,948.00 Keith Curran #007 $1,001.00
cab 6.5'box pickup w/auto trans Trade-in #007 {$2,600-00); Trade-in #007 154501-60) Trade-in #007 S g Trade-in #007 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #677 ($8,000.00) Trade-in #677 ($6,001.00) i iv Trade-in #677 ($9,000.00) Trade-in #677 n/a Jerry Butler #677 $7,900.00
Trade-in #765 {$1:560-00) Trade-in #765 154:861-60) Trade-in #765 {$2,660-007 Trade-in #765 n/a
Trade-in #3039 ($9,000.00) Trade-in #3039 ($7,001.00) i iv Trade-in #3039 ($11,500.00) Trade-in #3039 n/aiiv/  Ronnie Booth #765 $3,410.00
Subtotal $86,508.00 Subtotal $79,566.00 Subtotal $77.396.00 Subtotal $96,948.00 Rafe Wright #765 $1,500.00
8.60% $7.,439.69 8.20% $6,524.41 8.20% $6,346.47 8.20% $7,949.74 Lanna Shuler #765 $555.00
Total $93,947.69 Total $86,090.41 Total $83,742.47 Total $104,897.74
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab 4x4 Lanna Shuler #3039 $3,003.00
2012 Ford F140 Ext. Cab 4x4 2012 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab 4x4 2012 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab 4x4 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 112 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Elect transfer case Exceptions: Part/service manuals Exceptions: No Temp gauge No Temp gauge
not included Parts/service manuals No Parts/service CD
Bud Clary Auto Dealerships
Furnish and deliver 3/4 ton 4x4 reg $24,818.00 $99,272.00 No Bid v $23,290.00 $93,160.00 $24,984.00 $99,936.00 $23,621.00 $94,484.00
cab 8' box pickup w/auto trans Trade-in #1035 8 Trade-in #1035 8 Trade-in #1035 8 Trade-in #1035 n/faiiv  Sam Engelhardt #1035 $3,250.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #1080 ($4,000.00) 4 Trade-in #1080 ($4,001.00) Trade-in #1080 ($4,000.00) Trade-in #1080 n/a
Trade-in #2120 ($3,000.00) 4 Trade-in #2120 ($3,001.00) Trade-in #2120 ($2,300.00) Trade-in #2120 n/a Keith Curran #2120 $2,000.00
Trade-in #2128 ($3,000.00) 4 Trade-in #2128 ($3,001.00) Trade-in #2128 ($2,300.00) Trade-in #2128 n/a
Subtotal $89,272.00 Subtotal $83,157.00 Subtotal $91,336.00 Subtotal $94,484.00
8.60% $7.677.39 8.20% $6.,818.87 8.20% $7,489.55 8.20% $7,747.69
Total $96,949.39 Total $89,975.87 Total $98,825.55 Total $102,231.69
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Cab 4x4
2012 Ford F250 Reg Cab 4x4 2012 Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Cab 4x4 2012 Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Cab 4x4 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 70 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Minor Exceptions: Part/service manual Exceptions: Parts/service manuals No Parts/service CD
not included web based
Legacy Ford
Furnish and deliver 3/4 ton 4x4 ext. v $26,412.00 $26,412.00 No Bid No Bid $27,823.00 $27,823.00 $25,662.00 $25,662.00
cab 8'box pickup w/auto trans v Trade-in #1003 ($10,000.00) Trade-in #1003 ($11,000.00) Trade-in #1003 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $16,412.00 Subtotal $16,823.00 Subtotal $25,662.00
8.60% $1,411.43 8.20% $1,379.49 8.60% $2,206.93
Total $17,823.43 Total $18,202.49 Total $27,868.93
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Ford F250 Super Cab 4x4
2012 Ford F250 Ext Cab 4x4 2012 Chevrolet 2500 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 70 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Minor Exceptions: P service manuals No Temp gauge
Columbia Ford
Furnish and deliver 1 ton 4x4 crew $36,177.00 $36,177.00 No Bid 4 $34,317.00 $34,317.00 No Bid $36,052.00 $36,052.00 Keith Curran #3070 $3,000.00
cab diesel 8' box auto. trans. pickup Trade-in #3070 ($4,000.00) 4 Trade-in #3070 ($6,001.00) Trade-in #3070 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $32,177.00 Subtotal $28,316.00 Subtotal $36,052.00
8.60% $2,767.22 8.20% $2,321.91 8.20% $2,956.26
Total $34,944.22 Total $30,637.91 Total $39,008.26
Trade-ins only: No Trade-ins only: No 2012 Ford F350 XL Crew Cab 4x4
2012 Ford F350 Crew Cab 4x4 2012 Dodge Ram 3500 Crew Cab 4x4 Delivery: 120 days ARO
Delivery: 70 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Exceptions: No Bluetooth
Exceptions: Minor Exceptions: 10,100 gvw No Temp gauge
Part/service manual
not included
= Department award recommendation only
TRADE-INS: PASSENGER CARS Dept. Color Mileage VIN PICKUPS Dept. Color Mileage VIN
01/03/12 01/03/12
#704 -'07 Ford Crown Vic #007 -'00 Sonoma SLS 4x2 reg. cab, 6' box, 4.3L V6,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff White 86,128 2FAHP71W27X156486 auto trans., 6400 Ib gv Engineers Red 83,964 1GTCS19W 1YK251078
#705 -'07 Ford Crown Vic #677 -'08 Ford F150 4x4 ext. cab, w/4.6L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff W hite 113,652 2FAHP71W87X156489 auto trans., 6950 Ib. g Building W hite 104,504 1FTRX14W98FB59860
#736 - '06 Ford Crown Vic #1003 -'08 Ford F250 4x4 ext.cab, 8' box, w/5.4L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff Titanium 93,768 2FAFP71W06X160199 auto trans., 9400 Ib. g Dist 1 Red 90,923 1FTSX21508ED93667
#737 -'06 Ford Crown Vic #1035 -'03 Ford F150 4x2 reg. cab, 8' box, w/4.6L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff Titanium 96,794 2FAFP71W36X160200 auto trans., 6600 Ib. g Dist 1 Red 84,883 1FTRF17W53NB53244
#756 - '06 Ford Crown Vic #1080 - '04 Ford F150 4x2 reg. cab, 8' box, w/4.6L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff W hite 98,395 2FAFP71W26X162763 auto trans., 6600 Ib. g Dist 1 Red 75,821 2 FTRF17W34CA70306
#765 -'05 Chev. Impala #2120 -'03 Ford F150 4x2 reg. cab, 8' box, w/4.6L V8,
w/3.8L V6, auto trans Central Shop Silver 96,345 2G1WF52K259343886 auto trans., 6600 Ib. g Dist 2 Red 98,539 1FTRF17W43NB46639
#767 -'06 Ford Crown Vic #2128 -'03 Ford F150 4x2 reg. cab, 8' box, w/4.6L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff W hite 94,831 2FAFP7T1WX6X162767 auto trans., 6600 Ib. g Dist 2 Red 95,001 1FTRF17W03NB46637
#777 -'07 Ford Crown Vic #3039 -'09 Ford F150 4x4 ext.cab, 6.5'box w/4 6L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff White 96,445 2FAHP71W67X156488 auto trans., 6850 Ib. g\ Dist 3 Red 87,162 1FTRX14W49FB19333
#7014 -'09 Ford Crown Vic #3070 - '04 Ford F350 4x2 ext.cab, 8" box, w/5.4L V8,
w/4.6L V8, auto trans Sheriff White 113,020 2FAHP71V19X137003 auto trans., 9,900 Ib. g Dist 3 Red 97,065 1FTSX30L74EC96059
SUVs Dept Color Mileage VIN VANS Dept. Color Mileage VIN
01/03/12 01/03/12
#612 - '09 Ford Escape i4x4 #774 -'03 Ford Econoline E350 12 Passenger Van,
w/3.1L V6, auto trans Building White 78,746 1FMCU93G89KB93509 w/5.4L V8, auto trans, Sheriff White 104,721 1FBSS31L93HB10312
#676 - '08 Ford Escape i4x4
w/3.1L V6, auto trans Coop. Ext. White 81,859 1FMCU92Z88KD90634
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