Miscellaneous Equipment
Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, March 1, 2011

BID TABULATION

Snap-on Industrial
P.0.Box 507
Selah, WA 98942

Snap-on Tools
5780 Road N N.E
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Mid Mountain Machinery
7916 W Sunset Hwy
Spokane, WA 99224

Clyde/West, Inc.
E 3107 Trent Ave.
Spokane, WA 99202

Freedom Truck Centers, Inc.
10310 W Westbow Blvd
Spokane, WA 99224

Rowand Machinery Co.
1907 E James St
Pasco, WA 99301

Cobalt Truck Equipment
4620 E Trent
Spokane, WA 99212

Cobalt Truck Equipment
4620 E Trent
Spokane, WA 99212

FMI Sales
11111 E Trent Ave.
Spokane Valley, WA 99206

Evergreen Implement
1415 S First
Othello, WA 99344

Central Machinery Sales
1201 E Yonazawa Blvd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Washington Tractor
731 F Street SE
Quincy, WA 98848

Item # Quantity Description

1 1 Furnish and deliver self-propelled No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,100.64 $32,100.64 No Bid v $35,827.00 $35,827.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
power broom Trade-in #2345 ($3,500.00) v Trade-in #2345 ($8,500.00)
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $28,600.64 Subtotal $27,327.00
7.90% $2.259.45 7.90% $2.158.83
Total $30,860.09 Total $29,485.83
2011 Broce RCT 350 2011 Superior Broom
Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 8 weeks
Exceptions/additions to the specs Exceptions/additions to the specs
None Listed None Listed
Options with prices listed Options with prices listed
2 1 Furnish and deliver 10" mid-mount No Bid No Bid $23,690.00 $23,690.00 No Bid $15,188.00 $15,188.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
snow plow 7.90% $1.871.51 8.70% $1.321.36
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $25,561.51 Total $16,509.36
2011 Henke HDPW 10 2011 Henke HDPW 10
Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions/additions to the specs. Exceptions/additions to the specs
None Listed *Sales tax error shown
3 1 Furnish and deliver 60" ditching No Bid No Bid $5,600.00 $5,600.00 No Bid No Bid $5,715.00 $5,715.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
bucket w/quick hitch 7.90% $442.40 7.90% $451.49
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $6,042.40 Total $6,166.49
2011 PSM 60" Clean Out 2011 PSM 60" Clean Out
Delivery: 5 weeks ARO Delivery: 7 weeks
Exceptions/additions to the specs. Exceptions/additions to the specs
None Listed None Listed
Side Tilt option: $12,675.00 v Side Tilt option: $10,238.00
7.90% $1,001.33 7.90% $808.80
Total $13,676.33 Total $11,046.80
4 1 Furnish and deliver wheel balancer, $4,098.70 $4,098.70 $4,445.00 $4,445.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
motorized Trade-in: Coats 850 ($5.00) ‘rade-in:Coats 850 ($800.00)
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $4,093.70 Subtotal $3,645.00
7.90% $323.40 7.90% $287.96
Total $4,417.10 Total $3,932.96
2011 Sanp-on EEWB403D 2011 Sanp-on EEWB403D
Delivery: 14 days ARO Delivery: 4 weeks ARO
Exceptions/additions to the specs Exceptions/additions to the specs
None listed *Bid lists retail and sale prices
5 1 Furnish and deliver service box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,721.00 $7,721.00 No Bid $7,780.00 $7,780.00 $7,595.00 $7,595.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F.0.B. Grant County, WA 8.70% $671.73 7.90% $614.62 7.90% $600.01
Total $8,392.73 Total $8,394.62 Total $8,195.01
2011 Warner $-108-IM-DW-U 2011 Knapheide 7108J 2011 Knapheide 7108J
Delivery: 65 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions/addi to the Exceptions/additions to the specs Exceptions/additions to the
+limited 5 year warranty None Listed -No amber turn lights
6 2 Furnish and deliver 3 gallon portable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,029.00 $4,058.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
fire suppression system 7.90% $320.58
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $4,378.58
2011 Tri-Max 3 Mini CAF
Delivery: 60 days
Exceptions/additions to the specs.
None Listed
7 1 Furnish and deliver 10 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,793.00 $3,793.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
mounted fire suppression system 7.90% $299.65
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $4,092.65
2011 Tri-Max 10 CAF
Delivery: 60 days
Exceptions/additions to the specs
None Listed
8 1 Furnish and deliver 4x4 all terrain No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,795.26 $12,795.26 $18,992.00 $18,992.00 $16,395.55 $16,395.55
vehicle wlutility trailer 7.90% $1.010.83 7.90% $1.500.37 7.90% $1.295.25
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Total $13,806.09 Total $20,492.37 Total $17,690.80

v = Department award recommendation only

2011 John Deere XUV Gator
Delivery: 4 weeks

Exceptions/additions to the specs

None listed

2011 Case Scout XL Diesel
Delivery: 60 days ARO

Exceptions/additions to the specs

-719 cc 20 hp engine

-25 mph maximum

+CVT transmission

+60 amp alternator

+6.5 gallon fuel tank

2011 John Deere XUV Gator
Delivery: 4 weeks
Exceptions/additions to the specs.

None listed
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