BID TABULATION

Herbicide Materials 2011
Grant County Helena Chemical Company Crop Production Services Alligare LLC
Dept. of Public Works 9519 Vernal Ave. S.E. 18319 E. 11th Ave. 13 N. 8th St.
Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, March 15, 2011 Moses Lake, WA 98837 Greenacres, WA 99016 Opelika, AL 36801
Rate/Acre Rate/Acre Rate/Acre
Item # Quantity. Description Unit Price Amount Min/Max Unit Price. Amount Min/Max, Unit Price. Amount Min/Max.
1 325 Honcho Plus (EPA #524-454) $9.47 $307.78 1strd-48 oz $10.65 $346.13 0.5 quarts/ $10.05 $326.63  See label
Gallons Glysophate 41% 2nd rd- 64 oz 5 quarts Alligare Glysophate 4 Plus
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
2 1,855.0 Honcho Plus (EPA #524-454) $9.05 $16,787.75 1strd-48 0z $10.15 $18,828.25 0.5 quarts/ $8.95 $16,602.25  See label
Gallons Glysophate 41% 2nd rd- 64 oz 5 quarts *Alligare Glysophate 4 Plus (recommend no awar:
Delivered in 265 Gallon Shuttle
3 375 Hel-fire (patent #6,831,038) 50/50 $27.25 $510.94 1 pint v $22.00 $412.50 1q/100g H20 No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container (recommend 1/2 award) *Gunsmoke (recommend 1/2 award) 3q/100g H20
4 2,000.0 Hel-fire (patent #6,831,038) 50/50 $25.75 $25,750.00 1 pint v $21.00 $21,000.00 1g/100g H20 No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle (recommend 1/2 award) *Gunsmoke (recommend 1/2 award) 3q/100g H20
5 200.0 Strike Zone DG (patent#5,550,224) $6.75 $1,350.00 4 0z/100g H2Q No Bid No Bid
Packs Delivered in 6 Oz. Packs 6 0z/100g H20
6 225 Hardball, (EPA #5905-549), $28.50 $641.25 1strd- 20 oz No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 2nd rd- 27 oz
7 180.0 Hardball, EPA #5905-549 $28.50 $5,130.00 1strd- 20 oz No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container 2nd rd- 27 oz
8 2,000.0 Hardball, EPA #5905-549 $28.50 $57,000.00 1st rd- 20 oz No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle 2nd rd- 27 oz
9 565.0 Vision EPA #42750-98 $73.85 $41,725.25 6 0z No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
10 750.0 Vista XRT EPA #62719-586 $151.34 $113,505.00 1strd-7 oz v $146.95 $110,212.50 6 oz/ No Bid
Gallons Delivered in bulk 2nd rd- 9 oz 22 0z
11 19.0 Plateau (EPA #241-365) $131.58 $2,500.02 8oz v $126.75 $2,408.25 20z/ $129.25 $2,455.75  See label
Gallons Delivered in 1 Gallon Container 12 oz Alligare Panoramic 2SL
12 20.0 Pendulum 3.3 (EPA #241-341) $24.90 $498.00 1 gallon $29.00 $580.00 2.4 quarts/ No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 4.8 quarts
13 162.5 Grounded (Patent # 5,906,961) $15.00 $2,437.50 1 quart No bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
14 50.0 Accelerator Spray Adjuvant (Amonium Sulfate) $3.15 $157.50 4g/100g H20 $3.65 $182.50 4q/100g H20 No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 5 Gallon Container 8q/100g H20
15 34.0 Telar XP (EPA #352-654) $14.85 $504.90 150z $15.50 $527.00 0.25 oz/ No Bid
Ounces Delivered in 2 Oz. Container 260z
16 125 Milestone VM (EPA #62719-537) $273.00 $3,412.50 70z $275.00 $3,437.50 3oz/ No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container 70z
17 30.0 Dyne-amic (CA Reg. No.5905-50071-AA) $37.25 $1,117.50 1q/100g H20 No Bid No Bid
Gallons (mso+silcone surfactant with aquatic label)
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
18 11.0 Frequency (EPA #7969-281) $780.00 $8,580.00 40z $794.50 $8,739.50 1o0z/ No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 1 Gallon Container 40z
19 7.5 Velossa (EPA #5905-579) $80.50 $603.75 2 quarts $67.85 $508.87 1gall No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container *Velpar L (recommend no award) 4 gal
20 240.0 Velossa (EPA #5905-579) $79.75 $19,140.00 2 quarts No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container
TOTAL $301,659.63 $167,183.00 $19,384.63
Note: Bid total submitted at $187,170.60.
Corrected total shown above
*Product label restrictions exist *Product label restrictions exist
Award total: $185,654.61 (4 Award total: $134,033.25 Award total: $0.00
= apparent low bid
(4 = department recommendation
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