Fuel Purchases 2011-13

BID TABULATION

Grant County Inland Oil Company, Inc. Coleman Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp. Sun Basin Growers
Dept. of Public Works P.0.Box 1170 335 Mill Rd. 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 1015 E Broadway
Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Ephrata, WA 98823 Lewiston, ID 83501 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Moses Lake, WA 98837
Annual PAD prices PAD prices PAD prices PAD prices
Fuel ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g)
Location Description Usage Terminal  Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal  Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal _ Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes
Hartline Unleaded regular gasoline 8,900 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.08500 $ 26,744.50 Moses Lk Average $275.92 $0.07174 $ 25,195.37 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.13910 $ 25,801.99
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 23,050 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.09000 $ 77,521.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07605 $ 75,116.49 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 76,461.46
Red dye heating fuel 3,450 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.09000 $ 11,603.04 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.12605 $ 11,415.53 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 11,444 .34
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid::*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Ephrata Unleaded regular gasoline 80,000:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 237,600.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 225,519.20 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 221,528.00 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.10100 $ 228,880.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 36,800 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 122,293.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 119,422.99 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 122,348.96 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 121,256.00
Red dye heating fuel 100 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 332.32 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.11239 § 329.52 Spokane Average $323.67  $0.08800 $ 332.47 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 329.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Moses Lake Unleaded regular gasoline 72,200 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.06000 $ 215,156.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 203,531.08 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 199,929.02 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12100 $ 208,008.20
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 48,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.06500 $ 161,568.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 157,067.20 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 160,915.48 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 159,478.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Quincy Unleaded regular gasoline 18,200:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 54,054.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06794 $ 51,453.95 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03350 $ 50,426.74 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 52,507.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 49,800 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 165,495.36 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.07172 § 162,075.10 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 165,903.72 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 164,340.00
Red dye heating fuel 2,100 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 6,978.72 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.12172 $ 6,939.49 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 6,995.94 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 6,930.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Royal Slope Unleaded regular gasoline 11,500:} Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.07500 $ 34,442.50 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06561 $ 32,485.32 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 33,177.50
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 28,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.07500 $ 95,088.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06904 $ 92,352.26 Spokane Average No Bid No Bidi:iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 93,720.00
Red dye heating fuel 650 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.07500 $ 2,176.33 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.11904 § 2,146.20 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 2,145.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid;;*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Mattawa Unleaded regular gasoline 10,700 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.08000 $ 32,100.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92 $0.08589 $ 30,442.46 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.14400 $ 31,072.80
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 6,000 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.08500 $ 20,149.20 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.09081 § 19,641.66 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00  $0.15300 $ 19,938.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid::*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Solid W aste Unleaded regular gasoline 5,600:; Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 16,632.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06979 $ 15,842.34 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00  $0.12700 $ 16,167.20
ULS #2 clear diesel fuel 27,700 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 92,052.64 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07239 $ 90,168.76 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 91,271.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bidi*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Total $ 1,371,989.89 Total $§ 1,321,144.91 Total $§ 928,380.33 Total $ 1,342,928.49
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Fuel Purchases 2011-13

BID TABULATION

Grant County Inland Oil Company, Inc. Coleman Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp. Sun Basin Growers
Dept. of Public Works P.0.Box 1170 335 Mill Rd. 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 1015 E Broadway
Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Ephrata, WA 98823 Lewiston, ID 83501 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Moses Lake, WA 98837
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Fuel Purchases 2011-13

BID TABULATION

Grant County Inland Oil Company, Inc. Coleman Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp. Sun Basin Growers
Dept. of Public Works P.0.Box 1170 335 Mill Rd. 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 1015 E Broadway
Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Ephrata, WA 98823 Lewiston, ID 83501 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Moses Lake, WA 98837
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Red dye heating fuel 100 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 332.32 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.11239 § 329.52 Spokane Average $323.67  $0.08800 $ 332.47 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 329.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Moses Lake Unleaded regular gasoline 72,200 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.06000 $ 215,156.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 203,531.08 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 199,929.02 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12100 $ 208,008.20
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Fuel Purchases 2011-13

BID TABULATION

Grant County Inland Oil Company, Inc. Coleman Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp. Sun Basin Growers
Dept. of Public Works P.0.Box 1170 335 Mill Rd. 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 1015 E Broadway
Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Ephrata, WA 98823 Lewiston, ID 83501 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Moses Lake, WA 98837
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ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 23,050 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.09000 $ 77,521.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07605 $ 75,116.49 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 76,461.46
Red dye heating fuel 3,450 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.09000 $ 11,603.04 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.12605 $ 11,415.53 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 11,444 .34
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Ephrata Unleaded regular gasoline 80,000:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 237,600.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 225,519.20 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 221,528.00 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.10100 $ 228,880.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 36,800 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 122,293.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 119,422.99 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 122,348.96 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 121,256.00
Red dye heating fuel 100 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 332.32 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.11239 § 329.52 Spokane Average $323.67  $0.08800 $ 332.47 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 329.50
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Moses Lake Unleaded regular gasoline 72,200 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.06000 $ 215,156.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 203,531.08 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 199,929.02 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12100 $ 208,008.20
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 48,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.06500 $ 161,568.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 157,067.20 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 160,915.48 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 159,478.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Quincy Unleaded regular gasoline 18,200:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 54,054.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06794 $ 51,453.95 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03350 $ 50,426.74 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 52,507.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 49,800 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 165,495.36 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.07172 § 162,075.10 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 165,903.72 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 164,340.00
Red dye heating fuel 2,100 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 6,978.72 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.12172 $ 6,939.49 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 6,995.94 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 6,930.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Royal Slope Unleaded regular gasoline 11,500:} Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.07500 $ 34,442.50 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06561 $ 32,485.32 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 33,177.50
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 28,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.07500 $ 95,088.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06904 $ 92,352.26 Spokane Average No Bid No Bidi:iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 93,720.00
Red dye heating fuel 650 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.07500 $ 2,176.33 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.11904 § 2,146.20 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 2,145.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid;;*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Mattawa Unleaded regular gasoline 10,700 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.08000 $ 32,100.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92 $0.08589 $ 30,442.46 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.14400 $ 31,072.80
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 6,000 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.08500 $ 20,149.20 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.09081 § 19,641.66 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00  $0.15300 $ 19,938.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid::*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Solid W aste Unleaded regular gasoline 5,600:; Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 16,632.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06979 $ 15,842.34 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00  $0.12700 $ 16,167.20
ULS #2 clear diesel fuel 27,700 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 92,052.64 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07239 $ 90,168.76 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 91,271.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bidi*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Total $ 1,371,989.89 Total $§ 1,321,144.91 Total $§ 928,380.33 Total $ 1,342,928.49

v =Department recomendation

*winter blend

*winter blend

*winter blend
Note: Received two bids from this company that appear to be

identical

*winter blend




Fuel Purchases 2011-13

BID TABULATION

Grant County Inland Oil Company, Inc. Coleman Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp. Sun Basin Growers
Dept. of Public Works P.0.Box 1170 335 Mill Rd. 7120 Pointe Inverness Way 1015 E Broadway
Bid Opening: 2:15 P.M. Tuesday, February 22, 2011 Ephrata, WA 98823 Lewiston, ID 83501 Fort Wayne, IN 46804 Moses Lake, WA 98837
Annual PAD prices PAD prices PAD prices PAD prices
Fuel ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g) ($/cwt) reported  ($/g) Bid Delivery ($/g)
Location Description Usage Terminal  Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal  Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal _ Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes Terminal Brand 3/3/11 Margin before taxes
Hartline Unleaded regular gasoline 8,900 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.08500 $ 26,744.50 Moses Lk Average $275.92 $0.07174 $ 25,195.37 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.13910 $ 25,801.99
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 23,050 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.09000 $ 77,521.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07605 $ 75,116.49 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 76,461.46
Red dye heating fuel 3,450 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.09000 $ 11,603.04 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.12605 $ 11,415.53 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.14720 $ 11,444 .34
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid::*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Ephrata Unleaded regular gasoline 80,000:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 237,600.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 225,519.20 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 221,528.00 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.10100 $ 228,880.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 36,800 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 122,293.76 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 119,422.99 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 122,348.96 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 121,256.00
Red dye heating fuel 100 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 332.32 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.11239 § 329.52 Spokane Average $323.67  $0.08800 $ 332.47 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 329.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Moses Lake Unleaded regular gasoline 72,200 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.06000 $ 215,156.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.05979 $§ 203,531.08 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03190 $§ 199,929.02 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12100 $ 208,008.20
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 48,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.06500 $ 161,568.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06239 $ 157,067.20 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.08800 $ 160,915.48 iiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 159,478.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Quincy Unleaded regular gasoline 18,200:: Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 54,054.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06794 $ 51,453.95 Spokane Average $273.72  $0.03350 $ 50,426.74 iiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 52,507.00
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 49,800 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.05000 $ 165,495.36 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.07172 § 162,075.10 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 165,903.72 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 164,340.00
Red dye heating fuel 2,100 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 6,978.72 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.12172 $ 6,939.49 Spokane Average $323.67 $0.09470 $ 6,995.94 :iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 6,930.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.06500 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Royal Slope Unleaded regular gasoline 11,500:} Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.07500 $ 34,442.50 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06561 $ 32,485.32 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.12500 $ 33,177.50
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 28,400 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.07500 $ 95,088.88 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.06904 $ 92,352.26 Spokane Average No Bid No Bidi:iMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 93,720.00
Red dye heating fuel 650 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.07500 $ 2,176.33 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.11904 § 2,146.20 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.13000 $ 2,145.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid;;*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Mattawa Unleaded regular gasoline 10,700 Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.08000 $ 32,100.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92 $0.08589 $ 30,442.46 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00 $0.14400 $ 31,072.80
ULS #2 red dye diesel fuel 6,000 Pasco Shell $327.32  $0.08500 $ 20,149.20 Moses Lk Average $318.28  $0.09081 § 19,641.66 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00  $0.15300 $ 19,938.00
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bid::*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Solid W aste Unleaded regular gasoline 5,600:; Seattle Shell $292.00 $0.05000 $ 16,632.00 Moses Lk Average $275.92  $0.06979 $ 15,842.34 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $276.00  $0.12700 $ 16,167.20
ULS #2 clear diesel fuel 27,700 Pasco Shell $327.32 $0.05000 $ 92,052.64 Moses Lk Average $318.28 $0.07239 $ 90,168.76 Spokane Average No Bid No BidiiMoses Lk Cenex $317.00 $0.12500 $ 91,271.50
*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.08000 *Winterized ULS #2 premium No Bid No Bidi*Winterized ULS #2 premium $0.12000
Total $ 1,371,989.89 Total $§ 1,321,144.91 Total $§ 928,380.33 Total $ 1,342,928.49

v =Department recomendation

*winter blend

*winter blend

*winter blend
Note: Received two bids from this company that appear to be

identical

*winter blend
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