
QUOTE TABULATION

Quantity

Culvert Pipe
James Pipe & Supply Inc.Pacific Corrugated Pipe Co.Contec Construction ProductsGrant County 

P.O. Box 59389822 Hwy 99 N2823 S Craig Rd.Dept. of Public Works

Ridgefeild, WA  98642Eugene, OR 97402Airway Heights, WA  99001Quote Date:  5:00 P.M. Thursday, February 25, 2011 

AmountUnit PriceAmountUnit PriceAmountUnit PriceDescriptionItem #

Dist 1:  Furnish and deliver culvert pipe & bands (509) 754-6586

FOB Grant County Shop, 124 Enterprise St. SE, Ephrata, WA 

No bid$1,509.60$251.60$1,296.00$216.00pieces618" x 20 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP1

No bid$75.69$25.23$45.36$15.12bands318" galvanized annular coupling bands w/bolts & nuts2

No bid$60.99$20.33$45.36$15.12bands318" galvanized dimple coupling bands w/bolts & nuts3

No bid$1,329.60$332.40$1,094.40$273.60pieces424" x 20 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP4

No bid$118.16$29.54$76.60$19.15bands424" galvanized annular coupling bands w/bolts & nuts5

No bid$830.40$415.20$691.20$345.60pieces230" x 20 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP6

No bid$67.72$33.86$48.38$24.19bands230" galvanized annular coupling bands w/bolts & nuts7

Dist 2:  Furnish and deliver culvert pipe & bands  (509) 765-4172

FOB Grant County Shop, 12171 Road 3 NE, Moses Lake, WA 

No bid$2,516.00$251.60$2,160.00$216.00pieces1018" x 20 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP8

No bid$203.30$20.33$151.20$15.12bands1018" galvanized dimple coupling bands w/bolts & nuts9

Dist 3:  Furnish and deliver culvert pipe & bands (509) 7872321

FOB Grant County Shop, 4718 Road P NW, Quincy, WA 

No bid$3,384.00$169.20$3,744.00$187.20pieces2012" x 26 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP10

No bid$522.90$17.43$302.40$10.08pieces3012" galvanized dimple coupling bands w/bolts & nuts11

No bid$5,032.00$251.60$5,616.00$280.80bands2018" x 26 ft., 16 gage galvanized CMP12

No bid$609.90$20.33$453.60$15.12bands3018" galvanized dimple coupling bands w/bolts & nuts13

Bridge:  Furnish and deliver culvert pipe & bands  (509) 754-6082

FOB Grant County Shop, 12171 Road 3 NE, Moses Lake, WA 

No items

$16,260.26$15,724.50Subtotal

$1,284.567.90%$1,242.247.90%Sales Tax

$17,544.82$16,966.74UTotal

2 weeks ARODelivery:No info Delivery:

Bid error:  Bid amounts  for 

Items 10 and 13 shown corrected

DepartmentawardU


	Page 1

