Tractor w/boom mower

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M. Tuesday, Feb. 15, 2011

Rathbone Sales, Inc.
P.O. Box 866
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Rathbone Sales, Inc.
P.O. Box 866
Moses Lake, WA 98837

BID TABULATION

Evergreen Implement
1415 S First
Othello, WA 99344

Washington Tractor
830 Evergreen St
Lynden, WA 98264

Evergreen Implement
1415 S First
Othello, WA 99344

Washington Tractor
830 Evergreen St
Lynden, WA 98264

Washington Tractor
830 Evergreen St
Lynden, WA 98264

US Mower
11949 Westar Ln.
Burlington, WA 98233

ltem # Quantity Description

1 3 Furnish and deliver tractor with
boom mower

F.0.B. Grant County, WA

v = Department award recommendation only

Bid Alternate #2

$150,961.00 $452,883.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $392,883.00

7.90% $31.037.76

Total $423,920.76

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH

Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Standard Cab w/AC
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Ill
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
+Creeper 4:1 > net gears 48x48 F/R
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tireg
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 212"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Bid Alternate #1

$153,461.00 $460,383.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $400,383.00
7.90% $31.630.26

Totall $432,013.26

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower
TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Luxury Cab incl. AC, rear wipers
& washer, pneumatice cab suspension,
block heater, power access
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Il
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires:
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tire
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"
+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 25'2"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Base Bid Tractor ONLY

$104,314.00 $312,942.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $258,942.00
7.90% $20.,456.42

Total $279,398.42

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-Creeper not available

-Turf tires not available

LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$279,398.42

Total [ $437,642.40 |

Base Bid for Tractor and Mower
$149,357.00 $448,071.00
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)

Subtotal $412,071.00
7.90% $32,653.61
Total $444,624.61

2011 John Deere 7330 Tractor
Alamo Maverick 30' telescoping boom
Delivery: 150 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-ComfortGard Cab only

-155 hp engine

-18.4R-38 R1 rear radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-14.9R-28 R1 front radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-No auto de-clutch function
-8800 Ib 3-pt hitch capacity
-Standard exhaust

-Seat swival adjustment 15° r & |
-No wheel weights

MOWER exceptions/additions:
+30' boom

+Boom swing arc 180 °

+Min. reach tractor C/L 27'10"
+Min. reach out @90° 30'
+Min. reach below tractor 19'3"
-18 gal. hydraulic oil reservior

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$116,675.00 $350,025.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $296,025.00

7.90% $23,385.98

Total $319,410.98

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

+30.5L-32 Turf tires mounted & installed
+18.4L-26 Turf tires mounted & installed
LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$319,410.98

Total I $477,654.96 |

Alternate Bid #2 Tractor ONLY

$112,139.27 $336,417.81
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $300,417.81
7.90% $23.733.01

Total $324,150.82

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11, 2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:

-No creeper with Power Quad trans.
-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
-Add $3,510 for turf tires

-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
-Add $4,824 for turf tires

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$324,150.82

Total [ $482,394.80 |

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$119,092.52 $357,277.56
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $321,277.56
7.90% $25.380.93

Total $346,658.49

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11,2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-38 Turf tires included
-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-26 Turf tires included

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$346,658.49

Total I $504,902.47'

Base Bid Mower ONLY

$48,886.00 $146,658.00
Trade-in #1660 no bid
Trade-in #2660 no bid
Trade-in #3620 no bid
Subtotal $146,658.00

7.90% $11.585.98

Total $158,243.98

No Tractor bid
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 75 days tractor

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $5,944.00
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Evergreen Implement
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Othello, WA 99344

Washington Tractor
830 Evergreen St
Lynden, WA 98264

Washington Tractor
830 Evergreen St
Lynden, WA 98264

US Mower
11949 Westar Ln.
Burlington, WA 98233

ltem # Quantity Description

1 3 Furnish and deliver tractor with
boom mower

F.0.B. Grant County, WA

v = Department award recommendation only

Bid Alternate #2

$150,961.00 $452,883.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $392,883.00

7.90% $31.037.76

Total $423,920.76

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH

Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Standard Cab w/AC
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Ill
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
+Creeper 4:1 > net gears 48x48 F/R
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tireg
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 212"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Bid Alternate #1

$153,461.00 $460,383.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $400,383.00
7.90% $31.630.26

Totall $432,013.26

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower
TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Luxury Cab incl. AC, rear wipers
& washer, pneumatice cab suspension,
block heater, power access
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Il
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires:
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tire
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"
+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 25'2"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Base Bid Tractor ONLY

$104,314.00 $312,942.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $258,942.00
7.90% $20.,456.42

Total $279,398.42

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-Creeper not available

-Turf tires not available

LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$279,398.42

Total [ $437,642.40 |

Base Bid for Tractor and Mower
$149,357.00 $448,071.00
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)

Subtotal $412,071.00
7.90% $32,653.61
Total $444,624.61

2011 John Deere 7330 Tractor
Alamo Maverick 30' telescoping boom
Delivery: 150 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-ComfortGard Cab only

-155 hp engine

-18.4R-38 R1 rear radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-14.9R-28 R1 front radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-No auto de-clutch function
-8800 Ib 3-pt hitch capacity
-Standard exhaust

-Seat swival adjustment 15° r & |
-No wheel weights

MOWER exceptions/additions:
+30' boom

+Boom swing arc 180 °

+Min. reach tractor C/L 27'10"
+Min. reach out @90° 30'
+Min. reach below tractor 19'3"
-18 gal. hydraulic oil reservior

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$116,675.00 $350,025.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $296,025.00

7.90% $23,385.98

Total $319,410.98

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

+30.5L-32 Turf tires mounted & installed
+18.4L-26 Turf tires mounted & installed
LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$319,410.98

Total I $477,654.96 |

Alternate Bid #2 Tractor ONLY

$112,139.27 $336,417.81
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $300,417.81
7.90% $23.733.01

Total $324,150.82

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11, 2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:

-No creeper with Power Quad trans.
-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
-Add $3,510 for turf tires

-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
-Add $4,824 for turf tires

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$324,150.82

Total [ $482,394.80 |

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$119,092.52 $357,277.56
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $321,277.56
7.90% $25.380.93

Total $346,658.49

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11,2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-38 Turf tires included
-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-26 Turf tires included

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$346,658.49

Total I $504,902.47'

Base Bid Mower ONLY

$48,886.00 $146,658.00
Trade-in #1660 no bid
Trade-in #2660 no bid
Trade-in #3620 no bid
Subtotal $146,658.00

7.90% $11.585.98

Total $158,243.98

No Tractor bid
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 75 days tractor

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $5,944.00
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Bid Alternate #2

$150,961.00 $452,883.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $392,883.00

7.90% $31.037.76

Total $423,920.76

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH

Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Standard Cab w/AC
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Ill
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
+Creeper 4:1 > net gears 48x48 F/R
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tireg
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 212"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Bid Alternate #1

$153,461.00 $460,383.00
Trade-in #1660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($20,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($20,000.00)
Subtotal $400,383.00
7.90% $31.630.26

Totall $432,013.26

2011 Massey Ferguson MF6495
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 120 days tractor

195 days w/mower
TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+MF Luxury Cab incl. AC, rear wipers
& washer, pneumatice cab suspension,
block heater, power access
+6 cyl 402 cu in 185 hp 4 valve Tier Il
direct injection diesel engine
+Dyna-6 24x24 transmission
-420/85R28 front tires
+Nokian 440/80R38 Tri 2 rear road tires:
+Nokian 440/80R28 Tri 2 front road tire
+93.8 gal. fuel tank
+14,500 Ib 3-pt hitch
Lexan poly RH door/corner by USMowe
LRW ballasting by USMower
RF axle stabilizer by USMower
Elect. joystick/armrest by USMower

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"
+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 25'2"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $6,500.00

Base Bid Tractor ONLY

$104,314.00 $312,942.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $258,942.00
7.90% $20.,456.42

Total $279,398.42

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-Creeper not available

-Turf tires not available

LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$279,398.42

Total [ $437,642.40 |

Base Bid for Tractor and Mower
$149,357.00 $448,071.00
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)

Subtotal $412,071.00
7.90% $32,653.61
Total $444,624.61

2011 John Deere 7330 Tractor
Alamo Maverick 30' telescoping boom
Delivery: 150 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
-ComfortGard Cab only

-155 hp engine

-18.4R-38 R1 rear radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-14.9R-28 R1 front radial tires
-No turf tire offered

-No auto de-clutch function
-8800 Ib 3-pt hitch capacity
-Standard exhaust

-Seat swival adjustment 15° r & |
-No wheel weights

MOWER exceptions/additions:
+30' boom

+Boom swing arc 180 °

+Min. reach tractor C/L 27'10"
+Min. reach out @90° 30'
+Min. reach below tractor 19'3"
-18 gal. hydraulic oil reservior

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$116,675.00 $350,025.00
Trade-in #1660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($18,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($18,000.00)
Subtotal $296,025.00

7.90% $23,385.98

Total $319,410.98

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: 120 days tractor

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

+30.5L-32 Turf tires mounted & installed
+18.4L-26 Turf tires mounted & installed
LRW ballasting by Mower co.

RF axle stabilizer by Mower co.
Elect. joystick/armrest by Mower co.

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$319,410.98

Total I $477,654.96 |

Alternate Bid #2 Tractor ONLY

$112,139.27 $336,417.81
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $300,417.81
7.90% $23.733.01

Total $324,150.82

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11, 2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:

-No creeper with Power Quad trans.
-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
-Add $3,510 for turf tires

-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
-Add $4,824 for turf tires

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$324,150.82

Total [ $482,394.80 |

Alternate Bid #1 Tractor ONLY

$119,092.52 $357,277.56
Trade-in #1660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #2660 ($12,000.00)
Trade-in #3620 ($12,000.00)
Subtotal $321,277.56
7.90% $25.380.93

Total $346,658.49

2011 John Deere 7530 Tractor
No mower bid included
Delivery: July 11,2011

TRACTOR exceptions/additions:
+IVT Transmission

-480/80R-38 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-38 Turf tires included
-480/80R-26 tires mounted & installed
+480/80R-26 Turf tires included

Option: No bid

Price when paired with USMower bid:

$346,658.49

Total I $504,902.47'

Base Bid Mower ONLY

$48,886.00 $146,658.00
Trade-in #1660 no bid
Trade-in #2660 no bid
Trade-in #3620 no bid
Subtotal $146,658.00

7.90% $11.585.98

Total $158,243.98

No Tractor bid
US Mower 125MM25P-60RCMH
Delivery: 75 days tractor

MOWER exceptions/additions:
-4164 LB operating weight

-Min reach tractor C/L 21'2"

-Min reach below tractor 14'4"

+2.5" boom base pin

+Pivot base 138,000 psi yield strength
+25 gallon hydraulic reservior
-Boom cylinder functions 15-29 gpm
-58" cutting head, actual

-Boom reach from tractor C/L 252"
-Boom operating weight 1275 Ib

Option: Upgrade to US Mower Model
TC22025P-60 RCMH
each $5,944.00
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