Revised 2/3/2011

Autos and Pickups

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:30 P.M. Tuesday, February 1, 2011

Discovery Ford
1140 S Pioneer Way
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Barry Chrysler Dodge Jeep
548 So. Basin
Ephrata, WA 98823

BID TABULATION

Bud Clary Chevrolet
12056 N. Frontage Rd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Legacy Ford
1225 Autoplex W ay
Pasco, WA 99301

State Bids
Various Companies
*Add $6,000 to join co-op

Various trade-in bidders

Equip
Item # _ Quantity Description Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Name No. Amount
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
1 1 Furnish and deliver mid-size $16,164.57 $16,164.57 $17,935.00 $17,935.00 $19,805.00 $19,805.00 v $15,816.00 $15,816.00 $15,675.00 $15,675.00 Michael Shay #603 $1,200.00
4-dr sedan Trade-in #603 ($500.00) Trade-in #603 M Trade-in #603 ($1,700.00) i {v* Trade-in #603 ($1,250.00) Trade-in #603 nla Unidentified Bidder #603 $900.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $15,664.57 Subtotal $17,935.00 Subtotal $18,105.00 Subtotal $14,566.00 Subtotal $15,675.00 Mark Cummings #603 $860.00
8.20% $1,284.49 8.20% $1,470.67 8.20% $1,484.61 8.60% $1,252.68 8.20% $1,285.35 Randy Martin #603 $650.00
Total $16,949.06 Total $19,405.67 Total $19,589.61 Total $15,818.68 Total* $16,960.35
2011 Ford Fusion 2011 Dodge Avenger 2011 Chevrolet Malibu 2011 Ford Fusion 2011 Ford Fusion
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
Note: No trade-in bid offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth
No Temp. Display
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
2 6 Furnish and deliver full size 4-dr $25,462.08 $152,772.48 $26,177.00 $157,062.00 No Bid | | v $24,244.00 $145,464.00 $24,742.00 $148,452.00
RWD police sedan Trade-in #700 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #700 N Trade-in #700 * Trade-in #700 ($2 00) Trade-in #700 n/a; (¢  Gerald Coulter #700 $2,200.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #703 ($1,800.00) Trade-in #703 * Trade-in #703 v Trade-in #703 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #703 n/a Gerald Coulter #703 $2,100.00
Trade-in #709 ($1,800.00) Trade-in #709 N Trade-in #709 v Trade-in #709 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #709 nla Gerald Coulter #709 $2,350.00
Trade-in #710 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #710 * Trade-in #710 v Trade-in #710 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #710 n/a Gerald Coulter #741 $2,000.00
Trade-in #741 ($1,200.00) Trade-in #741 * Trade-in #741 v Trade-in #741 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #741 n/a
Trade-in #758 ($1,200.00) Trade-in #758 * Trade-in #758 v Trade-in #758 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #758 n/a
Trade-in #759 ($1,200.00) Trade-in #759 : Trade-in #759 iV Trade-in #759 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #759 nla
Subtotal $142,572.48 Subtotal $157,062.00 Subtotal Subtotal $130,964.00 Subtotal $148,452.00
8.20% $11,690.94 8.20% $12,879.08 8.20% 8.60% $11,262.90 8.20% $12,173.06
Total $154,263.42 Total $169,941.08 Total Total $142,226.90 Total* $160,625.06
2011 Ford Crown Victoria 2011 Dodge Charger 2011 Ford Crown Victoria 2010 Ford Crown Victoria
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: nla Exceptions: None *Discount §200/20 days per vehicle
3.6L V6 291 hp eng *No trade-in bids offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth
*No trade-in bids offered No Temp. Display
Note: Math error shown corrected
Karmart Auto. Group, Burlington WA
3 1 Furnish and deliver full size high No Bid $26,389.00 $26,389.00 | v $25,276.00 $25,276.00 No Bid $24,973.00 $24,973.00
speed 4-dr RWD police sedan Trade-in #770 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #770 v Trade-in #770 (87,500.00) Trade-in #770 : Trade-in #770 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal Subtotal $26,389.00 Subtotal $17,776.00 Subtotal Subtotal $24,973.00
8.20% 8.20% $2,163.90 8.20% $1,457.63 8.60% 8.50% $2,122.71
Total Total $28,552.90 Total $19,233.63 Total Total* $27,095.71
2011 Dodge Charger 2011 Dodge Charger 2011 Dodge Charger LX
Delivery: n/a Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: nla Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: nla Exceptions: nla *Discount $50/20 days per vehicle
*No trade-in bid offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth
No Temp. Display
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
4 2 Furnish and deliver small SUV 4x4 $21,423.55 $42,847.10 $24,041.00 $48,082.00 $23,282.00 $46,564.00 v $21,418.00 $42,836.00 $20,918.00 $41,836.00 Darryl Hudon #003 $1,550.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #003 ($800.00) Trade-in #003 * Trade-in #003 ($1,700.00) { { v Trade-in #003 ($1,500.00) Trade-in #003 n/a Randy Martin #003 $1,080.00
Trade-in #611 ($1,000.00) Trade-in #611 N Trade-in #611 ($2,200.00) ; ;v Trade-in #611 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #611 nla Mark Cummings #003 $960.00
Trade-in #613 ($800.00) Trade-in #613 * Trade-in #613 ($1,700.00) { v Trade-in #613 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #613 n/a Alex Freeburg #003 $816.00
Subtotal $40,247.10 Subtotal $48,082.00 Subtotal $40,964.00 Subtotal $37,336.00 Subtotal $41,836.00 James Sweeney #003 $800.00
8.20% $3,300.26 8.20% $3,942.72 8.20% $3,359.05 8.60% $3,210.90 8.20% $3,430.55 Unidentified Bidder #003 $700.00
Total $43,547.36 Total $52,024.72 Total $44,323.05 Total $40,546.90 Total* $45,266.55
2011 Ford Escape 2011 Dodge Journey 2011 Chevrolet Equinox AWD 2011 Ford Escape 2010 Ford Escape XLS 4WD Darryl Hudon #611 $1,850.00
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Terrah Goeden #611 $1,776.00
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None *Discount §200/20 days per vehicle Randy Martin #611 $1,190.00
*No trade-in bids offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth Unidentified Bidder #611 $700.00
Note: Math error shown corrected No Temp. Display
Note: Math error shown corrected Randy Martin #613 $1,080.00
Unidentified Bidder #613 $700.00
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
5 1 Furnish and deliver full size SUV 4x4 $25,621.31 $25,621.31 $29,623.00 $29,623.00 $27,521.00 $27,521.00 | v $25,140.00 $25,140.00 $23,243.00 $23,243.00 Port of Moses Lake #004 $2,678.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #004 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #004 N Trade-in #004 ($4,000.00) i {v Trade-in #004 ($3,000.00) Trade-in #004 nla Gerald Coulter #004 $2,000.00
Subtotal $23,121.31 Subtotal $29,623.00 Subtotal $23,521.00 Subtotal $22,140.00 Subtotal $23,243.00
8.20% $1,895.95 8.20% $2,429.09 8.20% $1,928.72 8.60% $1,904.04 8.20% $1,905.93
Total $25,017.26 Total $32,052.09 Total $25,449.72 Total $24,044.04 Total* $25,148.93
2011 Ford Explorer 2011 Dodge Durango 2011 Chevrolet Traverse 2011 Ford Explorer XLS 4x4 2011 Ford Explorer 4WD
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
No power driver seal No undercoating Exceptions: No Bluetooth
*No trade-in bids offered No Temp. Display
Note: Math error shown corrected
Bud Clary Auto, Longview, WA
6 1 Furnish and deliver full size SUV 4x2 No Bid No Bid v $24,990.00 $24,990.00 No Bid $25,699.00 $25,699.00
police package Trade-in #766 ($4,000.00) Trade-in #766 v Trade-in #766 ($7,500.00) Trade-in #766 * Trade-in #766 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal Subtotal Subtotal $17,490.00 Subtotal Subtotal $25,699.00
8.20% 8.20% 8.20% $1,434.18 8.60% 8.20% $2,107.32
Total Total Total $18,924.18 Total Total* $27,806.32
2011 Chevrolet Tahoe 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe FFV 2WD
Delivery: nia Delivery: n/a Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: nia Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: nla Exceptions: nla Exceptions: No Bluetooth Exceptions: nla “Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
*No trade-in bid offered *No trade-in bid offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth
No Temp. Display
Grover Dykes Auto, Pasco, WA
7 2 Furnish and deliver full size SUV 4x4 $28,510.89 $57,021.78 No Bid $33,500.00 $67,000.00 v $28,394.00 $56,788.00 $28,194.00 $56,388.00 | |/  Alex Freeburg #768 $2,752.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #768 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #768 * Trade-in #768 (85,200.00) Trade-in #768 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #768 n/a Unidentified Bidder #768 $2,000.00
Trade-in #798 ($1,000.00) Trade-in #798 * Trade-in #798 ($3,500.00) i {v* Trade-in #798 ($1,200.00) Trade-in #798 n/a
Subtotal $54,021.78 Subtotal Subtotal $58,300.00 Subtotal $55,588.00 Subtotal $56,388.00
8.20% $4,429.79 8.20% 8.20% $4,780.60 8.60% $4,780.57 8.60% $4,849.37
Total $58,451.57 Total Total $63,080.60 Total $60,368.57 Total* $61,237.37
2011 Ford Expedition Delivery: n/a 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe 2011 Ford Expedition SSV 4x4 2011 Ford Expedition 4WD
Delivery: 120 days ARO Exceptions: nla Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None *No trade-in bids offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth Exceptions: None *Discount $§200/20 days per vehicle
No conv. package Exceptions: No Bluetooth
No Temp. Display
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
8 1 Furnish and deliver 7 ton 4x4 ext. $24,014.37 $24,014.37 $24,874.00 $24,874.00 v $27,082.00 $27,082.00 $23,364.00 $23,364.00 $23,310.00 $23,310.00 Mickelsen Dairy #401 $2,750.00
cab 6.5' box pickup w/auto trans Trade-in #401 ($7,000.00) Trade-in #401 v Trade-in #401 ($12,000.00) Trade-in #401 ($6,000.00) Trade-in #401 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Trade-in #604 ($5,000.00) Trade-in #604 v Trade-in #604 ($8,800.00) Trade-in #604 ($4,500.00) Trade-in #604 n/a WSU Extension #604 $7,550.00
Subtotal $12,014.37 Subtotal $24,874.00 Subtotal $6,282.00 Subtotal $12,864.00 Subtotal $23,310.00 Leland Phillips. #604 $5,110.00
8.20% $985.18 8.20% $2,039.67 8.20% $515.12 8.60% $1,106.30 8.20% $1,911.42 Mickelsen Dairy #604 $3,250.00
Total $12,999.55 Total $26,913.67 Total $6,797.12 Total $13,970.30 Total $25,221.42
2011 Ford F150 Supercab 4x4 2011 Dodge Ram 1500 Quadcab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet 1500 Ext. Cab 4x4 2011 Ford F150 4x4 2011 Ford F150 4WD pickup
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: 4-sp auto trans Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
6700 gvw No undercoating Exceptions: No Bluetooth
*No trade-in bids offered No temp. gauge No Temp. Display
Note: Math error shown corrected 5 yr/100k drivetrain
Bud Clary Auto, Longview, WA
9 1 Furnish and deliver % ton 4x4 ext. $25,859.37 $25,859.37 No Bid | (v $27,950.00 $27,950.00 No Bid $26,734.00 $26,734.00
cab 8' box pickup w/auto trans Trade-in #670 ($10,000.00) Trade-in #670 v Trade-in #670 ($15,000.00) Trade-in #670 * Trade-in #670 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $15,859.37 Subtotal Subtotal $12,950.00 Subtotal Subtotal $26,734.00
8.20% $1,300.47 8.20% 8.20% $1,061.90 8.60% 8.20% $2,192.19
Total $17,159.84 Total Total $14,011.90 Total Total $28,926.19
2011 Ford F150 Supercab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet 1500 Ext. Cab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet Silverado K1500
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: 5.0L V8 FFV Exceptions: nla Exceptions: No undercoating Exceptions: nla *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
750 CCA battery *No trade-in bid offered No temp. gauge *No trade-in bid offered Exceptions: No Bluetooth
36 gal. tank 5 yr/100k drivetrain No Temp. Display
3.73:1 rear axle No Top Spotlight
5 yr/60k drivetrain
LT245/75 R17E tires
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
10 1 Furnish and deliver % ton 4x4 reg. $23,188.85 $23,188.85 $23,483.00 $23,483.00 | iv $22,767.00 $22,767.00 $23,023.00 $23,023.00 $23,173.00 $23,173.00 Mickelsen Dairy #1030 $3,250.00
cab 8' box pickup w/auto trans Trade-in #1030 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #1030 v Trade-in #1030 ($3,800.00) Trade-in #1030 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #1030 nla Port of Moses Lake #1030 $2,078.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $20,688.85 Subtotal $23,483.00 Subtotal $18,967.00 Subtotal $21,023.00 Subtotal $23,173.00
8.20% $1,696.49 8.20% $1,925.61 8.20% $1,555.29 8.60% $1,807.98 8.20% $1,900.19
Total $22,385.34 Total $25,408.61 Total $20,522.29 Total $22,830.98 Total $25,073.19
2011 Ford F250 Reg. Cab 4x4 2011 Dodge Ram 2500 Reg. Cab 4x2 2011 Chevrolet 2500 Reg. Cab 4x4 2011 Ford F250 Reg. Cab 4x4 2011 Ford F250 4WD pickup.
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: 4x2 drivetrain Exceptions: No skid plate pkg Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
8650 gvw 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None
5 yr/100k drivetrain No undercoating
*No trade-in bid offered No upfitter switches
Legacy Ford, Pasco WA
1" 1 Furnish and deliver % ton 4x4 ext. $24,740.33 $24,740.33 No Bid $26,629.00 $26,629.00 v $24,471.00 $24,471.00 $24,571.00 $24,571.00 | (¢  Mickelsen Dairy #3075 $3,250.00
cab 8' box auto. trans. pickup Trade-in #3075 ($2,500.00) Trade-in #3075 M Trade-in #3075 ($3,800.00) Trade-in #3075 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #3075 nla Port of Moses Lake #3075 $2,078.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $22,240.33 Subtotal Subtotal $22,829.00 Subtotal $24,471.00 Subtotal $24,571.00 Fairgrounds #3075 $2,000.00
8.20% $1,823.71 8.20% 8.20% $1,871.98 8.60% $2,104.51 8.60% $2,113.11
Total $24,064.04 Total Total $24,700.98 Total $26,575.51 Total $26,684.11
2011 Ford F250 Supercab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet 2500 Ext. Cab 4x4 lwh 2011 Ford F250 Supercab 4x4 2011 Ford F250 Supercab 4WD
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: nla Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
*No trade-in bid offered No undercoating Exceptions: None
No upfitter switches
Legacy Ford, Pasco WA
12 1 Furnish and deliver % ton 4x4 ext. $25,815.56 $25,815.56 No Bid | v $28,900.00 $28,900.00 $25,309.00 $25,309.00 $25,360.00 $25,360.00 Fairgrounds #3002 $5,000.00
cab 8' box auto. trans. pickup Trade-in #3002 ($8,000.00) Trade-in #3002 v Trade-in #3002 ($11,500.00) Trade-in #3002 ($2,000.00) Trade-in #3002 n/a
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $17,815.56 Subtotal Subtotal $17,400.00 Subtotal $23,309.00 Subtotal $25,360.00
8.20% $1,460.88 8.20% 8.20% $1,426.80 8.60% $2,004.57 8.60% $2,180.96
Total $19,276.44 Total Total $18,826.80 Total $25,313.57 Total $27,540.96
2011 Ford F250 Supercab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet 2500 Ext. Cab 4x4 lwh 2011 Ford F250 4x4 2011 Ford F250 Supercab 4WD
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions: nla Exceptions: 5 yr/100k drivetrain Exceptions: None *Discount $§200/20 days per vehicle
*No trade-in bid offered No undercoating Exceptions: No Bluetooth
No upfitter switches No Temp. Display
No temp. gauge
Legacy Ford, Pasco WA
13 1 Furnish and deliver 1 ton 4x4 ext. $26,909.33 $26,909.33 No Bid $29,604.00 $29,604.00 |iv $25,119.00 $25,119.00 $26,538.00 $26,538.00 Mickelsen Dairy #581 $2,750.00
cab 8' box auto. trans. pickup Trade-in #581 ($3,500.00) Trade-in #581 * Trade-in #581 ($6,000.00) { { v Trade-in #581 ($2,800.00) Trade-in #581 n/a Keith Curran #581 $2,500.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $23,409.33 Subtotal Subtotal $23,604.00 Subtotal $22,319.00 Subtotal $26,538.00 Fairgrounds #581 $1,800.00
8.20% $1,919.57 8.20% 8.20% $1,935.53 8.60% $1,919.43 8.60% $2,282.27
Total $25,328.90 Total Total $25,539.53 Total $24,238.43 Total $28,820.27
2011 Ford F350 Supercab 4x4 2011 Chevrolet 3500 Ext. Cab 4x4 Iwki 2011 Ford F350 4x4 2011 Ford F350 Supercab 4WD
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: n/a Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: LT245/75RX17E tire Exceptions: nla Exceptions: 11,000 gvw Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle
*No trade-in bid offered No undercoating Exceptions: None
No upfitter switches
Columbia Ford, Longview WA
14 1 Furnish and deliver 1 ton 4x4 crew v $36,392.62 $36,392.62 No Bid No Bid $33,198.00 $33,198.00 $36,599.00 $36,599.00 Mickelsen Dairy #014 $6,500.00
cab & chassis v Trade-in #014 ($9,000.00) Trade-in #014 * Trade-in #014 * Trade-in #014 ($4,200.00) Trade-in #014 n/a Port of Moses Lake #014 $6,028.00
F.0.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $27,392.62 Subtotal Subtotal Subtotal $28,998.00 Subtotal $36,599.00 Tim Massey #014 $5,387.00
8.20% $2,246.19 8.20% 8.20% 8.60% $2,493.83 8.20% $3,001.12
Total $29,638.81 Total Total Total $31,491.83 Total $39,600.12
2011 Ford F350 Crew Cab & Chassis 2011 Ford F350 Crew Cab & Chassis 2011 Ford F350 4WD Diesel Crew Ca
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Delivery: n/a Delivery: n/a Exceptions: None *Discount $200/20 days per vehicle

v = Department award recommendation only

Exceptions: nla
*No trade-in bid offered

Exceptions: nla
*No trade-in bid offered

Exceptions: None
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