Liquid Asphalt - 2011

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:45 P.M. Tuesday, April 12,2011

Western States Asphalt, Inc.
4327 N. Thor St.
Spokane, WA 99217

Albina Asphalt
801 Main St.
Vancouver, WA 98660

Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc.
P.O. Box 50538
Idaho Falls, ID 83405

Paramount Petroleum
5501 NW Front St.
Portland, OR 97210

‘‘‘‘‘‘‘ Item # _Quantity Description $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount
1 4,600 Min. Furnish MC 800 liquid asphalt $695.00  $3,197,000.00 Min. No Bid $795.00 $3,657,000.00 Min. $661.00 $3,040,600.00 Min.
5,600 Max. at240°F $3,822,500.00 Max. $4,372,500.00 Max. $661.00 $3,635,500.00 Max.
tons Tax 8.70% Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90%
$278,139.00 Min. $288,903.00 Min. $240,207.40 Min.
$332,557.50 Max. $345,427.50 Max. $287,204.50 Max.
Total  $3,475,139.00 Min. Total $3,945,903.00 Min. Total $3,280,807.40 Min.
Total $4,155,057.50 Max. Total $4,717,927.50 Max. Total $3,922,704.50 Max.
2 As Anti-strip additive at 2% $22.00 No Bid $20.00 $21.50
Requested
3 6,000 Min. Furnish HFE 150 liquid asphalt $473.00  $2,838,000.00 Min. $475.00  $2,850,000.00 Min. $550.00 $3,300,000.00 Min. No Bid
7,200 Max. at185°F $3,405,600.00 Max. $3,420,000.00 Max. $3,960,000.00 Max.
tons Tax 8.70% Tax 7.90% 7.90%
$246,906.00 Min. $225,150.00 Min. $260,700.00 Min.
$296,287.20 Max. $270,180.00 Max. $312,840.00 Max.
v Total  $3,084,906.00 Min. Total  $3,075,150.00 Min. Total $3,560,700.00 Min.
v Total  $3,701,887.20 Max. Total  $3,690,180.00 Max. Total $4,272,840.00 Max.
Hauler A As Company name: Northwest Tank Lines, Inc. - Pasco Albina Asphalt Johnny B. Transport Hot Oil Transport
Req'd Dispatch contact: Bill Wyman Bob Olson Daniel Luhwick Randy Graham
Dispatch phone: -994- - - 1 208-773-0563 360-592-2650
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 30 tons 32 tons $33.00 30 tons
Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage
FOB:. Ephrata +10 miles $937.50 /load* $2,820.00 /load $924.00 /load $2,550.00 /load
FOB: ..Moses Lake +10 miles $856.50 /load* $2,820.00 /load $792.00 /load $2,550.00 /load
FOB: ....George +10 miles $956.40 /load* $2,820.00 /load $957.00 /load $2,550.00 /load
FOB: .. Royal City +10 miles $977.10 /load* $2,820.00 /load $957.00 /load $2,550.00 /load
Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $80.00 /hour $100.00 /hour $80.00 /hour $100.00 /hour
Price offered per ton, shown per load Price offered per ton, shown per load Price offered per ton, shown per load
Hauler B As Company name: No Bid R.L. Wood No Bid Harms Pacific
Req'd Dispatch contact: Randy Graham John Abrey
Dispatch phone: 360-303-1140 509-547-0011
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 32 tons 30 tons
Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage
FOB: oo Ephrata £10 miles $2,720.00 /load $1,270.50
FOB: ..Moses Lake +10 miles $2,720.00 /load $1,270.50
FOB: ....George +10 miles $2,720.00 /load $1,270.50
FOB: ..... ..Royal City +10 miles $2,720.00 /load $1,243.80
Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $100.00 /hour $100.00
Price offered per ton, shown per load
Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement?  Yes
Access Agreement was provided
Product Plant/address Product Plant/address
MC800 Spokane Hillyard Plant - 509-487-5170 HFE150 Albina Plant Product Plant/address Product Plant/address
4327 Thor St., Spokane, WA 99217 400 NW Paul Jasa Way, Madras, OR 97741 MC800 Post Falls Plant MC800 Portland Plant
HFE150 Spokane Valley Plant - 509-921-0081 14625 W Prairie Ave, Post Falls, ID 83854 5501 NW Front Ave., Portland, OR
E. 16710 Euclid Ave., Spokane, WA 99202
? Pasco Plant - 509-545-9864

Department recommendation

3152 Selph Landing, Pasco, WA 99301

Exceptions/Information:

1. Item 1: WSA commits to 2,200 tons
minimum if award is confirmed within 5 days
of bid date. Volume over 2200 tons subject to
availability and cost

2. HFE150 volumes not limited

2. Minimum Insurance limits listed for yard
access by Grant County hauler.

3. Credit terms listed as net 10 days from
invoice.

4. Product returns charge at $300/load with
no credit given for dilute material or antistrip.
5. $400 minimum charge for tank flushing.
6. Prices listed include 0.7% Wash. St.
hazardous substance tax

7. Fuel surchage schedule attached

Exceptions/Information:
None listed

Exceptions/Information:

1. CHFE 150 offered instead of HFE 150
Product specifications attached

2. Unloading charge $80 after 3 hours
3. Overnight holdover $350 per night
4. $250 restocking charge

5. Offer valid for 30 days and confirmed
for season

6. Fuel sucharge schedule attached

7. $100 charge for job site pump off
per occurrence

Exceptions/Information:
None listed
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