
BID TABULATION
Miscellaneous Equipment
Grant County Wesspur LLC Mid Mountain Machinery Clyde/West, Inc.
Dept. of Public Works 117 Frontage Rd N, Build D 7916 W Sunset Hwy E 3107 Trent Ave.
Bid Opening:  1:45 P.M. Tuesday, February 9, 2010 Pacific, WA  98047 Spokane, WA  99224 Spokane, WA  99202

Item # Quantity Description

1 1 Furnish and deliver 6" wood $21,921.25 $21,921.25 No Bid No Bid
chipper 7.90% $1,731.78
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Total $23,653.03

2010 Bandit 65XP
Delivery: Apr. 15, 2010

Exceptions: None

2 1 Furnish and deliver rock rake No Bid $6,080.00 $6,080.00 No Bid
F.O.B. Grant County, WA 7.90% $480.32

Total $6,560.32
2010 York HT

Delivery: 60 days ARO
Exceptions: None

3 1 Furnish and deliver self-propelled  No Bid No Bid $42,221.51 $42,221.51
power broom Trade-in #076 ($5,000.00)
F.O.B. Grant County, WA Subtotal $37,221.51

7.90% $2,940.50
Total 40162.00929

2010 Broce RCT 350
Delivery: 60 days ARO

Exceptions: None

Options
Curb/guttter broom $3,047.82

Eng. shut down $205.25
Suspension seat $232.50
Work light group $252.82

7.5' scarper blade $2,523.75
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