
Liquid Asphalt - 2010
Grant County Western States Asphalt, Inc. Albina Asphalt Idaho Asphalt Supply, Inc. Paramount Petroleum
Dept. of Public Works 4327 N. Thor St. 801 Main St. P.O. Box 50538 5501 NW Front St.
Bid Opening:  1:45 P.M. Tuesday, April 13, 2010 Spokane, WA  99217 Vancouver, WA  98660 Idaho Falls, ID  83405 Portland, OR  97210

Item # Quantity Description $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount $/Ton Amount

1 2800 Min. Furnish MC 800 liquid asphalt $650.00 $1,820,000.00 Min. No Bid $755.00 $2,114,000.00 Min. $655.45 $1,835,260.00 Min.
3400 Max. at 240EF $2,210,000.00 Max. $2,567,000.00 Max. $2,228,530.00 Max.
tons Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90%

$143,780.00 Min. $167,006.00 Min. $144,985.54 Min.
$174,590.00 Max. $202,793.00 Max. $176,053.87 Max.

Total $1,963,780.00 Min. Total $2,281,006.00 Min. Total $1,980,245.54 Min.
Total $2,384,590.00 Max. Total $2,769,793.00 Max. Total $2,404,583.87 Max.

2 As Anti-strip additive at ½% $18.00 No Bid $18.00 $21.50
Requested

3 4,200 Min. Furnish HFE 150 liquid asphalt $445.00 $1,869,000.00 Min. $435.00 $1,827,000.00 Min. No Bid No Bid
5,000 Max. at 185EF $2,225,000.00 Max. $2,175,000.00 Max.
tons Tax 7.90% Tax 7.90%

$147,651.00 Min. $144,333.00 Min.
$175,775.00 Max. $171,825.00 Max.

Total $2,016,651.00 Min. Total $1,971,333.00 Min.
Total $2,400,775.00 Max. Total $2,346,825.00 Max.

Hauler A As Company name: Northwest Tank Lines, Inc. - Pasco Albina Asphalt Johnny B. Blue Line
Req'd Dispatch contact: Bill Wyman Bob Olson Daniel Luhwick Troy Tindall

Dispatch phone: 509-994-3555 888-308-5581 208-773-0563 503-702-1236
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 30 tons 32 tons 32 tons no info

Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage 
FOB: ..........................Ephrata ±10 miles $705.00 /load* $2,668.00 /load $848.00 /load no info /load
FOB: ....................Moses Lake ±10 miles $583.20 /load* $2,668.00 /load $760.00 /load no info /load
FOB: ...........................George ±10 miles $707.10 /load* $2,476.00 /load $904.00 /load no info /load
FOB: .......................Royal City ±10 miles $584.70 /load* $2,636.00 /load $936.00 /load no info /load

Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $80.00 /hour $100.00 /hour $80.00 /hour no info /hour
Price offered per ton, shown per load

Hauler B As Company name: Northwest Tank Lines, Inc. - Spokane/Hillyd R.L. Wood No Bid No Bid
Req'd Dispatch contact: Bill Wyman Randy Graham

Dispatch phone: 509-994-3555 360-303-1140
Average tanker/trailer size for each load: 30 tons 32 tons

Freight cost per load incl. 90 min. demurrage 
FOB: ..........................Ephrata ±10 miles $814.80 /load* $2,740.00 /load
FOB: ....................Moses Lake ±10 miles $727.50 /load* $2,589.00 /load
FOB: ...........................George ±10 miles $836.70 /load* $2,762.00 /load
FOB: .......................Royal City ±10 miles $856.50 /load* $2,618.00 /load

Demurrage cost/hr (charged after 90 min.) $80.00 /hour $100.00 /hour
Price offered per ton, shown per load
*Note:  All freight rates subject to an attached
fuel surchage schedule

Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? No Terminal Access Agreement? Yes Terminal Access Agreement? Yes
Access agreement was not provided Access Agreement was provided

Product Plant/address Product Plant/address
MC800 Spokane Hillyard Plant - 509-487-5170 HFE150 Albina Plant Product Plant/address Product Plant/address

    4327 Thor St., Spokane, WA  99217 400 NW Paul Jasa Way, Madras, OR  97741 MC800 Post Falls Plant MC800 Portland Plant
HFE150 Spokane Valley Plant  - 509-921-0081 14625 W Prairie Ave, Post Falls, ID  83854 5501 NW Front Ave., Portland, OR 

    E. 16710 Euclid Ave., Spokane, WA  99202
MC800 Pasco Plant  - 509-545-9864

    3152 Selph Landing, Pasco, WA  99301

Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions:
1.    Item 1:  WSA commits to 2,800 tons None listed 1.  Did not provide copy of access 1.  The Bid lists special site entry 
minimum if award is confirmed within 5 days agreement requirements mandated by TSA
of bid date.  (900 tons from Pasco and 2.   No haul cost info provided.
remaining 1,900 tons from Hillyard)
Volumes over 2,800 tons not guaranteed.
2.    Minimum Insurance limits listed for yard
access by Grant County hauler.
3.    Credit terms listed as net 10 days from 
invoice.
4.    Product returns charge at $300/load with 
no credit given for dilute material or antistrip.
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