BID TABULATION

Herbicide Materials 2010

Grant County
Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:45 P.M. Tuesday, March 9, 2010

Helena Chemical Co.
9515 Vernal Avenue SE
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Crop Production Services, Inc
18319 E. 11th Ave.
Greenacres, WA 99016

Alligare, LLC
13 N. 8th St.
Opelika, AL 36801

Rate/acre Rate/acre Rate/acre
Item # Quantity Description Unit Amount min./max. Unit Amount  min./max. Unit Amount  min./max.
1 55.00 Glysophate 41% $9.41 $517.55 64 oz/acre $10.35 $569.25 1qt-5qt $11.85 $651.75 See label
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre
2 1,750.00 Glysophate 41% $9.41 $16,467.50 64 oz/acre $9.95 $17,412.50 1qt-5qt $11.25 $19,687.50 See label
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle per acre
3 175.00 Quest (water conditioner) $11.37 $1,989.75 1 qt/100 gal $9.45 $1,653.75 2 pint - 4 pint No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre
4 175.00 LI 700 $15.50 $2,712.50 1 pint/acre $13.90 $2,432.50 1 pint -4 pint No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per 100 gal
5 3,060.00 StrikeZone DF (CA Reg 5905-500084-AA), $6.75 $20,655.00 5 0z/100 gal No Bid No Bid
Packs no equivalent
Delivered in 6 Oz. Packs
6 20.00 Hardball, EPA #5905-549, no equivalent $28.50 $570.00 20 oz/acre No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
7 60.00 Hardball, EPA #5905-549, no equivalent $28.50 $1,710.00 20 oz/acre No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container
8 1,750.00 Hardball, EPA #5905-549, no equivalent $28.50 $49,875.00 20 oz/acre No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle
9 275.00 Vision EPA #42750-98, no equivalent $73.85 $20,308.75 4 oz/acre No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
10 730.00 Vista XRT EPA #62719-586, no equivalent $135.60 $98,988.00 8 oz/acre $125.88 $91,892.40 60z-220z No Bid
Gallons Delivered in bulk per acre
11 175.00 Metholated Seed Oil (MSO) or equivalent $7.60 $1,330.00 1 qgt/acre $7.64 $1,337.00 1 pint- 2 pint No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre
12 2,750.00 Metholated Seed Oil (MSO) or equivalent $7.50 $20,625.00 1 gt/acre $7.23 $19,882.50 1 pint - 2 pint No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle per acre
13 10.00 Prodiamine (like ProClipse 65 WDG) or equivalent $14.17 $141.70 2 Ibs/acre $14.24 $142.40 11b-231b $15.05 $150.50  See label
Pounds Delivered in 5 Pound Bag per acre Prodiamine 65WDG
14 650.00 Prodiamine (like ProClipse 65 WDG) or equivalent $13.33 $8,664.50 2 Ibs/acre $13.79 $8,963.50 1lb-231Ib $15.05 $9,782.50  See label
Pounds Delivered in 25 Pound Bag per acre Prodiamine 65WDG
15 11.00 Frequency (EPA #7969-281, no equivalent $835.00 $9,185.00 4 oz/acre $824.99 $9,074.89 loz-4o0z No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 1.0 Gallon Container per acre
16 32.50 Milestone VM (EPA #62719-537), no equivalent $285.00 $9,262.50 7 oz/acre $275.97 $8,969.03 30z-7o0z No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre
17 82.50 Imazapyr (like Habitat or Polaris) $59.14 $4,879.05 3 pints/acre $59.75 $4,929.38 1 pint - 6 pint $69.50 $5,733.75  See label
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre Ecomazapyr 25L
18 132.50 Grounded (Patent No 5,906,961), no equivalent $15.00 $1,987.50 1 gt/acre No Bid No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
19 7.00 Plateau (EPA #241-365) or equivalent $131.58 $921.06 8 oz/acre $125.00 $875.00 40z-120z $148.00 $1,036.00  See label
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre Panoramic 25L
20 100.00 Pendulum 3.3 (EPA #241-341) or equivalent $25.50 $2,550.00 1 gallacre $29.00 $2,900.00 2.40z-4.80z No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container per acre
21 50.00 Accelerator Spray Adjuvant (Ammonium Sulfate) $3.10 $155.00 4 gal/100 gal $3.05 $152.50 4qt-8qt No Bid
Gallons Delivered in 5 Gallon Container per acre
22 34.00 Telar XP EPA #352-654, no equivalent $14.90 $506.60 1.5 oz/acre $14.99 $509.66 1/40z-30z No Bid
Ounces Delivered in 2 Oz. Container Dalmation Toadflax per acre
23 30.00 Dyne-amic (CA Reg. N0.5905-50071-AA), $37.25 $1,117.50 1 qt/100 gal No Bid No Bid
Gallons no equivalent
Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container
TOTAL $275,119.46 $171,696.25 $37,042.00
Exceptions: 1) Applications rates per acre Exceptions: None Exceptions: Applications rates per acre

min./max. not listed.
2) Labels not provided in bid

min./max. not listed except
as given in attached label.
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