Miscellaneous Shop Equipment

Grant County
Cept of Public Works

Bid Cpening: 1:50 P.M. Tuesday, January 27, 2009
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Desedption

Furnish and dediver portable wetder/
generator FOB Gram Courty, WA

Furnish and deliver portable heated
pressure washer FOB Grant County,
WA

Furnists and deliver electric seif-

propefled scissor Hift FOB Grant County

WA

Furrish and deliver car tire derimmer
FOB Grant County, WA

Furnish and deliver Portable sand
blaster FOB Grant County, WA

Central Machinery Sales g
1201 E Yonozawa Bhvd
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Eagie intgroatonal
4307 G Street
South Swoux Ty, NE 88778

C & 4 Hydraudies
201 Harmdon Rosd
Moses Lske, WA 98837

Cotumitng Basin Hotsy LLE
12253 1h Ave
Pasco, WA 9330

Columbea Basin Hotsy LLC
1225S 1th Ave
Pascn, WA 99301

s Basn Hotsy LLT
1225 ¢ 101 Ave
Pasco, WA 98301

Urstend Rentals
13858 N Frontage Rd
Moses Lake, WA U8837

Sun City Auto Supply
341 Basin NW
Ephrata, WA 98823

Sun City Auto Supply
341 Basa NW
Ephvata, WA G8823

Sun City Autd Supply
341 Basin NW
Eptrata, WA 98823

$3.344 00 $3.344 00 o Bid No Bid N Bud Mo Bid Ho Bid 3332871 $3,22871 $3.51300 3351500 No Big N Bid
7e% $264 18 7 90% L8297 7 W% 327788
Totat $3.808.18 Total §3.591.868 Total §3.792.69
Ranger 10,000 Plus K2458-2 Lincon Ranger Lincoln 10,000 Plus KZ488-2
Dativery. 1 week ARQ Delivery 2 weeks ARQ Delivery, 10 days ARD
Exceptions, Hone Exceptions: None Exceptions. None
Ant A2 A3 AR A2 A3 .
Mo Bid No Big $5.193.00 $519300 3579330 85,793 30 $4.967 10 $4.967 10 $4.855 50 54.855.50 Mg Bid 38,038 00 $8.038 00 $5.965.00 35,956 00 $5,129.95 $5,129.85
7 9% $410.25 7 90% $457.67 7 50% $392 40 790% $383 58 7 a0% $477 08 7 90% 347382 7 90% $405 27
Totat $5.603.28 Total $8,25097 Yotal 5,359 50 Total $5.239.08 Totaf $6,516.08 Total 3647292 Total 553522
Karcher Liberty HDS3. %20 E3 Hotsy 580ss FET-M HHS-2004-E28 Hydrotek HDZS004E2H Whitco Stinger Wiitco Stinger Il Whitco Stinger #
Deiivery, 21 days ARO Defivery 10 days ARO Oetivery. 15 days ARC Detivery. 10 days ARO Deiivery: 15 days ARC Delvery: 15 days ARO Delivery: 15 days ARO
Excaptions: Minor Excoptions. Yes Excaptions. Yes Exceptions. Yes Exceptions. None Exceptions: & tres Exceptions: No water tight
manual storage
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid 812,868 47 §13,868.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7% $1.095.681
Total 14,964.08
Genie GS 1830
Delivery 2 weeks ARC
Exceptions: Minot
No Bid $23,800.00 $23.500 00 o Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid Neo Bid No Bid
Cut of state %000,
Total $23,900.00° .
Eagle Car Tire Derimmer :
Defivery: 4 weeks ARCQ
Exceptions: None
“County to pay sales tax
$3,111.11 3311111 - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.219.99 $1,21999. No Bid $2.849.00 $2,948.00;
7.90% $24578 7.90% $96.38 7 90% §232.97
Total $1.316.37 Total $3,181.97.
. Kelco K118 AV 300 b s

Total 3,356.89

Schmidt 6001-32-01
Delivery: 1 week ARO
Exceptions: None

Bid proposal was not signed

Omega 22101
Detivery: 4 days ARO
Exceptions: Yes

Delivery: 10 days ARO
Exceptions: None



