Herbicide Materials 2009

Grant County

Dept. of Public Works

Bid Opening: 1:45 P.M. Tuesday, March 24, 2008

tem # Quantity Description

1 2.50 Roundup Pro Concenirate EPA #524-526
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

2 60.00 Roundup Pro Concentrate EPA #524-529
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container

3 750.00 Roundup Pro Concentrate EPA #524-529
Gallons Delivered in 150 Gallon Container

4 150.00 Quest (water conditioner)
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

5 3,060.00 StrikeZone WDG (Drift agent as needed
Packs Delivered in 6 Oz. Packs

<] 22.50 Hardball, EPA #5905-549
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

7 150.00 Hardball, EPA #5905-549
Gallons Delivered in 30 Gallon Container

8 1,750.00 Hardball, EPA #5905-549
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle

9 280.00 Vision EPA #42750-98
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

10 769.00 Vista XRT EPA #62719-586
Galions Delivered in bulk

11 75.00 Metholated Seed Oil (MSO) or equivalent
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

12 3.000.00 Metholated Seed Oil (MSO) or equivalent
Gallons Delivered in 250 Gallon Shuttle

13 20.00 Sahara DG EPA #241-372
Pounds Delivered in 10 Pound Bag

14 3,280.00 Sghara DG EPA #241-372
Pounds Delivered in 40 Pound Bag

15 400.00 Matrix EPA #352-556 or #352-671
Qunces Delivered in 20 Oz. Container

16 25.00 Jourmney EPA #241-417
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

17 10.00 Pendulum 3.3 EPA #241-341
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

18 50.00 Accelerator Spray Adjuvant (Ammonium Sulfate} o
Gallons Delivered in 5 Gallon Container

19 34.00 Telar XP EPA #352-654
Gunces Delivered in 2 Oz. Container

20 12.50 Milestone VM EPA #62719-537
Gallons Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

21 30.00 Dyne-amic {MSO + silicone surfactant
Gallons w/aquatic label}

Delivered in 2.5 Gallon Container

TOTAL

Helena Chemical Co.
9515 Vernal Avenue SE
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Unit Amount
$42.00 $105.00
$41.00 $2,460.00
$41.00 $30,750.00
$11.30 $1,695.00

$6.75 $20,655.00
$28.50 $641.25
$28.50 $4.275.00
$28.50 $49,875.00
$90.00 $26,100.00
$157.25 $120,925.25

per addendum 1
$9.30 $697.50
$9.00 $27,000.00
$8.81 $176.20
$8.81 $28,896.80
$12.25 $4.900.00
$100.91 $2,522.75
$29.00 $290.00
$3.15 $157.50
$14.90 $506.60
$295.00 $3,687.50
$34.90 $1,047.00
$327,363.35

Rate/acre

26 oz/acre

26 oz/acre

26 oz/acre

1qt/100 gal
4 pks/100 galE :
20 oz/acre .
20 oz/acre

20 oz/acre -

3 oz/acre

8 oz/acre

1 gt/acre

1 gt/acre

10 Ibs/acre

10 ths/acre

4 oziacre

32 oz/acre

1 gal/acre

4 gal/100 gal

1.3 ozfacre

7 vzfacre

1 pint/100 gal

Crop Production Services, Inc
18319 E. 11th Ave.
Greenacres, WA 99016

Unit Amount  Rate/acre
$54.19 $13548 08qt-8qt
per acre
$36.59 $2,19540 08qt-8qt
per acre
$36.59 §27,44250 08qt-8qt
per acre
$7.50 $1,125.00 1/2 pint - 4 pint
Choice peracre
Weathermaster
No Bid
$12.65 $284.63 2 pint- 4 pint
Anime 4 per acre
$12.45 $1.867.50 2 pint - 4 pint
Anime 4 per acre
$12.25 $21.437.50 2 pint - 4 pint
Anime 4 per acre
$39.59 $11.481.16 1 pint- 8 pint
Rifle per acre
$153.49 $118,033.81 6oz-220z
per addendum 1 per acre

$9.32 $699.00 1 pint - 2 pint
per acre
$8.55  $25,650.00 1 pint- 2 pint
per acre
$8.99 $179.80 71b-12.851b
per acre
$8.94  $29.32320 71b- 12851
per acre
$13.40 $5.360.00 40z-4 o0z
per acre
$118.00 $2,950.00 10.7 0z - 32 oz
per acre
$35.85 $358.50 3.6 pint - 4.8 gt
per acre
$3.95 $197.50 4qt-8qt
per acre
$15.49 $526.66 1/4 0z-3 02
per acre
$320.51 $4 00638 3o0z-7oz
per acre
No Bid
$253,253 95

Alligare, LLC
P.O. Box 967
Opelika, AL 36803

Unit Amount

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7.00
Mohave

5 ib. abags
$7.00
Mohave

25 Ib. abags
No Bid

$140.00

$22,960.00

No Bid

No Bid

Mo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$23,100.00

Rate/acre

See labe!

See label



