Wheel Loader, Backhoe, Motorgrader

Grant County
Dept. of Public Works
Bid Opening: 1:45 P.M. Tuesday, January 29, 2008

Cental Machinery Sales, Inc.
1201 E. Yonzawa Blvd.
Moses Lake, WA 98837

Rowand Machinery, Inc.
1907 East James
Pasco, WA 99301

Terex Utilities
200 Edenway

White House, TN 37188

Puget Sound Truck Sales
1512 Thornton Ave. SW
Pacific, WA 98047

Pape' Machinery

2209 Terrace Heights Rd.
Yakima, WA 98901

Various Trade-in Bidders

State Bids
Various Companies

ltem# Quantity Description
1 1 Furnish and deliver 3.0 CY Wheel $154,790.00 $154,790.00 $172,130.00 $172,130.00 NO BID $189,512.00 $189,512.00 NO BID Moses Lake Auto Wrecking $150,333.65 $150,333.65
Loader Trade-in #2450 ($34,800) Trade-in #2450 ($23,500) Trade-in #2450 NO BID Trade-in #2450 $16,556.00 Trade-in #2450 n/a
Trade-in #1270 ($16,300) Trade-in #1270 ($14,000) Trade-in #1270 NO BID Trade-in #1270 $8,556.00 Trade-in #1270 n/a
Trade-ins may be considered Subtotal $103,690.00 Subtotal $134,630.00 Subtotal $189,512.00 Bid security: Yes Subtotal $150,333.65
separately? No 7.90% $8,191.51 | Yes 8.30% $11,174.29 No 8.80% $16,677.06 8.20% $12,327.36
Total $111,881.51 Total $145,804.29 Total $206,189.06 CRC Enterprises Total $162,661.01
Case 821E John Deere 644J Terex TXL300-2 Trade-in #1270 $6,278.27 4:1 Bucket $4,210.53
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Bid security: No| JRB Quick Coupler $4,111.58
Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions: 2008 Case 821C
No hydraulic locking differentials 185 hp engine No signed Proposal Sheet Delivery: 150 days
24E rear axle oscillation 22 mph max speed No trade-in offers OPTIONS included
No electric air dryer for drakes 29,121 Ib. tipping load straight 22.7 mph Exceptions: None
3 piece rims No dual cylinders for bucket 24E rear axle oscillation
700 CCA batteries OPTIONS: No electric air dryer for brakes
70 amp alternator 4inl bucket $18,250.00 21 ft. turning radius
No LED turn/signal lights Tool carrier $5,500.00 13'1" bucket height
63.2 gpm hydraulic pump 87.7 gal fuel tank
No ammeter OPTIONS:
One circulation fan 4-1 bucket $15,809.00
76 gal fuel tank Tool carrier No Bid
OPTIONS:
4in1 bucket $12,850.00
Tool carrier $7,710.00
2 1 Furnish and deliver 4x4 Bckhoe $81,630.00 $81,630.00 $90,377.00 $90,377.00 $84,118.00 $84,118.00 NO BID NO BID Moses Lake Auto Wrecking No bid
w/extend-a-hoe Trade-in #2540 ($19,600) Trade-in #2540 ($23,000) Trade-in #2540 NO BID Trade-in #2540 $14,556.00
Trade-in #058 ($3,750) Trade-in #058 ($8,500) Trade-in #058 NO BID Trade-in #058 $3,056.00
Trade-ins may be considered Subtotal $58,280.00 Subtotal $58,877.00 Subtotal $84,118.00 Bid security: Yes
separately? No 7.90% $4,604.12 | Yes 8.30% $4,886.79 | ? 7.90% $6,645.32
Total $62,884.12 Total $63,763.79 Total $90,763.32 Ralph Johnson
Case 590SM John Deere 410J Terex TX870B Trade-in #2540 $15,700.00
Delivery: 120 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 90 days *No signed Proposal
Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions: Bid security: Yes
No hydraulic locking differentials 4 fwd/3 rev trans speed No Trade-in offers
No LED turn/signal lights No single lever controls 4 fwd/2 rev speeds Mark Cummins
24 mo. powertrain warranty 12 x 80 18 ply front tires 2 lever hydraulic control Trade-in #2540 $20,003.00
Provided option price sheet 16.9 x 30 10 ply rear tires - Terex Bid security: Yes
No aux power, no am/fm radio
No Whelen S360D strobe Vern Cummings
13'1" transport height Trade-in #2540 $15,500.00
No service warranty Bid security: Yes
Provided quote pages
3 1 Furnish and deliver 6x6 Motorgrader NO BID $230,198.00 $230,198.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID Moses Lake Auto Wrecking $281,644.74 $281,644.74
Trade-in #3660 ($65,000) Trade-in #3660 $46,556.00 Trade-in #3660 n/a
Subtotal $165,198.00 Bid security: Yes Subtotal $281,644.74
Trade-ins may be considered 8.30% $13,711.43 8.20% $23,094.87
Yes Total $178,909.43 Yes Total $304,739.61

separately?

John Deere 772D
Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions:
22Eframe articulation
26.9" sideshift
54.7 gpm main htd. pump

2008 Volvo G970

Exceptions: Specs exceed
35k weight
incl. 10" V-plow
210 hp engine




