
Micellaneous Equipment
Grant County Rowand Machinery Co. AG Enterprise Supply, Inc. Mid Mountain Machinery, Inc. Clyde/West Liberty Farm & Lawn Bids for trade-ins
Dept. of Public Works 1907 East James Street 17005 West SR 904 7916 W. Sunset Hwy 3107 E. Trent Ave. 731 F Street SE
Bid Opening:  1:45 P.M. Tuesday, February 5, 2008 Pasco, WA  99301 Cheney, WA  99004 Spokane, WA  99224 Spokane, WA  99202 Quincy, WA  98848

Item # Quantity Description

1 2 Furnish and deliver Dump Truck NO BID NO BID $18,990.00 $37,980.00 NO BID NO BID
Mid-Mount Wing Plow 7.90% $3,000.42

Total $40,980.42
Henke HDPW-10

Delivery: 90 days ARO
Exceptions: None

2 1 Furnish and deliver 8,000 lb. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Fork Lift

3 1 Furnish and deliver Rock Rake NO BID NO BID $5,225.00 $5,225.00 NO BID $7,165.00 $7,165.00
7.90% $412.78 7.90% $566.04
Total $5,637.78 Total $7,731.04

York HT York HT
Delivery: 30 days ARO Delivery: 4 weeks ARO

Exceptions: Exceptions: None
12'4" overall length
9'5" - 10' rake width
1081 lb operating weight

4 1 Furnish and deliver Self-Propelled $41,690.00 $41,690.00 NO BID $45,356.00 $45,356.00 $45,420.00 $45,420.00 NO BID Pete Carpenter
Power Broom Trade-in #079 -12000 Trade-in #079 -14000 Trade-in #079 -3000 Trade-in #079 4556

Subtotal $29,690.00 Subtotal $31,356.00 Subtotal $42,420.00
Trade-ins may be considered No 8.30% $2,464.27 No 7.90% $2,477.12 No 8.80% $3,732.96
separately? Total $32,154.27 Total $33,833.12 Total $46,152.96

Superior DT80J Waldon SM250 Broce RJ350
Delivery: 60 days ARO Delivery: 90 days ARO Delivery: 45 days ARO

Exceptions: Exceptions: Exceptions:
No quick disconnect hyd. lines 400 watt block heater 1000 watt block heater

25 mph travel speed 2.1 gpm sprinkler pump
3 stick hyd. controls Hyd. quick disconnect of blade option
No tilt steering wheel Dunlop tires
No battery disconnect 27 gal fuel tank
20 gal fuel tank

OPTIONS: OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
C &G gutter broom: $2,660.00 C &G gutter broom: n/a C &G gutter broom: #3,520.00
Safety eng. shutoff: $300.00 Safety eng. shutoff: included Safety eng. shutoff: $205.30

Susp. seat w/arm rest: $300.00 Susp. seat w/arm rest: included Susp. seat w/arm rest: $265.00
Work light group: $300.00 Work light group: included Work light group: $297.25

7.5' hyd. blade: $2,660.00 7.5' hyd. blade: $3,250.00 7.5' hyd. blade: $2,750.00

5 1 Furnish and deliver Herbicide NO BID $21,720.00 $21,720.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00
Skid Sprayer 8.20% $1,781.04 8.20% $0.00

Total $23,501.04 Total $0.00
AES300-4403

Delivery: 120 days ARO
Exceptions: None Exceptions:

OPTIONS:
24 gal tank pump: $4,200.00


