
Fuel Bid for 2008
Grant County CHS Inc. CHS inc. Coleman Oil Co. Inland Oil & Propane
Dept. of Public Works 1015 E Broadway P.O. Box 608 P.O. Box 1308 P.O. Box 1170
Bid Opening:  1:45 P.M. Tuesday, February 12, 2008 Moses Lake, WA  98837 Quincy, WA  98848 Lewiston, ID  83501 Ephrata, WA  98823

Item # Quantity Description Bid Margin Bid Margin Bid Margin Bid Margin

Estimated Furnish and deliver fuels at the 
Annual following locations:
Gallons

OPIS Rack Location: Moses Lake Moses Lake Spokane Moses Lake
OPIS Brand or All Brands Ave. Cenex Cenex All brands average 76

1 Hartline
9,500 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0892 No Bid $0.1679 $0.2979 
26,600 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0949 No Bid $0.1269 $0.3064 
4,900 HS No. 2 Red Dye Heating Fuel $0.0949 No Bid $0.1769 $0.3064 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 No Bid $0.1500 $0.1500 
2 Ephrata

84,700 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0707 $0.0600 $0.1310 $0.2286 
28,400 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0737 $0.0600 $0.1421 $0.2340 
1,000 HS No. 2 Red Dye Heating Fuel $0.0737 $0.0600 $0.1921 $0.2340 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 $0.1200 $0.1500 $0.1500 
3 Moses Lake

55,300 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0707 No Bid $0.1278 $0.2238 
44,700 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0737 No Bid $0.1383 $0.2283 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 No Bid $0.1500 $0.1500 
4 Quincy

23,600 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0792 $0.0600 $0.1876 $0.2870 
39,500 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0835 $0.0600 $0.1497 $0.2938 
3,600 HS No. 2 Red Dye Heating Fuel $0.0835 $0.0600 $0.1997 $0.2938 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 $0.1200 $0.1500 $0.1500 
5 Royal Slope

11,600 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0792 $0.0900 $0.1843 $0.3394 
24,000 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0835 $0.0900 $0.1959 $0.3466 
1,800 HS No. 2 Red Dye Heating Fuel $0.0835 $0.0900 $0.2459 $0.3466 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 $0.1200 $0.1500 $0.1500 
6 Mattawa

10,800 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0892 $0.1100 $0.1909 $0.3527 
5,600 ULS No. 2 Red Dye Diesel Fuel $0.0949 $0.1100 $0.2035 $0.3620 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 $0.1200 $0.1500 $0.1500 
7 Solid Waste Landfill

5,800 Unleaded Regular Gasoline $0.0707 $0.0600 $0.1810 $0.2786 
33,700 ULS No. 2 Clear Diesel Fuel $0.0737 $0.0600 $0.1921 $0.2840 

Winterizing premium $0.0800 $0.1200 $0.1500 $0.1500 


